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MILITANT LEADER FtMED SLAIN
FARM HOLIDAY 
AM WILL 
BE PEACEFUL

GOVERNORS MEETING 
IN SIOUX CITY 
ON SITUATION

BT A. D. UTBPFBRUD 
(A^orliUrd Prrw 8t«tf WViter)
Sioux City, It., Sept. 8 (/P)— 

Assurtncee of FarmerB Holiday 
leaders that violence was ended 
In their battle for higher prices 
came today as mid-western gov-1 
ernors or their representative? ' 
gathered here for a conference to 
work out a program of agricultur-
al relief.

Governor Warren B. Green of 
South Dakbta who called the con-
ference, arrived here today with 
ittonMHf General M. Q. Sharpe to 
lay final plana for tomorrow's 
meeting.

In a statement Issued upon his 
arrival, Governor Green said the 
conference would sei^e as a clear-
ing house for Ideas of the execu-
tives and farm leaders. ’ r.

Milo Reno of Dee Moines, presi-
dent of the National Farm Holi-
day association, will not be pres-
ent. He was In Oklahoma today 
attending an organisation meeting 
of the association in that state.
Reno, in a speech at Oklahoma 

City declared that disturbances 
Incidental to early strike activities 
about Sioux City, Council Bluffs 
and Des Moines "are over now."

Fwkoe Is Promised
He said that already the holi-

day Idea has been succesaful in 
that the "main part of Its pur-
pose has been accompllshxni."
• "The public conscience has 
been awakened to the conditions 
of the farmers of the nation," 
Reno said. Referring to the dis-
turbances he s&ld: "It is natural 
that in any movement like this 
there will be - epme Recurrences 
that do not-hdvf^llrsr'Miictlon of 
the leaders,’•

Simultaneously with Jteno’s 
prediction that there would be no 
further disturbances came assur-
ances to Gov. Floyd B. Olson of 
Minnesota by holiday leader 
that. If the strike la called In Min-
nesota, "It will be an endeavor to 
keep products off markets through 
persuasion and not through vio-
lence."

E. M. Sanson of Valley, Neb., 
representing holiday adherents 
who had been picketing roads 
leading Into Omaha, announeed 
that the picketing was ended per-
manently as far as the holiday or-
ganization is concerned. A seven 
day truce in picketing actlvltlea 
there was to end officially tonght..
The Wisconsin Farm Bureau 

Federation announced an outright 
stand against the Wisconsin Holi-
day association by advising all 
farmers to refrain from taking 
any part in the movement. Its an-
nouncement declared that the 
movement "can not bring about 
a general increase in prices for 
farm products when so many con-
sumers can not buy at present 
price levels."

Child Falls Into .w„ 
Creek And Droyins

Holt, Sept. 8. (/P)—Gray don 
Rees, 21 months old, drowned 
Thursday In a creek on the family 
farm* near here. He fell Into the 
water while playing with a 4- 
year-old brother.

MILUON VOTERS 
CAN’T BE WRONG DEMO CHIEFS 

OF NEW YORK 
DISCUSS CASE

More than a million Mexicans 
can't be wrong, so Senorlta 
Ofella Larrlva, above, has 
been named queen t6t the 28th 
anniversary of Torreon. Her 
votes ran more than a million 
above her nearest rival's.

V1 . ,. .

THREE LEADERS ON 
SAME TRAIN TO 

ALBANY
By ROB«RT~8T. JOHN 

(Ahsoelntod Prow, HiafI Writer) 
New York, Sept. 8 (^P)-—A possi-

bility that the political fate 6t 
James 4- Walker will bo decided 
within the next 24 hours was seen 
anight, as three of the five Dem- 
iiratlc city organization leaden 
leaded for Albany together.
The power of deciding whethei 

.Valker, who resigned as mayo, 
ast week, will bo the organization 
andldaje at the next election is in 
:belr hands.
John F. Curry, Tammany leader, 

has indicated there will be no for-
mal announcement of the decision 
for-about a.month.
The Issue may bo threshed out, 

howertr, aa they Journey north-
ward, and after they get to Albany.

Private Conferences 
The state committee meeting 

they are going to attend has been 
called merely to set a time and 
place for the state convention, but 
he tangled New York political sit-
uation may come up for discus-
sion in private conferences.
The organization leaders, who 

have formally pledged their sup-
port to the Roosevelt-Garner ticket 
face the questions of how actively 
'bey will pkrtlclpate in the presi-
dential campaign; . whether they 
will support Ljeut Gov. Herbert H. 
Lehman, Governor Roosevelt’s 
choice for the gubernatorial nom 
Inatlon, or some other candidate, 
and what stand they will take In 
the mayoralty situation.
John H. McCooey, Brooklyn lead 

er, who Is one of the three travel-
ing together,, yesterday vlsIfiMOjW

Justice Potter Is 
Hit By Automobile

Lansing, Mich., Bept. 8. (/P)— 
Justice William W. Potter, of the 
Michigan supreme court, tonight 
wu recovering in the fit. Law-
rence hospital from injuries suf-
fered when he walked Into the 
path of an automobile thli morn-
ing driven by Walter M. Lang- 
knecht, a traveling salesman of 
Chicago. v >,
Justice Potter sustained a slight 

laceration of the head. • X-ray 
photographs at the hospital re-
vealed no broken bones or other 
Injuries. Attendants said the Jus-
tice’s condition was "good'* but 
that he will remain in the hospi-
tal temporarily.
Langknecht was released by 

police after, witnesses reported hb 
was driving carefully. ' 

Justice Potter is 63 years old. 
He was appointed to the bench by 
’ormer Governor Fred W. Green.

Iiiquest Fails to Find 
Motive for Suicide of 
Jean Harlow’s Husband

WELSHTELLS 
MS TAX PLAN

Suggests State Retain 
Entire Gasoline Levy 
C Receipts

Detroit, Sapt. 8 (/P)—George W.
Welsh, candidate for the Republl-. 
can nomination for governor, told 
a radio audience tonight that re-
tention by the state of the entire 
gasoline tax would permit aboli- 
tfon of the state property tax and 
save many thousands of dollars td 
the state, the counties and the
townships In bookkeeping. , y . axm

"It would be a step from com- -lonal headquarter^ for the first 
•xlty to simplicity," he said 'ime. After he left it was announc-

WEATHER

LOWER LAKES: Gentle to 
moderate northwest winds, be-
coming gentle variable Friday; 
fair Friday.
UPPER LAKES: Gentle shift-

ing winds on Huron, and gentle to 
moderate southerly on Superior 
and Michigan, becoming fresh Fri-
day on western Superior; general-
ly fair Friday, except unsettled 
extreme western Superior In aftr 
ernoon. Small craft warning In-
dicated north shore Superior Du-
luth to Grand Marais daybreak 
Friday.
LOWER MICHIGAN Fair Fri-

day, warmer, except In extreme 
northeast portion; Saturday prob-
ably showers, cooler in extreme 
west portion by night
UPPER MICHIGAN: Generally 

fair Friday, somewhat warmer; 
showers and cooler Saturday.

At High Iasi 
8 P.M. 84 Bonn 

ESCANABA M 81 
Temperatures—Yesterday 

Alpena —— 80 Marquette — 84
Boston__ 1 <2 Memphis 72
Buffalo___ 74 Milwaukee -74
Calgary___60 Montreal — 68
Chicago---72 Nfcw Orleans 84
Cincinnati_72 New York — 68
Cleveland — 70 Port Arthur- 84
Denver---86 Qu'tppelle . .86
Detroit _— 79 St. Louis__78
Duluth -— 80 St. Paul__- 82
Evansville — 74 Salt Lake — 86
Galveston — 80 Frisco___ 84
Grand Rapids 78 Soo, Mich. — 18
Jacksqnvll)*. 82 Tampa___ 90
Kansas Glty. 80 Washington. 78 
Los Anisias. 80 White River. 74

plexlty
"It would be a stride toward hoim 
rule and elimination of ktato in 
terference in county affairs. "

"By eliminating the necessity 
for collecting the state tax and 
handling tax deficiencies, the cost 
of conducting the auditor gener-
al’s office would be reduced 60 
percent. The savings in handling 
state funds would extend down 
the line through the 83 county 
treasurers and those of 1200 
townships.

"It would eliminate the state 
tax commission and its 8131,000 
annual expense and eliminate the 
necessity for state equalization of 
values, shot through with politics 
and favoritism. Each county 
could fix Us own valuations ac- 
cordihg to its own needs."
At present, he explained, the 

approximately 320,000,000 state 
tax Is being returned to the coun-
ties. That amount, he said, If 
economlcayy administered, would 
take the place of the propehy tax 
now paid by the counties to the 
state. '• ^ • • •' ’

"The tax load on farms, homes 
and factories would be reduced 
38.60 a thousand," he said, "and 
the state would be In a position 
to ask a like reduction in utility 
ratea.

"It may be possible that the 
people are not ready yet for real 
tax reduction. It may be they do 
not realize the crisis. But If they 
do demand real tax relief they can 
get it." -■H

Aged Man Falls 
Down Stairs, Dies

Lake Odessa, Sept. 8. —An-
thony Ritter, 78, was found dead 
Thursday at the foot of the cellar 
stairs in his home. Relatives said 
they believed he had become con-
fused and walked through the 
cellar door during the night. His 
skull was fractured. '

MUCKER HIT - 
BY COMSTOCK

Any of Three Democrats 
Capable, Candidate 

Declares

?d he had agreed to participate act 
vely In the national campaign.
The other two. John Theofel 

Jueens leader, and David S. Bendt 
Richmond leader, like Curry have 
held no conferences with the Ro& 
sevelt-Gamer forces. • <'
When James A. Farley, nation-

al and state chairman, heard the 
organization group was traveling 
together, he changed his reserva-
tions so as to be on the same train. 
Curry, McCoey, and Bendt had a 
private car.;.. \ - ;•; > v;.• 
Meantime, Joseph V. McKee, who 

succeeded Walker as mayor, and 
tvho is not a Tammany member 
like his predeceesor, continued to 
attack the city’s financial prob-
lems and to ignore politics.
< The’. Sun said the drastic econ-
omy measures he has Instituted in 
his- few days as mayor "have be-
come a matter of grave concern to 
Tammany Hall." ‘ . P
While Curry and Farley were 

meeting at a railroad station for 
the first time since the Chicago

(WooMnned on Pane Two) -

FOUR KILLED AS 
TRAIN HITS GAR

Another Child Believed 
Fatally Injured in 

Collision

Grand Rapids, Mich., Sept. 8 (/P) 
—-William A. Comstock, candi-
date for the Democratic nomina-
tion for governor, in a speech 
here tonight described his two op-
ponents as "able" and declared 
that .it makes "little difference" 
which of the three Democrats Is 
nominated. ...
"The vital thing is to end the 

Republican regime and save Mich-
igan from ruin," he said. "If an-
other Democratic nominee is 
chosen, I will work Just as hard, 
or harder, for him as 1 would for 
myself, "j - '•* *
ComsfOck declared the state 

needs a ’ governor with courage 
»nd ability to "clean house from 
top to bottom." He added that 
It will be a thankless task "for 
eny man who goes In to wipe out 
th« 3ly.OOd.OOO deficit the Re-
publicans have banded us. Who-
ever accomplishes this," he con-
tinued, "will go out of office ac-
companied by criticism for parsi-
mony."
The Democrat criticized Gover-

nor Brucker for what he termed a 
"nonchalant attitude” toward un-
employment. "When a govern 
ment gets so hard-hearted It can-
not see want and rsfuses'to admit 
relief is a*function of government, 
it is time to change that govern-
ment,’’ he said. Relief, he said, 
must come through Jobs, not char-
ity, and "the attack on depression 
must coma through restoration of 
buying power to the workman and 
farmer, not by helping big busi-
ness.’,' .
Comstock promised, if elected, 

"I won't crown cherry queens and 
dedicate chicken coops about the 
state. I will stick to the Job at 
Lansing." ’ .

Wysocki And Sams 
Ordered To Trial

• ■- ■ O, .
Detroit, Sept. 8. (/Pj^Brought 

to recorders court for e^amlna- 
tlpn on a murder chgrge, Alex 
Wysocki, meat market owner, and 
Ira Sams, co-defendant, were or-
dered held for trial today in'eon- 
nectlon with the shooting to death 
May 28 of Mrs. Wysocki. The 
state charges Wysocki paid Sams 
4500 to shoot Mrs. Wysocki in a 
faked holdup attempt.

Los Angeles, Sept. 8 (/P)—The 
•ecret behind the suicide of Paul 
Bern, husband of Jean Harlow of 
the screen, remained unrevealed 
tonight after a coroner's Jury had 
sifted the testimony of friends, 
professional associates and ser-
vants.
> The motive, the verdict read, 
was undetermined.

There was testimony from Au-
topsy Surgeon Frank Webb that 
Bern, while free from disease, suf-
fered, from a "condition likely to 
produce melancholia," and others 
testified the motion picture ex-
ecutive was subject to attacks of 
gloom and often discussed suicide.

Funeral Rites Today 
, As arrangements wont ahead 
for private funeral services to-
morrow afternoon, authorities 
still actively puzzled as to why 
Bern died from a self Inflicted 
bullet wound at ths picturesque 
canyon home he gave his bride at 
their wedding last July 2, said 
they were considering the theory 
that a previous marriage or com-
mon law union may have contrib-
uted to his tragic decision.

Spsculation remained as to the 
identity and whereabouts of the 
"red-haired woman" whose exist-
ence as a figure in Bern's past

LAY PLANS FOR 
PUBLICWORKS

Relief Program Will Be 
Made Public By 

Hoover Soon
Washington, Sept. 8 (^—For-

mal anounceraent of the huge 
public bulldipgs program prnvld- 
td in the Garaer-Wagrfhr relief 
act will be made by President 
Hoover wifhin a few days. V 

Treasury officials are busy 
completing details of the pro-
gram. slashed from 3100,000,000 
to 390,000,000 under Comptroller 
General • McCarl’s interpretatibn 
of the economy act, however, they 
considered today asking for a 
new decision to permit the use 
of the entire amount by cutting 
only the. limit of cost on Indi-
vidual projects by ten per cent, 
permitting the money saved to 
go toward other works.
; At the comptroller’s office it 
was said reconsideration of the 
decision probably would be given 
In view of the treasury’s opinion 
that congress Intended the entire 
3100,000,000 to be expended to 
Increase employment.

Secretary Mills said announce-
ment of the detailed program 
rested with President Hoover. Ho 
declined to say whether he had 
certified to the president that 
the Undertaking was too large 
for the treasury at this time. 
This is an. -alternative allowed 
him by the relief act. . - 

While" McCarl’s ruling applied 
only to the 3100,000,000 public 
building program, Mills said he 
was advised that the same ruling 
would apply for the entire 3322,- 
000,000 public works section of 
the relief act. This would slash 
332,200,000 off the building 
roads, flood;;control and other 
projects included in the whole 
program.

DetroWs Welfare 
Duties Decreased

Find Irregularities 
In Registrations

Pontiac, Sept. 8 (ff)—City Man-
ager William B. Schmurl Thurs-
day declared that an investigation 
of 24 of the city’s 29 precincts 
had revealed 1,034 Irregularities 
In registrations. The remaining 
precincts will be checked by ad-
ministration employes.

Find Huge Bone Of 
Prehistoric Animal
Mt. Clemens, Sept. 8. <JP)— 

Found in a marsh near here, a 
huge Jawbone has been identified 
as that of a prehistoric mastodon. 
The bone Is two feet .In length, 
and weighs nearly 60 pounds.

Unidentified Body 
Removed from Lake
Ludlngton, Sept. 8. (/p)—Be-

lieved to be that df some lake 
sailor lost several months ago, an 
Identified body was taken from 
Lake Michigan off Little Point 
Sable Thursday by the crew of 
the steamer Col. B. M. Young, of 

ttiJlH.,. i,

Hudson, Mich., Sept. 3. </P)—
Four children are dead and an- Detroit, Sept. 8. (JP)—Declaring 
other believed fatally Injured as that increased industrial activity

in Detroit is enabling, the city 
welfare department to keep its 
load at a comparatively low level, 
John F. Ballenger, welfare super-
intendent Thursday said that 21,- 
109 families now are on the city’s 
list, one of the lowest 
reached this year.

the result of an automobile acci-
dent a half mile south of Hudson 
shortly after 4 o’clock this after-
noon. '■''.’"■‘i/ •v.-'--' ^ / ■'

Three were Instantly killed and 
a fourth died In the ’Hudson hos-
pital a few moments after admit-
tance.
The dead are:
Rita Marry, 16, driver of the 

car; her brother Peter, 13; Mary*, 
a sister, 9; and Robert Heinbeck- 
er, 7, of Detroit, who is a grand-
son of Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Mar-
ry, parents of the children killed. 
He was visiting the Marry farm 
and attending school;-"'
Mary Jane Young, 7-year-old 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Young, residing near Hudson, is 
in the Hudson hospital and in a 
critical condition and not expect-
ed to live.
The children attend the Sacred 

Heart school at Hudson and were 
enroute home when the accident 
occurred. The automobile was 
struck squarely by a northbound 
Cincinnati Northern railroad gas-
oline propelled passenger train. 
The automobile was completely 
demolished.

Authorities plan an Investiga-
tion.

Farmer Kicked By 
Horse Monday Dies
Kalamazoo, Sept,. 8. (/p)—Kick-

ed by a horse Mbnday, John Olds, 
70-yearH)ld farm hand, died here

41 i iliiii iOiiilifti1

has been revealed by Bern’s 
brother, Henry, and his secretary, 
Irene Harrison. Both pfomlsed 
statements later.

George darken, Los Angeles 
Insurance man, said at Colorado 
Springs today that Bern was mar-
ried ten years ago to a woman 
now confined In a New York sani-
tarium for ths mentally incompe-
tent, and that he had placed a 
large sum with a New York trust 
company for her benefit. So far 
as he knew, darken was quoted 
as saying, Bern and the women 
were never divorced.
From New York came a report 

that Attorney Henry Uttal had 
said ho had on file In hls office a 
will signed by Bern August 30, 
1920, leaving virtually all hls 
estate to "my wife, Dorothy MU- 
lette."

In Los Angeles Attorney Oscar 
Cummins said Bern had made a 
will since hls marriage to Miss 
Har’.ow, but the lawyer refused to 
discuss it except to say that It 
was drafted and signed "very re-
cently."
The Los Angeles Examiner said 

that from other sources It had 
learned the now will left Bern’s 
estate to Miss Harlow.

Crowd Disappointed
Miss Harlow, certified by her 

physician to be in a state of nerv-
ous collapse, did not appear at the 
inquest. .
A largo throng was disappoint-

ed. but listened eagerly as the 
witnesses described Bern as a man 
beloved in the motion picture 
world, a highly nervoys man who 
let trifles worry him, who appear-
ed completely happy in hls home, 
but who sometimes spoke so 
morosely that his negro chauffeur 
sought to cheer him and convince 
him life wasn't hard, after all:'
He was a man, testified the au-

topsy surgeon, who "might have 
been suffering from a nervous 
complex, which > could,, espi^fnlfr 
after marriage, have created a 
disturbing condition, causing 
moroseness and melancholia."

All the witnesses denied they 
knew of any difficulty between 
Bern and hls wife.

Further mystery was added to 
the search for a motive when 
Bern’s brother, after a conference 
with studio officials which lasted 
the better part of a day, said:

"Certain complications which 
have come to my attention make 
it impossible for me to give out a 
statement. Please don’t ask me 
what these complications are. 
Let’s just say that when they have 
been straightened out I will tell 
all.”

He ignored all other questions.
An attorney for Bern said later 

an investigation would be made 
into reports of "another woman" 
in the film executive’s life.

Relatives indicated Miss Har-
low would attend the funeral

(Continned on Page Two)

Durant Plant Will 
Be Auctioned Today
Lansing, Mich., Sept. 8 (/P)— 

The huge plant here of the Dur-
ant Motors company, once the 
scene of a buiy Industry, will go 
on the auction block tomorrow on 
the order of the federal court.
As the time of the public sale 

approached, there were reports 
that at least five Important In-
dustrial institutions will submit 
bids. Another report said that 
William C. Durant, one time rul-
er of the plant and its products, 
will make an effort lo repurchase 
It.
The sale of the plant must be 

approved by the federal court In 
Detroit. A certified check for 
3100,000 to bind the deal must 
be given by the successful bidder.

COL R. ROBINS 
DID NOT KEEP 
HOOVER DATE

BOOTLEGGERS MADE 
THREATS, SAYS 

HIS WIFE

CONSERVATION 
GROUP MEETS

Plan to Strengthen Law 
Enforcement in Up-

per Peninsula

Ishpemlng, Mich., Sept. 8 [IF)— 
Decision to strengthen the law en-
forcement end of state conserva-
tion activities, especially In the 
upper peninsula, was reached here 
today by the Michigan conserva-
tion commission, holding its Sep-
tember meeting in the Mather 
Inn.
No definite plans were an-

nounced by the commissioners at 
the conclusion of thoir discussion, 
but it was stated emphatically 
that "law enforcement will be 
stressed a groat deal more than 
It has been” and It was Intimated 
that there would be a shakeup In 
the personnel of the law enforce-
ment division, with the replace-
ment of officers whose records 
have not been satisfactory, rather 
than any Increase In the force.

It Is expected that action will

Youthful Bandit 
Sought By Police

- Detroit, Sept. 8. </P)—Police 
are seeking a youthful bandit/18, 
to 20 years old, who Thursday 
held up a branch office of the 
Westerii Union Telegraph com-
pany, taking 319 from the clerk. 
They said he answered the des-
cription of a bandit who recently 

polntir obtained 319 in a holdup of an-
other telegraph office.

carry n?rLthfcfpmjnksJon*ii desfrea 
and that definite annooncemsnttfc 
what is to be done will be'made 
from his office after hls return to 
Lansing.

Before coming to Ishpemtng 
ths commissioners visited the Ot 
ter river trout rearing station, 
now under construction In the 
copper country. Trout will be 
raised at this station for planting 
In Houghton and Keweenaw coun-
ties and the station will be ready 
for use late this fall. Plans also 
havs been made to protect the 
grayling that still remain In the 
Otter and at the new station ex-
periments in hatching and raising 
grayling will be carried on.

Waterway Project 
Rapped At Parley

Washington. Bept. 8 (A3)—The 
strange disappearance of , Col. 
Raymond Robins, outspoken pro-
hibitionist, since he agreed last 
week In New York to see Presi-
dent Hoover hero Tuesday, waa 
disclosed today at the White 
House and concern for his safety 
deepened when Mrs. Robins in 
Maine expressed fear her hus-
band had been killed by "Florida 
bootleggers."

Shortly after White House offi-
cials expressed concern •— even 
President Hoover—at the failure 
of efforts to locate Colonel Rob-
ins, the wife of the social econom-
ist and prominent prohibitionist 
telephone the Associated Press 
here from Maine that he had re-
ceived numerous threats ot 
death unless he atopped hls pro-
hibition efforts.

. Failed To Appear 
A dose friend of President 

Hoover, Colonel Robins had ac-
cepted an invitation to call on 
the chief executive at the White 
House on Tuesday when he plan-
ned to come here from New York.
The Invitation was extended 

through Walter H. Newton, one 
of the president’s secretaries, who 
telephoned Robins at the City 
Club in New York from the White 
House on Friday.
When Robins failed to keep hls 

engagement Tuesday the White 
House began making inquiries.

Federal investigators were 
placed on the case, but thus far 
have reported ho tangible ,re-

be taken soon by George R. Ho- ^ Tho Jn , u ptiJfe^nK 
garth, director of conaervatJon U) ^etly *4 New ,, YorH police

Jean’s Love Tragedy
Actress Was Teased by School Chyms for 

“Boyless” Childhood

(EDITOR’S NOTE: This is the 
second of four stories on the life 
of Jean Harlow, the famous plat-
inum blond of the movies—first 
married at 10—whose second ro-
mance has just been ended by the 
suiddte of her husband, Paul 
Bern, motion picture executive.)

• * a
By NEA Service 
A blue-eyed girl with wavy hair 

the color of white gold stared re- 
beiliously at a low table on which 
were displayed dozens of flat- 
heeled shoes, then twirling defi-
antly, stalked away on the French 
heels of her own dainty slippers.

It happened six years ago In 
one of the small parlors at Ferry 
Hall, an aristocratic old school 
for girls in Lake Forest, Chica-
go’s most exclusive suburb.

... Scl?°°l hMJUBt
invents wvn uvtfli miuiuuu*

ed, one at a time, lnto_ the im 
promptu shoe salon where, under 
the sharp eye of the head mistress 
they were being fitted to the heel- 
less, "sensible" shoes they were 
required to wear.

The head mistress stared after 
the retreating girl, angry, • per-
plexed. Her ears still rang with 
the latter's reckless, "I won! 
wear such hideous shoes; I’ll go 
home first." During all the years 
of her head mistressing, she had 
never encountered such rebellion. 
Yet It is an Interesting commen- 
Ury that, for the rest of ’the 
school year, the girl went around 
in her own high-heeled slippers.

That girl, as you ihay have 
guessed, was Jean Harlow, the 
screen's origins! platinum blond 
whose first romance.ended in a di-
1 Ifi^dTSTSS *#.,

RANGERS WILL 
PROBE DEATHS

Fatal Shooting of Two 
Boys in Texas Will 
Be Investigated

San Marcos, Tex., Sept. 8 (IP)— 
Texas Rangers were called to-
night to Investigate the fatal 
shooting of Arthur Morton, 16, 
and Harry Morton, 14, sons of a 
wealthy farmer, at their summer 
home ten miles north of San Mar-
cos after a justice of the peace de-
cided the youths met death acci-
dentally.

Unsatisfied by the verdict of 
the - Justice, A. M. Ramsay, the 
San Marcos News asked ^AdJ. 
Gen. W. W. Sterling to send the 
Rangers. F. W. Faris, manager df 
the News, said Sterling promised 
to do so.:
The double shooting was dis-

covered this morning. Harry was 
found mortally wounded on the 
ground about 26 yards from the 
building in which, they had been 
sleeping. Suffering from three 
bullet wounds, he was rushed to a 
hospital, but died ten minutes 
after arrival there.
The body of Arthur, the elder 

brother, was In a sleeping room 
with a bullet wound In the head. 
A pistol with four cartridges dis-
charged lay nearby. Both boys 
were clad lh night clothing.
The boys were the sons of Mr. 

and Mrs. Arthur Hunter Morton 
of San Antonio. They were high 
school students, and had been 
spending their summer at the 
home near San Marcos.

Their sleeping quarters were 
about 76 yards from the 3300,- 
000 Morton summer home, which 
is on a 6,500-acre raneh.
The long screened sleeping 

porch In which Arthur’s body was 
found was splotched in places 
with blood.

. Investigators found a sheathed 
hand axe in the room.' Its case 
was blood-Stained and had been 
cut in one place. Three bullet 
boles wire touod. in the screao 
hbove a «ot on the porch.

Baltimore, Sept. 8 (/P)—Recom-
mendations against the proposed 
Great Lakes-St. Lawrence water-
way project as an "uneconomic 
expenditure of vast proportions” 
was made today by representa-
tives of five north Atlantic ports 
at a conference heie today.

After an all-day discussion of 
the phases of the projected water-
way which is the subject of a 
treaty between the United States 
and Canada awaiting ratification 
by congress and the Canadian 
parliament, the representatives 
announced a statement of their 
conference.

They said that "unanimously 
opposed confirmation of the treaty 
as leading to an uneconomic ex-
penditure of vast proportions, the 
feasibility and practicability of 
which are unproved and which 
would place a burden of debt and 
taxation upon the American peo-
ple not Justified at this time by 
any possible benefits accruing.”

Car Driver Is Held 
For Manslaughter

Detroit, Sept. 8. (JP)—Russell 
Lock is held here for trial on a 
charge of Involuntary manslaugh-
ter, following a charge that he 
was the driver of an automobile 
that struck and fatally injured 3- 
year-old Viola McCall on August 
31. • 'v. v-

also working'on the case'
Chief W. H. MotmuoUW se-

cret service said tonight he had 
been requested to make "certain 
Inquiries” and these had been 
made "without result."

"This concludes our part of thf 
matter unless we are requested 
to make an investigation," Chief 
Moran said.
He added that "friends" of 

Colonel Robins had asked that 
the Inquiries be made.

Secretary Newton, In disclosing 
Robins' disappearance, said: 
■■Robins has been a warm 
friend of mine for 20 years and 
is a personal friend of the presi-
dent
■"Last Friday I talked with him 
by telephone In New York, and 
when I found he was coming to 
the capital on Tuesday, I made 
an engagement for him to talk 
with Mr. Hoover.
■He did not appear on Tues-

day or communicate with us. Yes-
terday I became concerned.
"By telephone Inquiries I 

found out that he had checked 
out of the City Club in New York 
last Saturday afternoon and that 
they didn’t know where he was 
except that hls forwarding ad-
dress was the Dodge hotel in 
Washington.
■"I feared that he might have 
been taken sick or affected by the 
heat. Since that time we have 
been able to find no trace of him 
and do not know where he Is 
now."

Wife Is Alarmed 
At the Dodgo hotel here it was 

said Robins had no reservation 
and had not been there.

Mrs. Robins telephoned the As-

Son Born Thursday 
\To Green’s Daughter

Detroit, Sept. 8. (/P)—A nihe 
pound son was bom Thursday to 
Peggy Green Bradley, daughter of 
former Governor Fred W. Green 
and wife of Glenn A. Bradley. 
Both mother and child were re-
ported "doing nicely." Mrs. Brad-
ley has a four year old daughter 
by a previous marriage to Norval 
Tyrrell.

Fruit Growers Are 
Pleased With Mart
Benton Harbor, Bept. 8. </P)— 

Western Michigan fruit growers 
are optimistic over the increase 
in volume of fruit at the local 
market. Wednesday's market 
brought out 104,840 packages of 
all varieties of fruit, which sold 
it generally higher prices Umb ib

(Continued on Page

Tom Mix and Former 
Wife Settle Dispute
Los Angeles, Sept. 8. (/P)—The 

troubles of Tom Mix, cowboy film 
star, and hls former wife, over the 
custody of their ten-year-old 
daughter, Thomaslna, were Ironed 
out today by an unexpected agree-
ment in the midst of court pro-
ceedings.

Shortly after Superior Judge 
Clement Shinn had taken the 
child into his charabers for a "pri-
vate talk," attorneys for the cou-
ple said an agreement had been 
reached by which each would 
share custody of Thomaslna.
The mother, now married to 

Manuel de Olazabal, Argentine 
consul of San Francisco, and fath-
er agreed that Mix shall have cus-
tody of the child for two conse-
cutive months each summer and 
on alternate holidays, the mother 
caring for her at other times and 
placing her in a day school.

Alpena Man Sought 
In Shooting Case

Detroit, Sept. 8. (IP)—Carl 
Walker, 20, of Alpena, Michels 
sought by officials tmm 
the ahoottniTWenesday 
Mrs. John B. Jackson, 
mother-in-la#, kt her 
home. Police said the 
shot foiltfvinf an unsu 
tempt by Welker to bff
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OPPOSE EXCISE 
TAXON AUTOS

Industry Will Demand 
Congress Substitute 

Sales Levy
Detroit, Sept. 8 (/P) — The

hoard of governor* of the Na-
tional Automobile Chamber/;jof 
Commerce, meetlni; here 'today, 
miffliiiKd Its opnoaltlon to taxes 
levied uKalnst the automobile In-
dustry. and Alvan Maoauley, prea- 
Idiot. Mild that bis organization 
would demand of congrtM the 
ruhstitutlon of a general manu- 
fnvturors tax for the present eya- 
tem of excise laxes-iff^pLIpBlI

‘The present aft.'* Macauler 
i aid. "Imposes a heavy penalty 
not only upon employment*In u 
yreat basic Industry, but upon all 
v. ho operate the 25,000,000 cars, 
trurkh and btlies now running 
over our highways." •

Declaring that a system of tax- 
. atlon whlrh ‘'singles out partlcu- 

tat roups to bear more than 
their share of the tax load" cur-
tails buying power, affects em-
ployment and curtails needed tax 
revenues. Macauley said tliat 
"what* ver new taxes are uecea 
i ary should be general In charac 
ter and should fall on all alike." 

t'hapin (iraiitral l<envu
"Thus far," ho said, "the most 

equitable levy which has been 
proposed Is that If a manufac-
turers tax which would spread 
tiiv burden "yer all productive 
enterprise without dlscr|mltiatlug 
against any.

"It wopld be noted, however, 
that this levy Is not advocated ns 
an addition to the present tax 
rburden. but as a substitute for 
the present unfair excise taxes." 
he continued. "The chamber’s 
position will be placed before 
members of congress, Industry 
and the public generally, and an 
urgent appeal made to the law-
makers to rectify the Injustice 
imposed in the present act at 
the earliest opportunity.” -
An indefinite leave of absence 

was voted Roy D. Chapin, a mem-
ber of the board, and wishes,for 
his success In his new duties as 
secretary of commerce were dis-
patched him.
The directors approved furth-

er conferences by a special com-
mittee with the eastern confer-
ence of motor vehicle commis-
sioners 6n the designing of auto-
mobiles for increased safety. 
Further research with the Amer-
ican Petroleum Institute, the So-
ciety of Automotive Knglneers 
and the United States Bureau of 
Standards on improved njolor 
vehlolh ffiels was authorized. J

Berrien County /s 
Permitted Issuance 
Of Refunding Bonds
Lansing. Mich. Sept. X. (ff*)— 

The first major covert road re-
funding project under : the new' 
laws enacted by the recent special 

1 session of tho legislature was an 
thorlzed today when the state 
public debt commission approved 
the issuance of $3,432,400 of re-
funding bonds by Berrien county.

According to Howard Lawrence 
stale treasurer, the Berrien hoard 
of supervisors and John Bateman, 
consulting engineer, have worked 
out a plan which may fit other 
counties distressed by covert ob-
ligations such as Macomb, Oak-
land and Monroe. The refunding 
issues will mature In such a man-
ner as to extend outstanding 
county at large and township co-
vert obligations five years. Addi-
tional funds to bn‘received by the 
county starting In 1933 under the 
Horton Act apportioning all the 
weight tax back to the counties 
will be used In Berrien to meet 
payments and reduce taxes. The 
plan contemplates a decrease In 
taxes in the county of $1,540,980 
over the five year period, virtual 
elimination of county covert taxes 
and limitation of township covert 
taxes to interest. It Is estimated 
Berrien county will receive about 
$150,000 annually under the pew! 
welkin tax distribution. /■ ;'

Half of Australia's population 
of i;,350,000 lives In capital (il- 
ties and a further 15 per cent in 
provincial towns. The remain fog 
35 .per cent provides more than 
half the produce of the common- 
woa ith. ,

Bits of Cheer 
in Business

Grand Rapids, Mich., Sept. 8 
l/P) -The I’ere Marquette railway 
announced tonight that 600 for-
mer employes will b<- called buck 
to work In the Wyoming shops 
here thin week. The men will 
be employed virtually at full 
time.
. New York. "sopT. 8 (/^ - Offi-
cials of tho Celaneie corporation 
of America announced today that 
approximately 1,000 men have 
been added to full time/work at 
Its Cumberland, Aia., plant h**' 
cause of an Increase In demand 
for yarm and fabrics.

Chicago. Sept. 8 (/P)—A new 
high price, for 1932 was set to-
day when a Chicago slock ex- 
change seat waa sold for 97,BOO. 
The amount was 91<600 more 
than the previous high for the 
year.

New York, Sept. 8 (ff)—Brad- 
strset's Index for wholesale food 
prices for the week ended 8ept. 
6 showed an increase of two 
cents to 91.79.’ The index.for the 
previous week was 91.77.

Youngstown, O., 8ept. 8 (ff)— 
Steel production here has moved 
up to about 20 per cent of ca< 
parity, as compared with a rate 
of about 18 per cent at tho be-
ginning of the week. The Re-
public Steel corporation has in- 
ciTiisi'd Its Ingot production eight 
por cent. 5$ V

New York, Sept. 8 (/P)—Gener-
al Motors corporation reported to- 
.lav that its August sales were' 
nearly 500 units over the July 
sales, although the August figure 
was considerably below that of a 
year ago.

New York. Sept. 8 (/P)—Thu 
federal reserve bank reported to-
day a gain of $5,026,000 In the 
nation’s monetary gold stocks, re-
sulting from a net decrease of a 
corresponding amount In the -to-
tal of gold held for foreign ac-
counts.

New York, Sept. 8 (/P)—Dow, 
Jones and Company reported to-
day that a noticeable Increase In 
wiles during August was experi-
enced by the office appliance In-
dustry as compared with July.

Chicago, Sept. 8 (jP)--The com-
monwealth Edison company de-
clared that although tho electric 
output In the Chicago area !a 
running below that of a year ago, 
a definite Improvement has been 
noticed in the last three weeks 
and ibis week's output compares 
better with that of tho corres-
ponding we.-k last year than any 
other week sl^ce April. ^ (

^Chicago. Sept. 8 (/P)—The l.or- 
oMf Knitting MlHs today announc-
ed a to per cent increase In Its 
working force and resumption of 
a 24-hour production schedule.'.

, Denver. Sept. 8 (/P)—The 21 
factories of the Groat Western 
Sugar company will begin slicing 
the 1932 beet sugar crop the 
first week in October, giving seu- 
soital employment to 4,500 men, 
it was announed today*
Sugar beet production in Colo-

rado, Wyoming, Nebraska, Mon-
tana area is expected to exceed 
2,800,000 tons, officials of the 
Company said.

DEMO CHIEFS 
OF NEW YORK 

DISCUSS CASE
(Continued from Pago One)

convention, Republican city load-
ers held a conference over the 
mayoralty situation.
As four of the five city yeadera 

came from a meeting with state 
chairman W. Klngsland Macy, It 
whs announced they had agreed to 
"sit- tight."
Macy said that while other con-

ferences would be held, the Repub-
licans would announce no decision 
until the Democrats decided wheth-
er Walker would he renominated.
John Theofel, Queens county 

Democratic leader, decided at' the 
last minute not to gq (0 Albany un-
til a later train.
McGooey and Bendt had already 

boarded the train when Farley ap-
peared. He saw Curry and walked 
arm in arm with him through the
3iite.

Now read tho Cfaeslflcd page.

GERMAN ARMS 
THREAT SCORED

Critical Situation Has 

Developed, Asserts 
Parley Chief

Newcastle, England, Sept. 8 i/P)
An bur Henderson, llrklMb la-

bor Iwiddr and prchldcnt of ih. 
Oenevn arms conference, declared 
May that If Germany carries out 
her threat to withdraw from the 
conference tho nations of 1tht 
world will he plunged again Into 
(he .same old rave fotfarmamentN.

.Mr. llendcrsap, making h|s first 
public pronouncement on! the 
arms Ihhiio slim; the adjournment 
of the Geneva parley, asserted the 
tesulls of that meeting wore far 
from what he had expected, lie 
spoke beforp the Trades Union 
Congress In session here. ;

Mr. Henderson told the con-
gress Germany’s demapds for 
arms equality had created a criti-
cal situation. •'Disaster would re-
sult, he declared, if Germany left 
tjte arms conference in the belief 
It would be Impossible to achieve 
success there. i

•'It would lead certainly to a re-
newal and Intensification of the 
old competitive race for arma-
ments," bo said
The veteran labor leader held 

that the German claims "must 
first be dealt with by the former 
■Hied and associated powers."

Admitting that the results of 
tho arms conference to date were 
not ••n<enraging, he said It was 
too early to call the meeting a 
failure.:

"I have refused to contemplate 
failure and cannot do so now," 
he continued. "There has never 
been a conference with a greater 
public opinion behind It than 
this."
Ho called upon the. allied and 

associated powers to discharge 
their "obligation to the vanquish-
ed countries" by presenting a 
"practical program of substantial 
and comprehensive reductions, In-
cluding those weapons of specially 
offensive character which were 
prohibited to Germany and other 
nations under the treaty of Ver- 
salllcH."

City Woman Cops 
Husband Calling 

Contest At Fair
Detroit, Sept. 8 (/P)—It was 

farmers' day., uts the Michigan 
stato fair and exposition today, 
but a city woman, Mrs. Minnie 
Peterson, Detroit, out-sbrilled 
seven other contestants to take 
first honors. In the husband tail-
ing coyest. ,•

Her trilled "Ilonreeoeeo" won 
her first prize of $15. Mrs. Lu-
cille F. Barnes won second prize. 
She also Is of Detroit, but she re-
ceived most of her training as 
husband calling lu St. Louis, 
Mich.

Mrs. Marie Cobb’s acquisition 
of third place was an out and out 
nnal triumph, for she hails from 
Capac and boasts that her hus-
band can hear her calls of "Char-
lie" In tho most distant pasture of 
1 heir 350 acre farm. She was 
champion two years ago both In 
tho husband and hog calling con-
tests.
Joe Lillard, of Arlington. Tex., 

retained his hog calling cham-
pionship which he has held for 
seven years. He attributes his 
success to the clear, musical and 
coaxing note of his call, which 
proves irreslstable to any" hog 
within hearing distance.

Girl Electrocuted 
As Car Hits Wire

Cheboygan, Sept. 8. (/P)—Mari-
on Myres, 21, of Ashland. Ohio, 
was electrocuted Thursday morn-
ing when she came In contact 
with a high tension wire which 
had been knocked down by the 
automobile In which she was rid-
ing with Emery Frambach. Cleve-
land. Mias Myres, residing at the 
summer home of her parents near 
Mullet Lake, was a senior at 
Smith college.‘Frnmbaclr was un-
injured In the accident.

Rhode Island, allhough the 
Smallest state In the Union, is the 
most densel.v populated.

The cotton-boll weevil is peev-
ed upon by CG different bird ene-
mies.

HITLER WORKS 
FOR COALITION

Von Hindenbur# Offers 
Unqualified Support 

To Von Papen
Berlin., Sept! 7*. tlW—While 

President Von Hlndenourg was 
assuring ('hancellor Franz Von 
Pgpen today that he would sup-
port 1 In* chancellor's government 
through thick and thin. Adolf 
HlL'.er. leader of the National Ho- 
cla'lHi*. came back to Berlin to 
take peraonal charge of. negotia-
tion!* aimed at npsettlng-that gov-
ernment with a roatltlon of hli 
Nails and the Centrist party.
The cbancellor visited the pres-

ident, who has Juat returned to 
the capital from his east Prussisn 
home, In preparation for Mon-
day's session of the Reichstag. In 
which only, a small group of mem-
bers support the present govern- 
metu.
Members of the government 

took heart from a speech made in 
Munich yesterday by Hitler. The 
Nazi leader said In this address 
that he would proceed to reshape 
the constitution on a legal husis 
Hod that he cared nothing for li-
lies or chancellorshlps so long a> 
leadership was in his hands.
> Government spokesmea Inter-
preted these remarks‘as an Indi-
cation that Hitler had relinquish-
ed all hope of becoming chancel-
lor during the lifetime of Presi-
dent Von Hindenburg.

These commentators expressed 
the expectation • that after the 
Reichstag has been dissolved and 
another election has been held the 
Fascists may be tractable enough 
to participate In the government 
In non-pivotnl positions.

Roosevelt to Speak In 
Topeka Wednesday
Topeka, Kag„ Sept. 8 (/P)— 

Many Democratic leaders of the 
mid-west farm belt are expected 
to attend the rally here next Wed-
nesday at which Governor Frank-
lin D. Roosevelt will open his 
western campaign for the presi-
dency with a speech on the agri-
cultural situation.

Under arrangements announced 
today by Gov. Harry H. Wood-
ring, the Democratic nominee will 
begin his speech (to be broadcast 
over a radio hookup), at 12:30 
p. m„ Central Standard Time. He 
will speak from a platform on 
either the north or south steps of 
the state capllol.

Upon completion of his speech, 
Mr. Roosevelt will attend mv In-
formal reception at tho governor’s 
mansion. He will appear later in 

0 afternoon at the l>ans>s free 
fair to extend greeting to the fair 
crowd. (L

Two Farm Groups 
Of State Merge

' Lansing, Mich., Sept. 8 (/P)— 
Two of' Michigan’s, leading farm 
commodity groups today were con-
solidated under the mime of the 
Michigan Bean Jobbers association.
The Jobbers In ahnua> session 

approved the merger proposal pre-
viously adopted by the Michigan 
Grain. Hay and Feed Dealers asso-
ciation. Separate'divisions in the 
Jobbers association will be created

INQUEST FAILS 
TO FIND CAUSE 
IN BERN DEATH

(' out. . I from Fngr One)

aervicas, which will be held pri-
vate tomorrow at 2 p. m. at the 
lug.ewood'csmetsry.
A eulogy will be read by Con-

rad Nagel, film flayer, and the 
body will be cremated.

WED TO ANOTHER
Colorado Springs, Hepl. 8 (/Pj— 

George S. darken, Los Angeles in- 
siiiHiice man, asserted today Paul 
Bern, motion picture producer wbo 
committed suicide last Monday, 
waa wed to uuoiher'wbman at the 
tliuu of his marriage to Jean JlaY- 
low, film star.

Identifying himself uh Bern's 
liiNuratire adviser, darken declar-
ed Bern ten years ago married a 
woman who h now u patient In a 
New York Haiiiioriufti lor mental 
cases, lie said they wefy pot di 
voreed.

InHiiranco policies held by Bern 
are payable to a trust fund hnu- 
died by a New York tfuat company 
for her bfiiofU, darken said.
The Insurance man, who said he 

was nti Intimate friend of * the 
movlq executive, added that he was 
one of the few persons who knew 
of the former marriage.
darken said the deranged wifi 

Is not mentioned by name In tin 
Insurance policies, but uu attached 
clause provides for payments to 
her. • ’ —
Clurkon said he did not know 

whether the woman who lived In 
tho Algonquin hotel, New York, 
under tho name of Mrs. Paul Bern 
uni II Iasi spring, waa I he same 
person tho Hollywood man had 
married and supported after she 
became mentally incompetent. He 
said the trust company alone 
knows tho Identity and where-
abouts of the woman.
The Insurance man was attend-

ing a contrenUon here. Ho left to-
day for L/>b Angeles. r

FILES REPORT 
OF METHODISTS

District Superintendent 
* Accuses Tarishes of 

Mismanagement

Lansing, Mich., Sept.. 8 (/P)~
The Michigan Conference of tho.
Methodist Episcopal church today 
wan , given u financial report 
which criticized individuAl par-
ishes for tho "slovenly manner’.’

* (Tl\? report, siibmitfod? by the 
Rov. yClark 8. Wheeleir, superin-
tendent of the Grand Rapids dis-
trict, sald~"4he marvel is that so 
many churches get along as well 
as they do^Rlth the slovenly man-
ner- In wmh they handle their 
finances." '*
An Immediate refinancing of 

outstanding- 0 b 11 g a 11 0 ns by- 
churches heavily indebted was 
recommended In tho report along 
with a "program of debt paying."

According'to the report, the 
523 churches in the conferenco 
have property with an estimated 
value of $0,024,694 against which
there Is an Indebtedness of $X»* ~ 9 ... _.
017,016. Eight churches, the re- t0 car® of#th? , Tger^ IThe 
port said, owe more than $800? ha>' «n,d fead dealerB ^d an
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000.
A reduction last year in the 

number of districts from six to 
five, .* the report continued, 
brought a drop of more than, $6,- 
000 in the conference's budget or 
one cent for each member. More 
than $36,000 was spent during 
the year In the improvement of 
churches and parsonages.

Praise for Gandhi 
• Mr. Wheeler said that 3,681 
new members were received into 
the church during the year, a net 
Increase of 1,594. "Ttq. church 
occupies a larger place In the 
thinking of society than formerly. 
More people today are attending 
church than ever before," he said.

India is awakening "after a 
long sleep to take its rightful 
place among the nations of the 
world," Dr. Jashwant R. Chitam- 
bar, bishop'of 500,000 Methodists 
of his native country, said in a 
conference address.

Bishop Chitambar expressed 
admiration .for Mahatma Gandhi. 
"HeVis a man of outstanding 
character and has givett; the Na-
tionalist movement spiritual guid-
ance," he aAld.^^HH^pfl|ft|ll

The'blshop safd his people are 
"losing their Inferiority complex. 
They demand that India , become 
one of the great nations of the 
world.'T

Dr. Ralph Soekman, pastor of 
the Madison Avenue Methodist 
churdlt, of New York City, con-
ference lecturer, professed to see 
little hope for "moral power from 
tire politicians."

i "^'haven’t much hope‘in poli-
ticians when at their two great 
meetings they spent so little time 
discussing how ‘men are to eat 
and so much time on how they 
will drink," he said.
The day’s Urogram was an ed-

ucational one with Dr. John.!,. 
Seaton, president of Albion col-
lege, and Webster H. Pearce, 
state superintendent of public In-
struction. speakers.
Tomorrow will be "Methodist 

Men's Day." Arthur H. Sapp, past 
president of Rotary International, 
will be a leading speaker.

Confesses Pari In 
Labor Day Holdup

Detroit, Sept. 8. (/P)—Police re-
ported Thursday that William 
Ferris. 19. had confessed particip-
ating in the $1.‘200 Labor Day 
holdup of the Hollywood Theatre 
iipre. and had named three accom-
plices, one of them Sydney Had-
dad. 19. already under arrest.
5 -'ViVv-v ..

nn-interrupted separate existence 
of thirty years prior to today.
Jobbers re-elected C. H. Rum 

man, of Lowell, president for a 
fourth term. A. E. Walcott, of Sag 
inaw, was chosen secretary. Mem-
bers of the,board of directors are: 
Herman Henule, Bay Port; John 
N. McFarland, Alma; and Guy Row 
ell. Yalo.
Although the proposed move 

ment among farmers to with-hold 
their beans from the market until 
they reach $2.60 a bushel was not 
brought before the official atten-
tion of tho delegates, they favored 
the movement individually. A 
meelng has' been called In Corun 
na Saturday to discuss the pro-
posal.

Woman Bitten By 
“Pet” Rattlesnake

Detroit, Sept. 9 (/P)—Mrs. Jose-
phine Smith. 28. of Menton, Mich.. 
was bitten on,the hand today by a 
diamond-back rattlesnake while 
he was preparing food for (he 16 
.-eptlles with which she appears In 
.1 carnival
She was brought to Detroit in 

airplane and rusiied to Receiving 
Hospital in a patrol wagon. There 
her condition was pronounced 
"temporarily serious" tonight.

British India and China furnish 
the world with 65 per cent of all 
gout and kid skins.

JEAN HARLOW'S 
LOVE TRAGEDY

(Continued from Page One)

vorce court a year and a half ngp 
and whoso second husband 
found dead by his own hand two 
months after their marriage.

She was Just IB then, a fresh-
man. On the school register she 
was listed by her real name, Har- 
lean Carpentler.

Her mother, Mra. Jepn Harlow 
Carpentler. a young an'd comely 
divorcee who lived in Waukegan, 
«n Indiiatrlal town some 15 miles 
north, had brought her there a 
few flays before.

Earlier, they had lived In Kan- 
ita City, where .Jean wak born on 
March 31, 1911. Mra. Carpentler’s 
husband—Jean’H father—waa a 
physician. The maternal grand-
father was a wealthy real estate 
dealer, who adored, the blonde, 
blue-eyed child.
As a child, Jean spent her sum-

mers at her grandfather’s summer 
nom'e on the Missouri river. 
Flowera surrounded the house but 
the child took no more interent in 
them than ■she did In her dolls, 
which were carefully stored away 
on u shelf us soon as she received 
them. It waa the livestock that at-
tracted her: ducks, lambs and— 
most of all—three little pigs tha* 
kept her busy day after day. Her 
•{rundfather bought her a smaU 
red wagon and harness for the 
threo pigs, and Jean drove them 
all around the place.

• » *
As Jean grew older she still 

preferred her own company to 
that of boys. She wouldn't have 
anything to do with the brothers 
of tho few girls she knew. And 
when Jean entered Ferry Ifoll she 
still felt pretty much the same 
way about boys.

Schoolmates Who "pent week-
ends with her at Jean's mother’s 
modest bungalow in Waukegan 
understood afterwards that it was 
her grandfather who defrayed the 
cost of her expensive education. 
For Ferry Hall then, as for the 
preceding half century, was * fa-
vorite private school among the 
daughters of Chicago’s and Lake 
Forest’s wealthy and socially reg-
istered families.
At first Hsrlean’s^ blond beauty 

didn’t blend well with her new 
background. The story of the 
shoes hurt her In the eyes of her 
classmates, who continued - to 
clump around in their.' awkward 
oxfords. She was too pretty. For 
one so young, she seemed too 
sophisticated:
As a result, when th© new girls 

were Initiated, tho old girls sin-
gled her out for the butt of most 
of their practical jokes. They 
made her wear her pale gold curls 
In a score of tightly braided pig- 
'tails. They smeared her pink, 
tkln with grease blackened with 
soot. They marched her onto thf 
campus where the boys from Lake 
Forest College and the Academy, 
watching proceedings from the 
Sidewalk, might hurl good-na-
tured gibes at her appearance.

Before tho Thanksgiving holi-
days arrived, however, the‘older 
girls began to warm toward her. 
They discovered that In-spite of 
her w’orldly veneer she was only 
an unsophisticated girl. She had 
jtever had a boy, friend, and her 
best girl friend was her mother.

•Hbr' lack* of experience with 
boys madp her a willing, even an 
eager, confidante for all the girls 
In her dormitory. The wide-eyed, 
almost breathless way she lis-
tened to their stories went a long

The pigmy shrew, weighing 2.!‘ 
grams, is the smallest animal ii 
the world.

$22.50

$22.50

$22.50

$2&50

*22-50

$22'50
Is all you have to pay 
for your new fall 
suit of “Nottingham 

Fabrics”

Anderson-Bloom
1204 Lwlington

vay toward establish ng her pop 
luilty In the school.
All the *\ hll ' Hint Imt star wn* 

(sing with her schoolmates, It 
fcas waning with her teachers. Il 
was a source of unending n\orl1' 
flcatlon to them that, though hIm- 
-ktmmrd ovgr and slighted hei 
lessons, nil.- t<( ted thfi 
ly. AgslnM their will, they were 
forced to give her a succession of 
A’s and It plufti.
Tho only u ikher at Ferry Hall 

said to have "liked Harlean" was 
Mlia Brown, dramatist teacher. 
She recognized the girl's ability 
as an actress, wiu-n ii » ame tipw* 
for her to select the cast for the 
school's annual spring play, "The 
Winter's Tale," shn disregarded 
the tradition which awarded lead-
ing roles only to seniors and 
Juniors and chose Harlean for the 
part of the Princess Perdltai 
Throughout Harlean's flr->t y*ar 

at boarding school, her mother 
was a frequent visitor at Ferry 
Hall. The bond between mothai 
and daughter was clearly recog-
nized. Usually when Mrs. Clt'pen- 
tier started back to her homo In 
Waukegan, Harlean and n $chooL 
mate accompanied her.
Week-ending at the Carpentler’s 

became one of the school's most 
coveted pleasures. Mrs. Carpcn- 
tter was young .and understand-
ing. Bhe was beautiful. She was 
modern. When Harlean and her 
wests, contrary to school rules. 
Iraw forth their ’ clgarets and 
lighted them, she did not com-
ment. /, ;
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Then ow day nows came to 
Hat lean at scltnol that her mother 
was to re-nmrry. Her new hus-
band was MprlJio Bolin, former 
Chicago hotel man Following the 
marriage, she moved to a cozy 
though unpretentious little house 
In Hlgtjlaud Park, closer to l4tke
Forest.

It was about this time that ro-
mance first entered Harlean’s 
life. One day In the dramatic clasa 
Addah Jeannette ("Jada" to her 
friends) ’ *Leland, petite, dark- 
haired junior from Detroit, leaned 
over and asked her if she would 
like to go to a dance at the Drake 
hotel In Chicago the following 
Saturday night with a boy named 
"Chuck" McGrew.

TOMORROW: The platinum 
blond's first romance.

CITY BRIEFS

Miss Bertha Olson of Esranalm 
has left for Menominee where she 
has accepted a poaltldn In a beau- 
ly ehop. " ' » i

Now read the Classlfit-d page,

— FOUR SEASONS CLUl Mtt 
Mltrtan* I»Und. Pamblnt, WlacMiin 

Will esUnd zuwt card* to non-metnbm 
upon request. Hale of 16.00 a day In- 
dudM meal*, golf, riding, swimming, 
tennis, boating and Ashing. Accommo-
dations In tint clsss modern Club 

i Hotua 'Address:
j MAKY G. GILLIB, Pessblne Wlscamlw.

HOW IS YOUR LIFE
Affected by Nature’s Whims?

Ltarn of 
YOUR

Chancas for
SUCCESS

Stc th« Big

Announcc-

mant

NEXT
SUNDAY,
S«pt. 11, in ‘

MILWAUKEE JOURNAL
ZOS« T JxZKSjEXJM

r.AAA.V

DELFT
2:30— 

10c, 25c, 30c 
7:00-10:00— 
10c, 25c, 40c

TODAY
T o m o r r o‘w

Continuous Show
sC.ome at 7:00 or come as late as 
10 o’clock and see a full show

No Extra Charge

FEATURES WILL BE RUN IN THE FOLLOWING 
•' . * • •ORDER—

rrrm

A FAILURE

wasted

"PLAY GIRL”
. • • . ' I ’ .’ •

WITH

Loretta Young Norman Foster
Winnie Lightner

Dramatic conflict of landed loves and lives in a story 
as trye as life itself. A picture you’ll love.

Nate—This picture ib being repeated by 
request.

ALSO—

News — Comedy — Snapshots

NOTE—

“The Man Called Back” 
will be run on Fridfty 

Matinee.

“Play GhT will be run 
on Saturday Matinee

..... , «,- ■ - ,. ■4^1
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WOOD ALL GUT 
0N2F0RTP

Over 300 Escanaba Job-
less Chop Their Own 
On City Woodlot

Jnrv.* r 5v ', tjl
More than 300 hav» reeponiied to 

die citj'e offer to furnieh wood to 
Jobleea Eacanaba reetdente who 
wished to ico out In th« wood! end 
*ut their own, city manager T. F. 
Kessler reporta. Two fortiee about 
thre miles from the city on the 
Dantotth road were eecured for 
this purpoee. The wood now Is 
practically all cut on both of these 
fortlee. and the city !» negotiating 
for atlll another forty in the same 
area to be used aa a woodlot.
Most of the wood cut on the first 

of the two fortlee has been hauled, 
the city furnishing the trbck and 
drlrer to haul the fuel to the homes 
of thd cutters, who are alio re-
quired to help load and unload 
trucke. Early cutting and hauling 
has Men encouraged while roada 

/ sre good and to give the wood time 
to dry out for winter use.

Elks Enjoy Annual 
Picnic; 72 Present

Eecanqba Elks held their annual 
picnic Wednesday evening at Ne- 
co Lodge, M-36, with 72 men pre- 
aent.

R. W. Coolman, exalted ruler of 
the local B. P. 0. E., was highly- 
pleased with thelViccess of the 
etont. and paid tribute to the com-
mittee In charge for their work In 
promoting the details of the annu-
al gathering.

A great many bright men have 
come from the far west and the 
brighter they are the sooner they 
come.

•—Edwin Markham, writer.

NAHMA NEWS

DANCE
i •

At .

Lagoon Beach
Stonington 

SATURDAY NIGHT
Music By ' 

LINDAHL AND JOHNSON'

Nahma, Mich.-—Mr. and Mrs. 
Elmer Flnstrum of 832 Sheridan 
Road. Escanaba. spent ths most 
>r last week at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Levlgne. Mre. 
Flnstrum Is a daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Levlgne.

IIiha Lois DeRosler. daughter 
of Mr. end Mrs. Harry DeRosler 
and Mies Barbara Krutlna. daugh-
ter, of Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Kru-
tlna. left Monday for Elgin, III., 
where they will train for nursing 
at the St. 'Joseph's hospital, sit-
uated In that city. Mr. and Mrs. 
DeRosler and daughter. Shirley, 
and Mrs. Andrew Krutlna accom-
panied them to Escanaba where 
they boarded the train.

Mrs. George Eychaner, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Schwarts. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Tobin and son, Robert 
and Mr. R. Johnson of Ogontx, 
made a fishing trip to Grand Ma-
rais,' Sunday. They also visited 
friends and relntlvas, who were 
camping at Sucker Creek, situat-
ed eight miles from Grand Marais.

Doctor Ferris Bummer be 11. for-
mer physician of Nahma. arrived 
In, Nahma Sunday evening. He 
will visit a short time In Nahma.

Charles Good, vice president of 
the Bay de Noequet Co., of Chica-
go. arrived Ih Nahma Sunday eve-
ning.

Stuart Dawley. son of Mr. and 
Mrs. E. C. Dawley arrived In Nah-
ma Friday after spending the 
summer with friends In Califor-
nia.

N. McKindles and children and 
Lawrence DouvIUe of L'Anse. 
spent the week-end In Nahma. 
Mrs. McKindles and Mr/Lgwrence 
Louvllla are the son and daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mbs. E. J. DouvIUe.

Mrs. Herman Bramer and 
daughter, Violet, and the Misses 
Grace Olmsted and Lucille Dou- 
vitle, motored to Escanaba Sun-
day morning to sSe a faw friends 
who were leaving for Elgin, IH.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Tobin and 
children James, Thomas and Lu-
cia Anne, returned to Nahma Sun-
day evening ' after spending a 
week wlrti Mr. Tobin’s slater, Mrs. 
Frank Schlender, In Proctor, 
Minn.

' Bernard Tobin, who Is employ-
ed In Marquptte, spent Sunday 
evening at the home of his par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas TObJn.

Mr. and Mra. Nelson Plude, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin Kousbough 
who have been visiting In Chica-
go, Milwaukee and Elgin, during 
the paat week returned Sunday 
•ventng.

Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Camerop 
and daughter, Jean, Mr. and Mra. 
William Henderson returned to 
Nahma Monday evening after vis-
iting In Sault Ste. Marie. Mrs.

Henderson and Mrs, Cameron had 
rfpent the most of last week, while 
the rest of the party Just vtilttd 
over the week-end.

Mr. and Mrs. Asher R. Ellis and 
daughter, Mary, o! Appleton, 
Wli„ who have been visiting with 
Mr. and Mrs. B. D. Brophy, the 
past week, left Monday morning 
for their home.

Dr. Dicker of the Green h * 
clinic, and Mrs. Dicker spent the 
week-end In Nahma. They were 
the guesta of Mr. and’Mrs. B. I). 
Brophy..

Mrs. E. C. Dawley and daugh-
ter, Beth, motored to Wausnw 
Monday morning. On their re-
turn Wednesday. Miss Beth will 
proceed to Boston, Mass., where 
she will attend school this com 
ing year.

Mr. and Mrs. B. I). Brophy and 
daughters. Ksthaleen and Betty, 
will leave Thursday for Green 
Bay. Mlaa Kathaleen will contin-
ue on to Madison and Miss Betty 
will enter the Beilin hospital at 
Green Bay.

Mr. and Mrs. P. T. Berlnger 
and daughter. Katheryn, and Miss 
Sylvia Roudebush of Appleton, 
WIs., visited at the home of W. H. 
Acker over Labor Day.

Miss Florence Johnson who has 
spdht most of the summer In Chi-
cago visiting with her aunt. Miss 
Irene Johnson, returned Saturday 
morning.
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BRIEFLY TOLD

Cnder 98,000 Bond — After 
waiving examination before 
Charles F. Button, United* States 
court commissioner, at Marquette 
Clifton B. ,(Klp) Bartley of Es-
canaba was released on $3,000 
bond for trial In a liquor law vio-
lation charged by federal offlcera. 
He Is charged with possession. His 
place was visited late Saturday 
-night by federal officers.

• • •
Dance at Hoo Hill—Manley An 

derson and his Delta Dandles will 
furnish the music for a'dance to 
be held at Soo Hill Saturday eve-
ning. September .10. Everyone la 
welcome.

ANNOUNCEMENT
of interest to EVERYBODY

mm

Be Sure to Sea It!
NEl^MiDAy,

September 11, in

ra

OrcUr Your 
Copy NoW I hyUts*

College Romance
Frustrated By Dad

• —,_ _

The following story concerning 
Dudley Crafts Watbon. Chicago art- 
lit and lecturer who Is known here 
In connection with a speaking en-
gagement In Escanaba a ' few 
montha ago. appeared in yester-
day's edition of the Milwaukee 
Sentinel:
Hints of a frustrated college ro-

mance between Emily Watson, 19. 
daughter of the former director of 
the Milwaukee Art Institute, and 
Georg© B. lake, Jr., son of a prom 
Inent Highland Park physician, 
were revealed Wednesday In a wed 
ding license mlxup In Racine.
Young Lake, who gave his age at 

21 and his occupation as a student, 
applied for a license to marry Miss 
Watson at the office of County 
Clerk Harry Basinger, according to 
press dispatches.
He gave the name of his bride as 

Miss Watson, the daughter of Duo 
ley Crafts Watson, noted art critic 
and lecturer, also a resident of 
Highland Park, her age at 19, and 
her occupation as a student at 
Northweitera university..
But regulations require that both 

applicants be present for marriage 
licenses, young Lake was Informed
"Okeh,” be said, •Til be back 

Monday and bring her with me.”
But Miss Wateon reached at her 

Highland Park residence decreed 
otherwise. *o- ; rn »•
"There’ll be no marriage," she 

declared Indignantly. ' ‘.‘And 
won’t be there Monday."
"We are Just friends . I have 

been out with him several times, 
but the idea'of getting a marriage 
license Is Just a Joke."
L*ke at his home In Highland 

Park confirmed the application for 
license, but said:

"It’s all over. My application has 
been cancelled. I called the clerk 
by phone."
Dudley Crafts Watson was head 

of the Milwaukee Art Institute for 
10 years. He resigned to take up a 
post of lecturer with the Chicago 
Art Institute.

dllldran Need Clothes — A 
mother of five children, deprived 
of her husband’s support. Is In 
need of clothing for her family, 
ranging In ages from 11 to* _ 
years, the oldest being s boy. 
There are three boys and two 
girls. Those who have children’s 
clothes to spare to help out the 
destitute family are asked to 
bring them to the Escanaba police 
station or notify Chief of Police 
John Tolan.

• • •
Buys Oil ftfatiou—The Perkins 

Oil Station, located at South 
Gladstone, has been purchased 
from R. J. Riley of Gladstone by 
A. A. Nelson of this city. Mr. Nel-
son la taking ovar the operation 
of the oil station Immediately.

• • •
Dance at Latjoon Beach—Lindahl 

and Johnson will play for another 
dance at lagoon Beach. Stonington. 
Skturday evening. The public Is In-
vited.

26 Students At 
Delta Co. Normal

The list of 26 high school grad-
uates who have been enrolled for 
a course in education at the Delta 
county normal school was an-
nounced yesterday by C. U. Wool- 
netr, county school commissioner.
They are: Eleanor M. Bolger, 

Eacanaba; Clifford Huckmaster. 
Gladstone; Marie Caalmlr, Per-
kins; Charles Devet, Fayette; Ele-
anor English.- Eacanaba; Dorothy 
Ferguson. Escanaba; June Osrdl- 
pee, Fayette: Vivian Glelsner. Es-
canaba: Helen E. Ooodreau, Wells; 
Maurice W. Ooodreau, Wells: Ray-
mond J. Gravelle. Rapid River; 
Irene C. Gustafson, Escanaba: Eu-
genia Hemes. Escanaba; Theodora 
Holm. Gladstone; Jeanne Marie 
Hubs, Bark River; Howard I^aBum- 
bard. Rapid River; Roms !>• 
Blanc. Escanaba. Vivian McMona- 
gle, Escanaba: Cecil© P. Mitchell. 
Schaffer; Ethel Helen Murphy. Es-
canaba; Marcella McGinn, Banana 
ba; May Sauers. Escanaba; Isla L. 
Shackelford. Schaffer; Vivian 
Sparks. Escanaba, Mary Kathleen 
Todd. Escanaba; Angelina Frenn. 
Eacanaba.

Drugs and medicines cost peo-
ple of the United States $715,- 
000,000 annually.

SMOKING GIRLS

Hunter college girls have won 
the right to smoke in a special 
loom aseigned to them as a smok-
ing room In one of the campus 
buildings. They have an under-
standing that they will not smoke 
anywhere else on the campus, 
however, or in the vicinity. I^atoi 
on. more smoking rooms. In other 
campus buildings, will be set aside 
for girl smokers.

The diameter of Betelguese. 
star In tho heavens. Is variously 
estimated from 200.non.con to 
300,000,00 miles.

T-i-

HERE ARE THE RUGS YOU 
HAVE BEEN WAITING FORI

-A •

Furnish ytmr home, this 

Fall, with teal Oriental 

beauty! Authentic Persian 

and Chinese colors and de- 

signs—deep pile—.perma-

nently high-lighted lustra.

These mirrelous new
■ v

rugs are fringed. Many are 

woven through to the back 

like genuine Orientals.

Old Railroad Man
Married 50 Years

- - •
.Mr. and Mrs. John Tennis, 

Grfeen Bay, celebrated their 50th 
wedding anniversary Saturday 
very quietly at their home. Mr. 
and Mrs. Tennis were married at 
Negaunee, Mich., ' on Sept. 4, 
1882, with the Rev. Father Els, 
who later became bishop at Mar-
quette, Mich., officiating,

At the time of his marriage Mr. 
Tennis w’as a passenger brakeman 
on th6 C. & N. W. railroad. Be-
cause of his marriage h© laid off 
one trip. . >•. . \

Mr. and Mrs. Tennis have three 
children, Robert Jj. Tennis, Buf-
falo. New York, Mrs, M E. Fin-
negan, 426 S. Quincy at., Green 
Bay, and Mrs. Ernest Richardson, 
Milwaukee. There are also two 
grandchildren, Robert Finnegan, 
and Kathleen Richardson.

Argentina is one of the world’s! 
leading producers of animal hair." 
turning out* about 9,000,000

1
Exports of American products 

to Russia last year dropped 60 
per cent over the previous year’s 
skipping.

'America’s ^Most'Beautiful Thrift Bugs" 
HIRASIAN - MERASIAN'- MERCERAK

^ z 12 it afa. Other sizes in proportion 
Now os display, in a wide range of prices and styles.

#
H<*vy-haaded humor usually 

cewee from Ughtdieadcd people.

All I have 
ever used 
to keep 
my house 
clean is

WWWWVWWYWWi

DEMOCRATIC
RALLY
TONIGHT
At 8 O'clock

Jm

UN *; b*

Candidate for the Democratic' 
Congressional Nomination 
Will Discuss the Issues 

of the Democratic
:

.

v!.45*-'s
?rvl' Platform

:v * A
m

es.

Paid Political Advertisement

A

Home Frocks with 
Style and Value

2 for $|

\ «

.10

No store pretends to equal the House 
Dress values you get at Lauermans—

And these new styles for Fall are so 
smartly fashioned from fast color new 
prints that you must admit now is the 
time to make your selections—

Come today and choose from the most 
desirable frocks you have seen at such 
small price.

Crepe De Chine
DANCETTES 
and PANTIES

• »

%

<0

Fall values are so truly wonderful 
that we know every well garbed maid 
will want to know about these flesh 
colored Crepe Dancettes and Panties 
that are featured in today’s selling—

Lace trimmed carefully tailored to 
give the right fit—and low priced.

Hosiery

ure
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m
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All silk (no rayon) lisle garter 
top — re-enforced sole — narrow 
French heel—Colors: Brownwood, 
Matin, Nomad and Sandwhite—
„ In all your hosiery buying you’ve 
never seen such quality at this low 
price—All new perfect goods.
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EDITORIAL-

MAINE VOTES MONDAY
THE state of Maine will hold 

It* Rubornatorlal and congression-
al election* on Monday. The out-
come of the balloting will be 
awaited with much anxiety ns 
Maine hn* been connldered some-
what of a barometer of what will 
happen In the prealdentlal elec-
tion* In November. Ever since 
1840 when "Maine went hell 
bent for Governor Kent," the say-
ing has been "as Maine goes, so 
goe* the Union."
Maine ha* elected a Republi-

can governor In September f ; of 
every preHldential election year 
subsequent to the civil war. how-
ever. The gauging of result* In 
the national election*, therefore, 
can be made only on the site of 
the Republican governor'* major-
ity In Maine, and not the fact of 
his election.
A study of history reveal*, how-

ever, In only six of the 16 elec-
tions following the civil war, the 
national result* could have been 
predicted from the Maine results; 
In seven, the ‘ national results 
could not have been thus fore-
cast; and in three. (1880, 1912
and 1924) third party tickets in-
validated any comparison.
As usual, both the Republican 

and Democratic parties have been 
waging energetic campaigns In 
Maine this fall. This probably 1* 
done more for.the effect It will 
have on the voters throughout the 
nation because of {ho Maine tfa*

electoral votes in November, since 
ihere are only six.

Political observers indicate that 
New York will be the pivotal 
state In the presidential election 
this year. Leaders In t,he Demo-
cratic and Republican ranks, not 
speaking for publication, have ex-
pressed the opinion that Hoover 
or Roosevelt will win the election 
by a bare margin of about fifty 
electoral votes. In 1928, Hoover 
raptured the Empire State's 45 
electoral votes,' despite the fart 
that in previous years Alfred E. 
Smith had been elected governor 
by substantial majorities. Roose-
velt was elected to his first term 
a* governor In 1928, and was re-
turned to office In 1930 by an 
overwhelming vote. Whether 
Roosevelt will he able to fare bet-
ter than Smith in his own state In 
his quest for the presidency Is a 
Jebatable question.
The Walker episode, undoubt-

edly, has caused him the loss of 
some Tammany support, and 
there are signs that the Wall 
Street Interests are wary of him 
because of his power policy and 
other Ideas concerning social re-
form. The electoral vote of New 
York is the big prize for which 
both parties will wage a liard 
fight for It may develop to be the 
deciding factor of the November 
election. The forthcoming Liter-
ary Digest poll of New York state 
should prove to be a more authen-
tic barometer than next Monday's 
election in Maine.

reaHonahln In shouldering their 
fair share of the burden, or even 
more, when they consider that 
the state is at least trying to act 
fairly and honestly with , them, 
and Just as quick to give vie the 
cold shoulder when they think the 
purpose is to "soak" them.

If the exact facts can he ascer-
tained It will he found that Chev-
rolet, like all the other plants we 
have lost, I* going because of the 
threat of Wisconsin, of the wild 
talk of men like Huber and 
Blaine, men who make promises 
to "get" Industry or sorely mis-
represent It* right*, expecting to 
secure vote* from the misinform-
ed one* whom they have misin-
formed.
To take another payroll of over 

a million and a half a year and 
see it go over the line Into Illinois 
1* an awful price to pay for keep-
ing some of the extremists In of-
fice whom we .Insist upon retain-
ing or for countenancing or 'toU 
eratlng In office men whom we 
know are the unfit, the bunglers. 
—Green Bay Press Gazette.

WHAT PRICE?
A RETURNING traveler from 

the far-off South Pacific landed 
In San Francisco the other day 
with new* of Dr. Frederick Ritter 
and Frau Hllde Koerwln, former-
ly of Berlin, who have been liv-
ing a Robinson Crysoe existence 
In a remote little Island In the

for LOVE or MONEY
(Br NEA Barvlca) ar H. W. CORLEY

Galapagos group for the past two 
dUioii tiiaii for tlio Capture of the >™r"* :*re "ll11 ('ulle hft^

CHEVROLET PLANT 
QUITS WISCONSIN

LIKE a bombshell to Janesville 
camo the announcement that the 
great Chevrolet assembling plant 
there, employing 1400 men, Is 
folding up and quitting Wiscon-
sin.
The statement that it could not 

hear the burden of Wisconsin’s 
taxation will bear minute Investi-
gation. Any statement made in 
the thick of a hotly contested po-
litical campaign will bear Investi-
gation.

It 1* likely that the plant gave 
up in despair at the threat of fur-
ther load* upon its back than of 
my existing ones.

Governor La Follette did the 
proper thing by going immediate 
)y to Janesville and undertaking 
to save the industry for the state. 
This action may be compared to 
that of a certain Progressive edi-
tor who has flamboyantly publish-
ed, in substance, the declaration, 
"Good riddance to bad rubbish” 
every time sn industry quit, and 
who declared, moreover, that 
Wisconsin was glad to have any 
of those quit that didn’t want to 
stay. Unfortunately the governor 
baa to shoulder the burden for 
these wild men In hls own camp.
The men who run Industry are

about it.
They told, him that they bate 

no Intention of quitting their, tiny 
paradise, of which they are the 
sole Inhabitants, and that they ex-
pect to live to be 100 years old 
In the contentment and solitude 
that Is theirs. They have estab-
lished their home In a rude open- 
air shack among the trees and 
live very comfortably, since the 
equatorial climate never varies,

It is difficult to understand 
why Dr. Ritter, once a prominent 
Berlin physician, and his pretty 
married nurse (undlvorced, by 
the way) should choose to give up 
civilization and hie off to a far 
corner of the world to live like 
Adam hnd Eve on a tiny island 
all to themselves. But why worry 
over trying to understand it? It 
is entirely their own affair.

Yet, one can’t help believing 
that Dr. Ritter and(hls companion 
are Just as happy as they say they 
are. They may have lost a lot of 
the attractions that civilization 
has to offer; but likewise they 
have gained a lot—for civiliza-
tion .after all, has its iprlce.
Far from the world’s beaten 

path, they have escaped many 
things. They have no nosey neigh-
bors eSfeer to pry Into their af-
fairs, or alwaya ready to bother 
hy, borrowing sugar or. coffee; If 
Dr. Ritter chooses to come home 
slightly tipsy at night (although 
goodness only knows where he 
would be coming from) he need 
not worry, because there Is no one 
to see him; he Is free from wor-
ries about pay cuts or losing hls 
Job, never bothered by thoughts 
of the depression, Immune from 
having to crawl out rif bed and 
hustle off to work when the alarm 
clock rings In the morning, never 
troubled with the problem of pay- 
ing bills on the first of the month, 
exempt from both house rent and 
taxes, never has .to listen to the 
weary speeches of politicians or 
read about the scandals of Holly-
wood movie stars.
' Frau koerwln has her freedom, 
too. She doesn’t have to worry 
about trying to make ends meet 
in running the household, wash-
ing dirty dishes, getting ready for 
bridge parties, rejn^king last 
year’s dress to tfonform'jwith the 
new fall styles or entertaining 
boresnme guests who drop In at 
the most Inopportune limes and 
stay much longer than they are 
wanted. V,’ .

Yes, there’s a lot to be said in 
favor of a solitary existence on a 
desert island. So much so. In 
fact, It’s liable to make one won-
der when the next boat leaves for 
the South Seas and how much a 
ticket costs.

dffAPTER XLIV
It was Barry’s voice that Mona 

heard. "Oh, my darling, you’ve 
come at iMt!"

Barry was beside her. After 
all these days and w?cks of cour-
teous formality; of coldness al-
most. he was again the Barry she 
had learned to love, Far a mo-
ment Mona did not speak, did not 
turn her head. Sho sank against 
the white linen shoulder, against 
the arm which enclosed her and 
alphed.

Then, still without speaking, 
she raised her hand and pressed 
It against Barry’s face, j

"Yes, Barry, I—I’m here!"
.They stood In f silence. The 

sands lay white around them. The 
sen under the white moonlight 
rippled quietly. The flamboyant 
trees close at hand swayed softly. 
There seemed no one else in the 
world except these two.
Mona did not look at Barry. 

Her head sank lower against hta 
shoulder. She could feol the 
beating of hls heart as tumultu-
ous as her own. "Mona, why did 
you do It, darling?” he said at
IWt.

"Do what, Barry?" Still she did 
not look at him. He had caught 
her hand In hls own.

"Do what? Oh, Mona, how 
could you! Why did you marry 
my uncle?" The despair In hls 
voice tore her heart.
"Why did you run away?" she 

countered.
He was miserable and she was 

adding to hls misery. "How 
could I stay when I knew?"

‘Barry!”
He did not speak for a moment 

but hls arm tightened about her.

"Barry! Do you lhink*I mar-
ried your uncle for hls money?"

"It certainly looked that way. 
You knew I had none. You 
kiiew~" ' ' • 7

• ♦ e
Sho shook her head. The^em 

drlla of her hair touched VMds 
cheek. "How could you think 
that of me?" Mona demanded. 
“You hudu’i asked.me to many 
you. You hadn’t even said you 
loved mel’tv^? > 4
•"But you knew."

, "I thought I did! That was 
why when Mr. Oarretson nskefl 
me to rush to Twilands hnd mar-
ry Barry Townsend f didn't hesi-
tate! That wag the way it all 
happened, Barry. It didn’t occur 
to me that your uncle’s name was 
Barry, too! It didn’t occur to me 
that 1 was going to Twilands for 
any other reason except to marry 
you!" •

"But when Garretson told you 
It wa* my unde—" Barry began. 
. "He didn’t! 'Ws talked It all 
over without ' mentioning the 
man’s name. Finally I asked him 
Just as I was going out the door 
who the man was and ho said 
’Barry Townsend.’ ’’
"And you thought you -were go-

ing to Twilands to marry mo?" 
Barry said slowly.

Mona nodded. "Until I was 
there In the sick room."

"And by that time I was on 
board the Miranda!" V

Barry’s head dropped misera-
bly and Mona reached out a hand 
once more and touched hls cheek. 
"It’a not too late now, Barry," 
she said timidly. "It’s not too 
late. We aren’t-old yet. And 
we’re here—"

LYRICS OF LIFE
By Dougina Malloch j 

' (Ca*yrtfht I 111 4r Dm«Iu HalkU)

Lfi/

/ Tax cuts have benefited the 
farmer greatly. I^ast year he was 
|200 short of having enough to 
pay hls $200 tax bill. This year

sensitive of tikir right* WH Is only $150 at|d he’s
elss In the state, Juat as]only $150 short.

iJ.i fttaMBmi l

ilip$ THE OLD WAY 
Each day It’s another boy,

Each night it’s another placed . 
A search for a later Joy,

A smile from a newer face,
She says it’a a better way,

She says, and she ought to know; 
I think of an older day,

The days of the long ago.

Each day It’s another girl,
It’s not like It used to be:

One look, and a heart awhlrl, .
And only one girl for me.

It> nflt Jlko It used to seem: 
w A 1,00k, and a heart astir,
A walk, and a'l^aldenls dream, - ,,i’. Vv. 
,i\jJj£rAhd only 'one boy .for her.

Each day 'twas the same,old boy.
Each day ’twas the same girl still, 

No search for another joy.
No quest for a gregjy- thrill,

Jt may be It tied her down,
Her chances, perhaps, .were few:. 

She married right here in-town 
A fellow she really

, * How can I marry my uncle’s 
wife?" demanded Barry bitterly. 
"My aunt'" He pUred into 
space. 'Mona, oh, how could you
how could you!"
"Your node's widow. Barry.” 

Mona whispered, ‘but never hls 
wife! I was never thal!"
"You maan—?"
"I mean I was to consider the 

marriage for a year. I told you 
that before. He died before the 
year ended."

• • • a'
There was a alienee In which 

little by little Barry’s misery 
spent Itself. Here was Mona, lov-
ing him whole-heartedly, the past 
explained away. She had come 
to him of her own accord, since 
she guessed rightly that he would 
not seek her out. i
They would be married tomor-

row! They would go to Port of 
Spain and the consul could per-
form the ceremony. Was there 
anything Irregular about marry-
ing one'a aunt? Steve and Lot-
tie cou!d be the attendants. They 
could live here’ always in happi-
ness and peace. Why not?
Mona stirred .Ip Barry’s arms. 

She laugVed a little, happily.
"Will you marry me, Mona? 

Right away?"
He could feel her atlffen sud-

denly at the words.’ "J can’t do 
that, Barry."
"Why not?”^*
"Why do we have to think 

about that now? Isn’t It enough 
that we have found each other 
and under stand each other?"

"But I don't understand yoq, 
Mona;" Hla voice was hurt, puss- 
led. "You aa!d you loved me and 
now you aay you can't marry me! 
Why?" •Jm.
She did not answer for a' mo-

ment. "I have something I must 
do first, Barry/' she said-slowly. 
, "You mean you must go home 
first?" j, 7 .yi
She shook her head at .'this, 

then slowly nodded. "Maybe. It 
might be necessary."

"There isn’t any reason' why 
you can’t marry me, is there?” he 
asked quickly. "Uncle dldifi 
bind you in any way? He didn't 
specify that you could never mar-
ry me—"

"Not exactly.. He said—"
“Then It’a the money!"
She nodded agreement and Bar-

ry’s expression hardened. "You 
mean If you marry me you’ll for-
feit your right to the fortune?"
Aa the girl did not apeak he 

went on again, "la that what you 
mean, Mona?"

"If ^marry anyone, Barry."
"You mean you lose the money 

and you care for that? It means 
more than your love for me? Is 
that what you’re trying to say? 
Tell me you would rather have 
this money than marry me! Tell 
me!" He shook her fiercely.
"You don’t underBtand." Mona 

began. "I do want to marry you 
some Unify. Bui ifot now!’.’ / >,
"Why, not?" Hls^tolee wip 

harsh, '"ts It because you want 
to enjoy your fortune a lltti" 
longer? Mona, can’t you take me 
as I am With what 1 have to give 
you? Isn’t that enough?"
‘ "Do you own half the mine. 
Barry?” she a*kod deliberately. 1

• • •
He considered thl*. "No," he 

said',""But what has that to do

with It? I'm not starving. You 
wouldn't starve as mv wife."
"Do you own Holiday?"
"Part of it. Holiday In figured 

In with the rest of the property. 
Steve own* more than half. 1 
thought I explained that. The 
sale of the Empresn ‘ clinched 
things. For a while—at leant un-
til I'm 30—I’m rather In Steve’s 
stewardship, so to apeak. He ha* 
more power In any measure than 
I have but that doesn’t mean any-
thing bersuHe It's Steve! It Isn't 
as though he’d ever try to do any-
thing I didn't approve."
"If Steve should die tomorrow." 

Mona said slowly, a "the mine 
would belong—more than half of 
it and more than half of Holiday 
—to hls heirs. Have you thought 
of that?’’

Barry pressed hi* face down on 
her shoulder. He said slowly, 
"Why think of death now when 
we can think of each other?"

"You see, Barry, If I don’t mar-
ry you right off perhaps I can 
think of a way to help you!"

"80 that’s your plan!" Barry’s 
voice rose In dismay and disdain. 
"Do you think I'd let you help me, 
Mona? Do you think I'd take a 
cent of that money—?"
"Why not?"
"Because I couldn't! Mona. 

Mona, forget all this! What do 
you care for money? We have 
enough. Do I Ipok so poor? Let 
the money go to the cat hospital

(Continued on Psao U.V } '

Quotations
Private capitalism 1* better 

than any other system.
-' Franz von Papen, chancellor of 

Germany.
• • •

Johnny (Weissmuller); moved 
out lant week and If We ever meet 
again it will be a* total strangers. 
—Mrs. Johnny Weissmuller, for-

mer Bobbe Arnat of the stage.

Actlvltie* of the farm board 
during (he pant three year* have 
been prejudicial to the cotton 
market and hare contributed to a 
large extent to the low price level. 
—Oscar Johnston, cotton planter 
who operates 50.000 acres at 
Scott, Miss.

• • •
As a matter of national policy 

the shortening of hours Is neces-
sary not alone to meet the need 
of the moment, but It may be 
necessary to take up the slack in 
the future from the vast and sud-
den advance In lahor-navlng de-
vices.
—President Herbert Hoover.

I was so nervous and excited 
and hopeful of winning inside 
that It made me sort of dead on 
the outside. /
—Georgia Colematt,, Olympic div-

ing champion, after winning.

20 Years Ago
All work on the construction of 

the new dam of the Escanaba 
Traction company at Grooa was 
completed last week and the big 
imlllary power statiQU to the 
regular power works has born 
placed In commiaaion.

Judd Yelland has purchased 
the building at 1119 Ludlngton 
street, where the Morning Press 
was given Its being, and will re-
model It. ' ''■

Announcement has been receiv-
ed here of the death at Marquette 
of Mra. Matilda Hodgkin, mother 
of William and Harvey Hodgkin 
of Escanaba.^ She came to Mar-
quette In . 1849, and llved- there 
continuously after date except for 
a few years spent at Deer Lake, 
where her husband was superin-
tendent of the furnace,

Atty. James H. Clancey, for-
merly of Escanaba and now of 
Jackson, where he has been estab-
lished for Several years In the 
practice of .hls profession, has 
been named as chairman of the 
county committee for the Nation-
al Progressive party In that coun-
ty. Mr. Clancey enjoys the dis-
tinction of being, the only Demo-
cratic prosecuting attorney ever 
nominated and elected in Delta 
county. ’

OUR BOARDING HOUSE
I By Ahern
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FRECKLES AND HIS FRIENDS

Biwcc
POODLE 
HAS BEEN 
TAKEN 
TP THE 
hospital

FRECKLES 
HASN’T 
BEEN HIS 
OLD SELF 
AT ALL....

YT
By Blosser

\NELL,COME IN, OSCAR.-IM 
(3LAD VHJ CAME- FRECKLES 
IS CERTAIULY DO^W IN 
THE DUMP$.-PERHAPS 
VDU COULD CHEER 
HIM 
UP
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.SEE!I CANT 
IMAGINE WHY 
HE TAKES IT 
So HARD ••••••
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TRlCkS? HOU6A OLD

Boy feel Today
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BOOTS AND HER BUDDIES By Martin
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WASH TUBBS By Crane
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(JW6 MINUTES LATER HE COMES ABOARD VJITH THE LAST OF 
THE MUNITIONS.

UP WITH TH* 
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BOUY BOYS. 
WE'RE OFF.
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ASK NEW BIOS 
FOR MERIES

EscanabaStoreswill Turn 
In Figures on Food 
For Next Month

Bida will recalred 8®pt. 12 for 
fomUhln* frocarloa and. meats 
on Bncanaba dty welfare depart- 
tnent orders during the month from 
Bept 15 to Oct 16, city manager T.

;

F. Kessler announced yesterday,
The welfare department Is Just 

completing its first month under 
the new plan, In wlilch tho contract 
for filling city welfare department 
food orderB_was awarded to the 
store making tbe'lowest bid on the 
basis of the amount used the pre- 
ylous month. The .•contracts run 
for a month, and new bids to be re- 
calred Monday are for the ensu-
ing month beginning Sept. 16. 
Charles Gator was the successful 
bidder the first month, .with eight 
or nine Escanaba stores submitting 
proposals, j

There are appr^l^tely 169,- 
ooo.ooo acres of forest reserves 
In the United States and Alaska.
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HNGADINE

Kngadlne, Mich. (Special)-Eng-
lish services will be held In the 
Engadlne township hall at S:00 
p. w. next Sunday night. Rev. K. L. 
Hurfelnd will offytato.
Harry Click of Manlatlque. Is vis-

iting at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Burnett.

Mrs. Cecil Elllotte returned homo 
last Tuesday after a two weeks vi-
sit wllh friends and relatives lu the 
Lower Peninsula.

Clarence Collins left here last 
Monday ror ^.ransUqoe where she 
will attend high school.

Mrs. Leonard McGraw returned

here this week after a two weeks’ 
visit as the guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Oorsche of Manlatlque.
The Misses Rita, Erma and Km 

ma Boucha and Miss Evelyn Mc-
Graw. who are attending the Man 
istlque high school, spent the 
week-end with their parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Boucha, and Mr. and 
Mrs. James McGraw.
Harrold Ward of Newberry la I 

guest at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Butler.

A crude submarine, to be pro-
pelled by oars, was constructed 
over 300 years ago during the 
reign of King James I of Eng-
land.

FIRST TIME, («»•.* 1 ,

Value for

MEXICO’S NEW 
PRESIDENT

Backed by a large majority In 
both houses of the Mexican Con-
gress, General Abolardo L. Rod-
rigues, above, secretary of war, 
raised to the presidency following 
the resignation of Pascual Ortlx 
Rubio.

THEATRES

TO ORGANIZE 
CHORAL CLUB

Musical Organizations to 
Meet Here Monday 

Evening
Organisation of a Community 

Choral club will be effected at a 
meeting to be held at the W. W. 
Oliver Memorial Auditorium Mon-
day evening at 7:30 o’clock.

Dr. Otto H. Bostrom of Mar 
quetto will address the meeting on 
the subject of "Community Choirs’’ 
Tho .high school orchestra of 20 
pieces will furnish a musical pro-
gram.
The following choirs are coop-

erating in ihe project: St, Joseph's. 
Calvary Baptist, Swedish Mlssionv 
St. Patrick's. First Methodist. St. 
Stephen’s Episcopal, Bethany Luth-
eran. Swedish Methodist churches, 
and the Woman's Club Choral Un-
ion.

OBITUARY

"Play . Girl,” with Loretta 
Young, and "Tho Man Called 
Back" with Conrad Nagel, are the 
features of the double attraction 
program at the Delft ‘theatre to-
day and tomorrow.
"Play Girl" Is from an original 

story by Maurlne Watkins, author 
of "Chicago" and many other 
stage and screen hits. It was 
adapted and dialogued by Maude 
Fulton, the amazing lady from 
Kansas and New Orleans who has 
been successful as pianist, ac-
tress, story writer, playwright, di-
rector and theatre manager.

Miss Watkins has chosen a big 
department store as the principal 
locale for her story of young love, 
ambition, disillusionment and fin-
al adjustment to life. Mlsa Young 
plays the part of Buster, a clerk 
in the big shop. Rollicking Win-
nie Llghtner is Georglne, her fel-
low worker and roommate. Bus-
ter is filled with determination to 
succeed on her own Initiative. It 
Is the unexpected advent of a 
good-looking youth, a devil-may- 
care playboy, who makes his live-
lihood by gambling, which chang-
es her plans. He starts her out 
on an adventurous, changing love- 
guest which Is compelling and 
genuinely feminine.

‘ ^p-to-datc

2. Nearly 800 
pages; size 5j4x 
7#;.40,000 
words. •

3. 840 line drawings 
and half-tone illus-
trations.

**• ?f

Actual size, 6x8 inches.
Morocco Grain Keratol—Green, Red. and Black.

A cast of famous screen players 
has been assembled by Tiffany 
Productions for the many roles In 
Its latest dramatic feature, "The 
Man Called Back.” Heading the 
roster is Conrad Nagel, popular 
star who has been absent from 
the screen for almost a year, dur-
ing which time he has been mak-
ing a national personal appear-
ance tour.

Conrad Nagel plays the stellar 
role of the English surgeon who 
fights his way back to success In 
Andrew Soutar’s stirring story, 
originally known as "Silent Thun-
der.” Opposite him, In the char-
acter of the lovely woman who 
aids him In his battle for regener-
ation. is Doris Kenyon, the strik-
ing blonde star of many screen 
hits. In leading roles are seen 
John Halllday, seasoned stage and 
screen player; Juliette Compton, 
the statuesque brunette; the exo-
tic Mona Marls; Reginald Owen, 
stage actor who has Just conclud-
ed a starring engagement In the 
Broadway hit, "Child of Manhat-
tan"; and Mae Busch, whose 
screen followers are legion.

The deflation has hit Holly-
wood a terrible blow. Some of 
the biggest moguls now have only 
one yes-man.

..

. vr* * ,>. .. .. - i.ir*;/*■ J. d

4, ,19 full page engrav 
ings.

£ An English - 
paper suitable1

6. Bound in
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reproduting-illustrations.

What Others Say
“Webster’s New Stamford American Dictionary is a most 

admirable internal arrangement and of a convenient form for 
handling. It is one of the most satisfactory dictionaries of

your

Our over-cautious statesmen 
shoud bear In mind that the world 
will forgive an occasional error If 
you bat out enough home runs.

DOUGLAS TAKT 
Funeral services for Douglas 

Taft, son of Mr. and Mrs. Garland 
Taft of Osier, who died Wednes-
day afternoon in a local hospital 
were hold Thursday afternoon 
with burial In the Rapid River 
cemetery. The baby who had been 
til from birth was a twin. Ar-
rangements were In charge of the 
Alio funeral homo.

MRS. ANGKLINE LEROUX 
The body of Mrs. Angellne Le- 

roux was removed Thursday 
morning at 10 o’clock from the 
Alio funeral home to tho home of 
William Lavlgne at 610 Superior 
avenue, Gladstone. Funeral ser-
vices will be held Saturday morn-
ing at 9 o’clock at All Saints’ 
church, Rev. Father Sebastian 
Malor, pastor, officiating. Burial 
will be In Fernwood cemetery.

MICHAEL J." KEHOE 
The body of Michael J. Kehoe, 

42, who died Tuesday at the Ed-
ward Flynn home In Harris, 
where ho had resided for 16 years 
will be taken by way of the Soo 
Line leaving this morning to En-
terprise, Ont., Canada, his former 
home, where services will be held 
and burial made. The body which 
was taken to the Alio funeral 
home, is remaining there at tho 
Chapel until this morning.

DOTY MESHIGAUD
Funeral services for Doty Mesh- 

igaud, 68, well known Indian guide, 
will be held at the family home In 
Harris at 2:30 o’clock this after-
noon, with Rev. Lewis Shanks of 
Hermansvllle officiating. Burial 
will be In the Indian cemetery near 
Harris.

Press Want Ads 
Accomplish Mach.

Cost Little,

I

WAKE UP YOUR 
LIVER BILE—

WITHOUT CALOMEL
And Yon*n Jump Oat of Bed in 

(he Morning Barin’ (o Go
If you fool sow and ounk aod tho world 

looka punk, don't owmllow a lot of aahs, 
mineral wator, oil, laxative candy or chewing 
gum and expect thorn to make you euddenly 
iwoot and buoyant and full of aunahlno.

For they can't do It They only more tho 
bowolo and a mere movement doeen't get at 
the ante. The roaaon for your down-and-out 
feeling la your livor. It obould pour out two 
pounda of liquid tilo into your bowolo daily.

If thia bflo ia not flowing freely, your food 
doeen't dlgoot It Juit decay* In the bowel*. 
Gao bloat* up your otomach. You have a 
thick, bad toot* and your breath la foul, 
•kin often breaks out In blambbo*. Your head 
achoo and you fool down and oat Your whole 
■yotom is poiooood.

It take* tho** food, old CARTER’S 
LITTLE LIVER PlLlA to got three two 
pounda of bile flowing freely and nuke you 
(eel “up and up." They contain wonderful, 
hamlem, gentle vegetable extracts, amaxing 
when It comae to making the bile flow freely.
But don’t tsk for liver pill*. Ask for Carter’! 

little Liver Pill*. Look for the name Cartar'e 
Uttl* Liver Pills on the red label. Raeent a 
•ubetituU 26c at all stares. ©1M1C.1I.Co.

mndling,, it is one of the most satisfactory dictionaries 
which I have any knowledge, and I'congratulate you on yc 
success.' —JAMES R. DaY, Chancellor Syracuse University.

“Well graded, comprehensive aild carefully adapted for the 
pufposetjiiitended, The School Editions, in accuracy, concise-
ness, typography and convenience, surpass anything in that1 

ERWiP .- '34*1 •line, heretofore published. For ready help and everyday use
- - - - - -.-.J pin seal gramtyratol With’gold' on ones desk, this Edition leaves nothing to be desired.”—

stamping, round comers, with-red stained edges. James J. Keogh; Dean of Sj. John’s Cathedral and Secre-
Headbands, in the shelf-back iriinre durabl^ ^ ^ D—School Board. M„wJuk(e. ' 
duough constant Artistic green paper jack?

7. ,The system, of diacritical mailings msrkes pro- 
mmeiation simple and easily ‘understood. The
same sounds ^ire always indicated by the same
’7mboh>

.'
. ...... . . . . uI Rnlei for Spelling 

Word Analysis

8. Definitions are simple, terse, and dear. They are
given in the order of their importance, the modern
and common meaning bung.given first.

Hail Orders ■’
V .kw

Aviation and Aeronautic Terms World War Names 
Radio and Wireless Terms Fofeign Phnin

Abbreviation, in Common Use ,.Compound^ 

Simplified Spelling . ' ^tda and
Dictionary of Biography Tables of. Con vert ion
Dictionary of Geography c t.i.

AddlOc 
for Postage

r ~
:

A SAVING OF OVER 60% i l ■

Proofreading Symbols 
Biblical, Classical and Mytholog-

ical Name,
Greek Root, •
Latin-Roou

Mail Orders 
AddlOc 

* for Postage

r • .i'' 'll- l t . stole in the union. Only through a special arrangement with the 
'acturer ts the publish ef able to offer you this EXTRAORDINARY VALUE at a SAVING OP 60%. 

Call at tbu office jor your copy NOW—A VOID DISAPPOINTMENT.

AO a 4 w

••

Vi

TOr truly wonderful dictionary is based bn the. original Websterr-and other eminent authorities. It has 
ooenawarded gpldmedals and diplomat 4, World's Expositions. This dictionary, in the school edition,
V myd wtth gratifying results tn eve~> -- ai.-- l „ --- - - - - ..,
mdndfacturtr is the pub
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COMSTOCK will take Michigan out 
of the Red.

COMSTOCK

ill.-

COMSTOCK 
will chisel the 
barnacles from 
the Ship of State

COMSTOCK advocates a program 
of Reforestation of the cut over 
lands of Upper Michigan.

WIN with COMSTOCK
U. P. Comstock for Governor Committee

Paid Political Advertisement

GIRLS*
AM White

TENNIS SHOES
59«pf
For Cysts

BOYS* GYM 
TENNIS SHOES

£V- ■'.

49c

'> fupli-
■i&m*

Prlntedi Cotton
Wash Dresses

v» '
Sensationally LowPricedl

Treat Yourself to a BIG Bargain!
Grace!al RATON

Night Gowns

Good4ooldnf bcey 
or toflooed styles 
with appMqw — 
yooH find thorn defi-
nitely oouof4be>or-
d inary at this fried

Mothers! Herts GREAT VdmeJ
Zepfayr and 
Pompadour

Sweaters
Jor otdy

79*
Daintydurable, too 
—equal to the hard 
service active 2 to 
6’ers give them!

V::
OFF TO SCHOOL-

Snuardy Crossed 
FOR LESS!

Porky

PRINTS
Sizes

RuMout«.« • Asm 
effects... trick ctA- 
lars nWryftonr 
else that’s oka and 
Hoassnl at tltifl 

I

J. C Penney Ca ^
Where Thrift Sets the Faefclaa

•■ft i—' .

1020-22 Ludington St 
Escanaba

—r
'Oflf. •f/ii i _ .*iy fjU
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Garden Man Finds 
Long Lost King

Garden. Michigan. (Special) 
While rutting aunfloWera In 

• three am* patch Thursday, Felix 
Peterson. Garden township far-
mer, saw something glittering on 
the ground. He stooped, and 
picked up an eighteen carat, gold 
ring. Ho did not have to wonder 
mm to the owner for li- remember 
rd distinctly the rlrnnnstances of 
Its loss twenty six years ago.

Nearly thirty years ago, Miss 
Hulgt Bylund a .1 engaged to Mr. 
Peterson’s brother Axel, who gave 
her n ring with his own name en-
graved on the ihildcty I^atsr Ihey 
were married and the bride re-
ceived another ring. The two 
mm aubaequently went to work 
In the wood*, leaving their wives 
to do the farm chores. ‘ Mrs. Xxel 
Peterson was feeding hay to the 
cows one day. when, unknown to 
her, the engagement ring, which 
was a trifle.large, slipped off her 
finger. As soon a8vrhe policed 
Its I'I who 11' household
participated in a long and diligent 
search In and around the hart), 
hut It was futile.

Several, ywi later. Mr. Peter-
son tore down the old barn and 
rebuljt on n new alte, uglnjc the 
old site for growing various farm 
crops. During thoae many yeai 
many crops Imve been raised. The 
mowing machine, hlndsri plow, 
harrow and cultivator have been, 
over the ground repeatedly, turn-] 
ing it over ami stirring It around 
hot nothing was seen of the ring 
until Thursday when It was per-
haps lying In exactly the position 
that It was 1-ft when upturned at 
Hi" time of the last cultivating 
some weeks ago. Nol u scratch 
Is on the ring, neither Js U-tar- 
nlshed. The inscription Is ns dis-
tinct as the day upon which It was 
made.

In the meantime, soon after,the 
loss of the ring, .Mr. and .Mrs.'Axel 
Prdcrson moved out to N. Dakota 
where they have since been opor* 
ating a farm mar Alinont. Pro-
bably they often think of the ring 
hut not with the hope of ever

THE ESCANARA DAILY PRESS

ARMY AND NAVY SIGN AN ATHLETIC TRUCE

yr*1

■mi

't

The greatest show In the collegiate sports world, with colorful pagentry and traditional rivalry as 
West Point cadets and Annapolis midshipmen! battle, parade and cheer on the football gridiron, is to 
be resumed this year as the result of agreement between the two academy heads shown above. Rear 
Admiral Thomas C. Hart, right, of Annapolis, and Major General William D. Connor, left, superin-
tendent of West Point, have resumed athletic relations after a five-year break over eligibility rules. 
The scene shows the army cadet corps o»t the field In a folorful mass demonstration during the last 
meeting ofjthe two academies. 1 * M

finding It. They do not yet know 
that It Is found but in all proba-
bility. by this tithe, it will be 
speeding across the continent In 
the mulls on Rs way to Its owner.

Mr. and Mrs. Emil • Thibault

OF NATURE WILL BE 

REVEALED TO YOU I

Announetmtnt

NEXT SUNDAY,
September 11, in

\‘ST The Milwaukee1
JOURNAL

FIRST- by Metii

To the Democratic Electors
m

of the Eleventh 
Congressional 

District
As a candidate for

. V, A....

the Democratic nom-
ination for Represen-
tative from this dis- 

. trict, I will appreciate 
your support and vote 
at the coming primary 
election. - « ' - - - - 

v' If nominated, I in-
tend to make a vigor-
ous campaign for the 
I)cin<® ratic ticket 

throughout the . dis-
trict.

If elected, My endeavor will be to do my part in easing 
the heavy burden of taxes now imposed on the Ameri-
can people, with due regard for the Government's obli-
gations.

1 believe that a change in administration will be of 
great benefit to the country, that the presort Republi-
can administration lias been tided and found wanting 
and that a new and vigorous administration fresh from 
the people is the need of the present.

1 stand squarely on the Democratic platform.

PRENTISS M. BROWN
Politic*! Advcrtiaratmt) a*

left hero Friday for their homo In 
Iron Mountain utter spending a 
week at the home of the former's 
parents, Mr. and' Mrs. Aristides 
thibault.

-Miss Grace McPhes of Wil-
mette, III., Is visiting at the home 
of her mother. In Van's Harbor.
The Ladies’ Aid Society of the 

Fayette Congregational Church 
held their meeting Saturday after-
noon at the home of Mrs. John 
Watchorn.

Mr. and Mrs. Dayton Beardsley 
spent the week end with friends 
In Munising. They were accom-
panied by Miss Jane Lapins who 
jvent on to her homo at Mason- 
vllle, remaining there after spend-
ing the summer In Garden.

• Mrs. Ed Goff left here Friday 
for Los Angeles, Cal. where she 
expects to. spend the winter. Sho 
expects to stop oft and spend a 
few days In Chicago.
A farewell gathering was held 

Friday night at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Vernon Hazen of Kate’s 
Day In honor of Miss Jane Leplne 
who left subsequently for her 
home at Masouvllle after spend-
ing the summer with friends here. 
Various garaea were.played after 
which refreshments were served. 
There were between thirty and 
forty guests present.

Mr. and'Mra./Amy Lasalle and 
family of Iron Mountain spent the 
week end at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Delphlus Lamotte.

Mr. and Mrs. Cyrus Lamotte of 
Niagara, Wls. spent the week end 
at (he home of Mr. and Mrs. Dsl- 
phius Lamotte.

Mrs. Karl Peake of Newberry 
spent Sunday at the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Moso Bou-
dreau. ^
:i Mr. and Mrs. Richard Daly and 
Mrs. Galnno ajso Mr. John Ed-
wards left for their homes In De-
troit and Windsor, Canada, Sun-
day after spending two weeks 
With relatives in town. Mrs. Acle 
Tatrow and son Bobby went with 
them and cro remaining for a few 
days. Mrs. Edwards Is remaining 
in,Garden for an extended visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Mose Rock of 
Hunt’s Spur spent the week end 
at the homo of Mr..and Mrs. Eu-
gene Bernier.

r
'L

St. Francis Hospital

Jamei Rotrow of Gladstone 
submitted to an operation for re-
lief from appendicitis,

Mrs. Tim:Crowley, UIJO North 
Eighteenth HtmM, Is n medical 
patient.

Frank Richards of Wells sub-
mitted to an operation for relief 
from hernia.
‘ Thomas Grimley of Mnnistlque 
is a medical patient.

Patients dlsmlMCd are C. B. 
Oliver. George Van Horn. Felix 
DeMay, Lillian Harris. Mrs. Dona 
LaOlalre and baby and Mrf|. Ben-
ny Patrattes and baby.

It .would require 19 centuries 
to spend one billion dollars at the 
rate of one dollar a minute.

—

<P*M Political AdvrrtUnoent)

JOSEPH P. MURPHY
Republican Candidate for

CONGRESS
IF ELECTED:
Will devote all of his time to representing the 

11th District.
Will vote yes or no on every question.
Will not straddle or dodge any issue.
Will be your representative in fact as well as 
name.

Will take an active and aggressive stand on all 
issues affecting this district.

Will do his utmost to acquaint himself with his 
constituency and find out the things they need.

and means so!
1. {’

Earl Williams Has 
Typewriter Agency
Having dlspoatd of hi? interest 

In the Office Service Cti., of which 
he was one of the founders 12 
years ago, Earl Williams has an-
nounced the opening of a new 
typewriter dgency at 920'Ludlng- 
ton street, upstairs. Effective 
Sept. 1, he became district agent 
for the Underwood Elliott Fisher 
Co., and his territory will com-
prise the eastern half of the Up-
per Peninsula, with headquarters 
at Escanaba. Mr. Williams will 
work with tho typewriter division 
of the company, handling adding 
machines, typewriters and tmp-
pltuH,
W. H. Dickson, co-partner nnd 

co-founder of the Office Service 
Co. with Mr. Williams, has taken 
over the latter’s Interest In that 
firm, and Is now the solo proprie-
tor. . ..

Record Primary Vote Forecast; 
Delta Had 8,129 Back in 1930

j

IIY GILUKRT T. SHILHON
(AiioriatrS Prt«< Staff Corr»«p«nS»nt)
Lansing, {/pi—A' record-break-

ing primary election vote was 
forecast today by department of 
state officials. Their -estimates 
are based upon unofficial reports 
that registrations in Michigan 
have shot over the, 1,500,000 
mark.
A primary vote of 1,000,000 or 

more votes (s not unlikely, it Is 
believed. The previous high mark 
was two years ago when 853,050 
votes were cast In the gubernator-
ial primary.' Four years ago. In 
a presidential year, tho primary 
vote was only 6.09.713. In the 
1930 primary biliotlng 317,028 
votes were cast lit Wayne bounty. 
This year tho registration Is ap-
proximately 575,M0. Similar 
heavy advances In registration ov-
er both the registration and tho 
number of votes cast In thb last 
general primary have come In 
from nearly every section of tho 
state.

Likewise a new record for tho 
general November election Is 
looked for.4 Tho greatest vote 
over cast for governor In the gen-
eral election was In 1928 when 
Fred W. Green defeated William 
A, Comstock, Democrat, by more 
than 500,000. The total vote for 
governor In that election was 1.- 
374.341. Election officials pre-
dict 1.500,000 or more this year.
To achieve a vote of 1,000.00ft 

In the primary election the aver-
age county Increase must be 
around twenty per cent. Many to 
cal organizations, and many can-
didates, have urged the electors 
to not only register but to vote 
in the primary. Normally there 
Is fur less general Interest,In the 
September nominating election 
than in the general November bal-
loting, and this is particularly 
true In presidential years. How 
ever, unprecedented fields of 
Democratic candidates, with con 
tests in that party for almost ev-
ery Important nomination, may 
bring out a vote which ordinarily 
does not Interest itself In the pri-
mary.

In the previous record making 
primary In 1930 the vote for gov 
ernor, on all tickets, by counties, 
was:

Alcona. 1,441, Alger 2I')634, AL 
legun C.684, Alpena 4,676. An-
trim 2.G80.‘ Arenac* 1,897, Bara-
ga 2,779. Barry 4.5T8, Bay 13, 
727. Benzie 1.661, Berrien . 15. 
983, Branch 3.002. Calhoun 10, 
456, Cass 8,1'jl, Charlevoix 2,- 
804. Cheboygan 2,651, Chippewa 
6.143. Clare 2.231, Clinton 4,806, 
Crawford 862, Delta 8,129, Dick-
inson 7.315, Eaton 6,446, Emmett 
3,687, Genesee 26,672. Gladwin

2,278, Gogebic 8,510, Grand Tra-
verse 4.182, Gratiot 6,250. Hills- 
dale 5,250. Houghton 12,684, 
Huron 7.B42, Ingham 23,981, 
Ionia 6,161, Iosco 2,215, Iron 6,- 
030, Isabella 4,707, Jackson 14,- 
167, Kalamazoo 10,528, Kalkas-
ka 682, Kent 36,491, Keweenaw 
1,663, Lake 1.397, Lapeer 6.586, 
Leelanau 1,499,’ Lenawee 7,315, 
Livingston 5.612, • Luce 1,726, 
Mackinac 1,689, Macomb 15.684, 
Manistee 5.056. Marquette 6,532, 
Mason 3,511. Mecosta 3.716, Me-
nominee 6,611, Midland 4,261, 
Missaukee 1.830, Monroe 4,791, 
Montcalm 6;311, Montmorency 
1.072, Muskegon 11,198, Neway-
go 3.611, Oakland 30.674, Oceana 
3,289, Ogemaw 2,125. Ontonagon 
3.714. Osceola 3,607, Oscoda 517. 
Otsego 1,605. Ottawa 9,265, 
Presque Isle 2,809. Roscommon 
988, Saginaw 20,015, Sanilac G.- 
906, Schoolcraft 2,416, Shlawasee 
8.042, 81. Clair 14,103, St. Jo- 
seph 3,995^Tuscola .7,588, Van

U. P. Briefs ”1

Case Dismissed
Sault Ste. Marie---Jeanne Whit-

tier Lenox, who has been In the 
county Jail for a week charged 
with obtaining money under false 
pretenses, was freed Tuesday by 
Judge John A. Colwell who dls- 

( hurges against her.
Miss Lenox was arrested a 

week ago Tuesday night by state 
police at Marquette and was 
brought to the. Sault for arraign-
ment. It was charged she ob-
tained $100 from two Sault wom-
en on the promise that she would 
return to them at least $26,000 
from the sale of reducing courses.

(IQ Yeara In U. P. *
Menominee^-Sixty years ago 

today Philip Harter came tq Me-
nominee from Alsace, France. He 
was 18 years of agq. ’ Today, 
standing at the door of the shop 
which ho bUHt 12 years ago at 
613 Sheridan road, then 613 Main

Buren 6,730, Washtenaw 10,686, 
Wayne 317,028, Wexford 2,987.

FillDAY, SEPT. 9, 1932.

street, he reflected on tho chang-
es which Menominee had under-
gone since 1872.
When Philip Harter. 18, came 

to Mtnomlnee with ills unde, 
George Harter, of the clothing 
estnbllshmont of Harter A- Hor- 
wlthi Main street Was a bumpy 
sawdust road, dysty when dry, 
soggy when wet. He went to work 
«■ a ahbemaket for John Horwlth 
In the Horwlth shop at 431 Main 
street, where tho Menominee 
Plumbing & Heating Company's 
simp Is now locate.I.

I ' glon Election
Iron Mountain--Carl G. Han-

son was named commander of the 
Bert Carpenter post of tho Am-
erican Legion Klngsford, at tho 
annual meeting of the organiza-
tion.

Other officers ’named were 
John Krnmln, first vlc^-eomman- 
dor; John Bampsn. second vtce- 
commnndor; Kingsley ■ Learned, 
adjutant', Arne Voge, finance of-
ficer; Vila! Payant, chaplain: 
Dudley Morrow, historinn, nnd 
Augur Chatcll, sergoant-at-arms.

Pheasant eggs numbering 30.- 
780 wore distributed from Mich-
igan state hatcheries this season.

; IT PA¥b TO TRADEiVTi U:

The City Drug Store
}f,‘ no? j^mcToN'sT.

Escaliaba's Finest Prescription Pharmacy

Gerardine
Puts a natural wave in 

straight hair.

12.10 Value

;;

Buy Early 
t Quantity Limited

Pylora
Tooth Powder

A combination of 
soda, salt and aro-
matics—an excellent 
dentifrice for chil-
dren or adults.

Large 
tin v*

"3$gJv' V

Having, Cream
A quick, firm lather with 

a fresh pine fragrance. 

Makes even a dull blade 

do better I

Large
tube

Nyal
Corn Remover

MTAii

S5U

Stops pain instantly 

—and removes corns 

with a few applica-

tions. Try it tonight.

2tVs .Monnon's - . 
Talcum 1for ; li/C

80c Modes* 
or Kotex. _ 23 c
85c Odorono 
Liquid 'T 29c
85c Cut ex . 
Nafl Enamel 29c
50c Rubbing 
Alcohol lng 39c
At.pirin Tab- 
lets, a doz. 19c,
35c Crtstorla 
for children 27c
50c Milk of 
Magnesia ! 39c
25c Blue Jays 
for Corns _ 19c
(10c Llstorlnc 
Antiseptic^ 
for '^1 39c
25* Squibb 
Epsom Salts 19c
25c Llstorlnc 
Tooth- ‘
paste_ _ _ _ i-( C

50c f)r. West 
Tooth 
Brushes . 39c
*1.50 Pinkliam's

<on" $1.19pound __

SI.25 Parkc-Davis 
Oxl Liver AO^
Oil —5/oC

Montgomery Ward & Co.
1200 Ludlngton St. Phone207 Escanaba, Mich.

MEN! A Sensational Value Achievement! 

WARD'S SURE R-PiONEER

Work Shir®
New Improvements 
Superior Quality . 
Double Elbows . •

“What! A better PIONEER 
work shirt for 49c! Impossible!” 
—exclaimed shirt manufactur-
ers when we told them what we 
wanted. But we went on look-
ing and now offer the new Pio- 
,he&r\— finer * wearing,better 
looking — more comfortable. 
Check SUPER-PIONEER’S fea- 
tur^fv.-v you’ll agree it’s the 
finest shirt you’ve seen for 40c.

FACTS
1. Lined, rounded cuffs.
2. Button-down pocket 

flap*.
8. Ventilated arm-pits, 

; reinforced. -
4. pearl button*.
5. I>oublo 3:00 fine 

yarn chambray.

Rugged Pioneer 
Overalls — 
Mill Shrunk

' r
The Lowest 

Price Ever 

Offered 1

2:20
Ini!
seams.

blue den- 
Triple 

Strain 
points , bar- 
tacked. Plenty 
of big pockets.

Boys’ Sturdy
• . - »

Blue or (tray
Workt^iliS

39c
Famous
Pioneer

Quality
: M a d e. f r o m 
fine yarn 
o h a mb r a y. 
Strong seams. 
Full cut. Deep 
pockets. Laun-
der and wear 
well.

,/

Men’s Moleskin 
Pattern Pants 
-Long Wearing!

89c
Sturdy 8 
Ounce 

Weight 
Cotton!
Ruggedly 
made! Full 
cut, well tail-
ored and rein-
forced at strain 
points. Warm.

^pi’s 'Cot® 
Lightweight 
Union Suits

Elastic

R i b Cuffs!

Sturdy

Stitch ing!
Comfort able 
weight for 
year around. 
Good quality 
rib knit. Sizes 
36 -46.

New Fabrics 
And Stylesjj 
Men’s Caps

49c
Unbreakable 

Visors! Ray-

on Linings.
Genuine leath-
er Bweht bands. 
Well tailored, 
will retain 
shape. W i t h 
and without 
flaps.

Heavy Weight 
“Mechanic” 
Work Socks

Full Length! 

Full Size! 

Reinforced!

Made 
cotton 
3-thread 
pie

of fine 
yarn, 

"trip- 
wear” toes,

and heels. 
Ribbed tops.

Boys’ Pioneer 
Overalls and 
Sturdy Jackets

149c
Each • Garment

2:20

Blue

Weight

Denim
Mill shrunk 
fabric. Triple 
seams. Strain 
points bar- 
tacked; Plenty 
of blg'pockets.

Men’s Heavy 
Moccasin Type 
Work Shoes 
];$j,98

m

4

Oak Leather 

Soles! Long 

W tra r i n g!
Made of black 
retanned leath-
er. Comfort-
able blucher 
last. Rubber 
heels.

Stripe Canvas 
Work Gloves 
-Leather Palms

19c
S

Double 
W r i 
Bands!.. 

Serviceable!
D u r able 
striped cotton 
canton flannel 
I) a c k s. Full 
size In every 
way. Split lea-
ther facing.

{{- j M ih i ooii
*•*'
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Michigan Farmers Not 
Likely to Join Strike
FT 8AM B. MeOOOL

Airrlmltural leaderti of the state 
today expreiaed the opinion there 
is lUtU danger of a general "farm 
strike” in Michigan. •• ,

Although one eource reported 
the morement of grain the slow-
est in several years, all were 

v. agreed the Michigan farmer is lit- 
HI tie likely to Join in a movement 
“ to picket the highways or Join in 

any similar activity associated 
with a strike. Any bid for higher 
prices is more apt to be a quiet, 
individual, curtailment of selling, 
leaders said.

While other leaders were say-
ing they had seen few signs point- 

e lag to a concerted effort to force 
an advance in the price of farm 
commodities through strike meth-
ods, Herbert H. Powell, state com- 
mlasioner of agriculture, depreci-
ated the principle of the move-
ment in the west. Although fav-
oring higher prices for farm prod 

' nets, the commissioner said he be-
lieved the object "can best be 
achieved by curtailed sales rather 
than by a complete strike.”
The doeest approximation to a 

strike movement in Michigan is 
the proposal to hold beans until 
the price has advanced to $2.60 
a bushel. Suggested by Rep.

' James N. McBride, of Burton, 
the plan will be aired before 
meeting of Central Michigan 
bean farmers at Corunna Sept. 10.
Two factors appeared to com-

bat any general strike in this 
state. The first is the diversified 
type of farming practiced here. 
Farmers with a variety of crops 
are less likely to interest them- 

Pl selves in a strike for one commod-
iFltjr.

Perhaps the most important 
factor, however, is the financial 
condition of most farmers. Lead-
ers frankly admit that the need 
of cash is too great on Michigan 

■ farms to permit a strike. Farm- 
* ers must sell to pay pressing ob-

ligations.
L. E. Osmer, general manager 

of the Michigan Elevator Ex-
change. said he had seen no indi-
cation of a strike movement al-
though "there has been the slow-
est movement of Michigan grains 
In ten years.”
‘ He’ attributed the tardy ship-
ments mostly to individual decis-
ion to withhold grains at this 
•time in the* hope that rising 
prices are on their way. r 

Lpuls A. Thomas, manager of 
the Michigan State Farm Bureau 
Services, Inc., said he had seen no 
evidence "of concerted action on 
the part of farmers to hold their 
crops off the market.” The Farm 
Bureau, he said, is taking no sides 
in tke^etrike issud although the 
preswent of the American Farm 
Bureau Federation. Edward A. 
O’Neal, recently denounced the 
movement. Thomas said that 
many farmers were storing their 
wheat but that their action did 
not appear to be the outcome of 
an agreement.

A. C. Baltier, extension special-
ist in dairying at Michigan State 
college who is in close touch with 
farmers, said: "Michigan farm-
ers generally'consider themselves 
fortunate in comparison with city 
people. When they read of the 
city breatt/llnes, any ideas they 
have of a strike movement gen-
erally detytfta."
"The farmer cannot succeed in 

his effort to increase prices by 
shutting off food from the con-
sumer," Commissioner Powell 
said, "While I am convinced that 
prosperity will never return until 
the trend starts at the bottom— 
with the farmer—I don’t believe 
a strike is the remedy. The farm-
ers’ object can best be achieved 
by curtailed sales through mutual 
agreement rather than by a com-
plete strike.”
'Michigan bean farmoas have a 

better opportunity of dictating 
prices than any other class of ag-
riculturists This i* not only due 
to the state's leadership as a 
bean-producing area but also the 
Relationship of the state crop with 
lational production this year. 
While the nation's crop is expect-
ed to decline about 24 per cent, 
indications point to a substantial 
increase in Michigan. Estimates 
range as high as 7,000,000 bush-
els In this state compared with 
about 6,760,000 bushels in 1931, 

• Three years ago bean farmers

held their crop on the advice of 
the state agricultural department. 
They were fortunate, however, ftt 
that time to have favorable mar-
keting conditions.

Onions are another crop In 
which M^hlgan* Is a leader but 
there have been no rsporta of 
growers Joining in a movement to 
restrict their sales.

Richter Is Ruler 
Of Tented Village 
At Bay City Park

Lansing—The mayors of metro-
politan centers would admit that 
when It comes to administrative 
problems they would have to take 
a back seat from W. L. "Bin" 
Richter. Richter Is superintend-
ent of the Bay City State Park.

Richter is mayor, chief of po-
lite. fire chief, municipal Judge, 
head of the board of public works 
and chief advisor to a tented city 
of from two to five thousand peo- lions

pie and which has a Sunday pop-
ulation oftentlmea of a hundred 
thousand.
And he Isq’t administrative 

head of a well organized city. He 
la mayor of a community whose 
population changes every week.
From June to September -th# 

Bay City State Park, consisting of 
less than 200Wres accommodates 
from 600 to WO00 tents, each of 
them with from two to five peo-
ple. The average stay of each 
camper Is a week so that they are 
constantly arriving and departing. 
As superintendent of the park It 
la Richter's Job to assign loca-

tor tents, to act as pollce-

—

cyinmversary
-w

ALLIED ADVANCE SLACKENS
On Sept. 9. 1918, the great 

'German retreat from the- posi-
tions won in their spring offen- 
elves was virtually complete, and 
fighting was principally of a lo- 
ral nature, with only minor ob 
Jectives.

Britiah forces advanced on a 
four-mile front south of Havrln 
court wood, taking position* 
which dominated the wood they 
had taken,the previous day. On 
oth^r eOctors of the British front, 
activity was confined to trench 
raids and minor gains.
An American advance which 

had been rapidly developing near 
St. Gobain was practically stopped 
by several German reserve divi-
sions.

French troops reported minor 
gains across the Croiat canal.
The westbound Canadian liner 

Miss&nabie was torpedoed in the 
Atlantic.

SPECIALS
For Saturday Only

man, to keep the place clean and 
orderly, to ensure safety for the 
bathers, to provide sanitary facili-
ties, and all of the other duties 
that involve the administration of 
a small city.

Every week Richter holds 
court,” when he serves aa Judge. 

Jury and officer. Then he irles 
to iron out campers' difficulties 
and correct those who have brok-
en park rules. *>

Campers, however, represent 
but a small prohortlon of the peo-
ple who make use of the

fact that this park Is near a large 
center of population Ita annual 
attendance figures • far exceed 
those of any other park In Michi-
gan's system.

COOKS

Warm Sundays will see ofton 
100.900 people crowded along the 
bathing beach. Because of the

Cooks. Mich.—Mrt. Frank
Sandberg of Rhinelander. VVIs,. 
Mrs. Clarence Simmono of Detroit 
tnd Wm. Deuparo and families 

park, were entertained at a chicken sup
per at the Louis Londb home at 
Garden Sunday evening.

Mrs. Clarence Simmons left

Monday for Rhinelander. . Wl«., 
where she expects to visit her 
•liter. Mrs. Frank Sandberg for 
a couple of weeks.

• Joe Griffin and son Jack. Geo. 
W. Orgy and Herb Gray left Sat-
urday evening by motor for Chi-
cago, where they attended a ball 
game.
. Mrs. Geo. Hoffman of Milwau-
kee arrived Saturday to visit her 
father Geo. Roberta Sr. and oth-
er relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Sandberg 
and sons of Rhlnslander. WIs., ar-
rived Sunday to spend tabor Day 
with Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Deuparo 
and family.

Mrs. Chester Feak, Mrs Nellie 
Couslnesu and Mrs. Wm. Deuparo 
motored to Escanaba Thursday, 
from there Mrs. Teak went to 
Powers, and spent the day at. the 
sanatorium, where Mr. Feak is a

• -
A marriage ceremony In Japan 

consists of passing a cup of wine 
18 times between the bride and 
groom.

It Is said that five million years 
ago the sun weighed about twice 
as much as it does now.

- Cost Uttle,Press Want Ads 
Accomplish Much.

Unbleached Muslin

,6”"’27c
86 In. wide muslin. 
For Saturday only,

A real money saver.

WOMEN’S HOSE
pair

Chardonlae—Improved dull rayon—Dainty 
and fashionable. New fall ahadse, all Mms.

BOYS’ SWEATERS

All wool slliiorer style in hovelty stitch. 
Assorted colors, an outstanding value.

END TABLES

. 97c
Attractive designs In solid walnut, 

expect to pay at leastwould
jnlce.

You 
twice our

COTTON BUNKETS

,'44c
Single blankets In 70x80 sixe. 
signs in a variety of colors.

Plaid do-

BLEACHED SHEETS

39c “ch
Hemmed cotton sheets in double bed sire, 
81x90. Practical and servioeable.

CLOTHES HAMPERS

Large site with hinged cover woven of 
rock elm splint, colored, chain woven in.

KITCHEN STOOL

49c
Sturdy, all steel 
white and Ivory.

kitchen stove

V -
in, colors

Montgomery Ward & Co.
1200 Ludinffton St. Phone 207 Escanaba, Mich.

88000 Slander Sait 
Menominee—Summons in a 

$6,000 damage suit alleging libel 
and slander against Alex Bouty 
of Powers, county probation offi-
cer. by Supervisor Frank J. Ko-
walski, First ward, and Royal J. 
Harris, Spalding garage operator, 
were filetf today in Circuit Court 
here.
The otril jtctioa was fHad by 

Kehaoth O. Doyle of the -Doyle
Jaw office, counsel, far Mx

Glove Fitting and •
Fashion Conscious—

ARCH
SUPPORT SHOES

These Famous Friends of Tired Feet 
Have Unusual Health Features 
^ Found Only in the Highest 

Price Footwear!

ttm-

■m
STRAPS
OXFORDS

Why pay more than 88.98 for Arch Support Shoes when 
Foot Hcntth offers all the comfort, style and quality 
•f higher price Footwear? light, built-in STEEL 
ARCH SUPPORT renders restful relaxation. Orthopedic 
last and Goodyear Wingfoot live rubber heels. COM-
BINATION LASTS. Narrow at heel and ankle to In- 
sore perfect fit."

WIDTHS A TO D. SIZES 4 TO 9.

Men’s Black Dress 
Oxfords .. $1.98
Black calf, grain hlucher, 
composition soles, leather 
heMs. Goodyear welt. Sites
6 U- 

Boy’s Black Dress 
Oxfords .. $1.49
Black calf grain, blnchcr 
style, No-Mark Composition 
aoIm, rubber heels. Pally 
Hned. Sices 1 to 8M.

Men’s Horsehide 
Work Shoes $2.98
Brows horoehMe appers, 
heavy oil treated leather 
soles, rubber heels. Good-
year welt. Sises 6 to 11.

Men’s Oil- 
King 16-in.

Boots
$5.98

Rrewa •II- 
taaacS mar*, 
hcavr •*! ittmt- 

I « a t b « > 
aalaa, taatkrr 
baala. Gaaijraar 
wait. Slaca S 
ta 11.

I ■■■■■

ifei-V

Misses’ Sturdy
Oxfords .. $1.49

■ - •

Black or brown ehlf-grahi 
uppers, leather solas, rabber 
heels. Sises 11U tel.

Misses’
dren’s

and Chil- 
Patent 1- 

$1.00Strap..
Patent oeoter hackle 1-strap, 
gray trim, leather solAs, foot- 
shape last. Misses’ sises 11H 
to. a. Childrea’s $% to 11.

Infants’ First-Step
Shoes ..... 89c

*
Choice of Patent, Smoked- 
Elk or White Rlk uppers. 
Flexible rtltChdown soles, 
foot-shape last. Sises 2 to 8.

-

Growing

Oxford*
Black
trim,
heels.

Girh’ Btatk
$1.96

K2live eyelet tie, 
leather sole, j 
Sites 8 to 8. 'AM

!3M\

Growing Girl’s Pat-
ent 1-Straps $1.98
Center buckle 1-strap, trim-
med with contranting print, 
square toe. Sises 8 to ft.

■IN I —

Montgomery Ward & Co.
-l?Q0 .L»4is|tenSt : . _ fiacanaba.

WARD’S USHERS IN FALL 1932 WITH

What’s new in Paris and New York? What colors are smartest for 
Fall? Are the new Coats lavishly furred, or are they worn untrimmed ? 
What is the approved tilt for the new hats? Como to Ward’s . .. and 
find the answer to all your Fall clothes questions in this thrilling exhi-
bition of Fashion and Value!

Women’s Fall 
Footwear

Pumps. Oxfords and One- 
straps of suede and leather 
combinations. In browns 
and black. All sizes.

$1498 $2475

Full Fashioned 
Silk Hosiery

79c
Pure silk Golden Crept 
Hose In all the new darker 
tones for Fall! Chiffon or 
service weight. Picot tops.

Fur-trimmed and uiitrifnmed 
travel, monotone tweeds, 
and sports cerate. Dress 
Coats of hdavy crepes, peb-
bly weaves, suedo-surfaced 
woolens. In Browns, Bor-
deaux Wine, and Black. 
Sizes f 0 r Women and 
Misses, and Little Women!

Heavy crepes and pebbly 
woolen Coats with luxurious 
collars and cuffs of fitch, 
fox. Manchurian Wolf 
(dog). Cut in exquisite 
lines, with the new convert-
ible collars and unique 
sleeve details. Each one a 
beauty. Sizes for Women 
and Misses.

New Hats of 
Felts — Fabrics

$1.84

Have you seen the 
"boatera”—the bereta 
saucy bows In 
soft fabric hats 
them all!

new 
with 

front—the 
Ward’a has

,

Slip-on Gloves 
of Capeskin!

' $];.00

Well made, serviceable 
gloves that really wash! In 
the new brown shades to 
match your Fall costume.

Girls’ Jersey 
Dresses

Fine quality. Jersey in the 
new fall shades, appliqued 
designs. Sizes 2 to 6.

Novelty and light weight 
woolens, new crinkly crepes 
In silks, featuring the high-
er necklines, one-piece and 
jacket effects. In Havana 
brown, Bordeaux red, black, 
and other shades.

Exact copies of better 
dresses. Smart heavy sheer 
crepes, rough finished silks 
and new crinkle crepes. 
Novel sleeve treatments and 
necklines. The newest Fall 
shades of course.

Sizes for Women, Misses, and Little Women!

Ward’s Scarfs— 
Fine Rayon!

39c
Add color to your Fall cos-
tume with a scarf'of gay 
plaldi, otrlpes or conven-
tional designs.

New Pouch 
Envelope Bags

98c
Slim little bags with Innum-
erable handy pockets! Metal 
trimmings, novel clasps, and 
slide closings are features.

Children’s
Dresses

Attractive styles In fast col-
or prints. Ideal for school 
wear. Sixes 6 to 10.

Imagine! Daintily Trimmed
Rayon Lingerie

Choice
m

Sizes 1, 2, 3

Choice of Panties, Stepans, 
Regulation and Shorty 
Bloomers! New, dull-surfaced 
rayon. Appliqued 
designs in colors,
Peach and Pink.

Hand Embroidered
NIGHTGOWNS

; J

They’re entirely hand-
made-even to the 
seams and hems* Apr 
piqued —embroidered 
—hand drawn, and 
scalloped. In Flesh, 
peach, and white— 
with V neck.

- . ■
—

1200 LUDINGTON ST. PHONE 207 ESCANABA, MICH.
mmmmt
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I 1860
Phone thiH Number and 

ask for daily deliveries 

of—

BEST PASTEURIZED

DAIRY PRODUCTS
Milk - Cream - Butter - Eggs 

You’ll Appreciate the Fine Quality!

The Escanaba Dairy

Circle Specials
RO I,h. pack Dry 
Yellow ONIONS
for _ ___ _  99c
16 pound box 
Italian Blue 

I PRUNES _ $1.10 
I Wash. E 1 b e r fa 
TEACHES
box--- $1,15
Blue Mich.
.GRAPES, per
basket-- 13c
Home Grown 
Hubbard 
SQUASH, per
lb._ _ _ _ — 3c
Sweet Eating 
IR TJ T A BAGAS
j per lb.--- 3c
Firm Home 
Grown CAB-
BAGE. lb. __ 2c 
Swift's Hocklesa 
PICNIC H A M, 
lb.___ L_ 14c

U lb. pkg. Cel-
lophane wrapped 
BACON 10c

Dry Salt PORK 
per lb.--- 13c

McLaughlins 333
Santos Coffee,
lb.. . . . . .  19c
lay In your stock 
of thlc brand. 
Coffee Is going 

higher.

2 pkgs. Kraft's
Velvets CHEESE 
for- - - - - - - 27c

l can Banner 
White Moated 
TUNA —__ l?e
3 cads Yah
Camps KIDNEY 
BEANS ____ 27c
4 pkgs. Mothers 
Broad EGO 
NOODLES _ 25c

1 lb. Hemhey's 
Pure COCOA 26c 
1 lb. Amber 
Shelled WAL-
NUTS - - - - - 49’c
H lb. cake Mon-j 
archs CHOCO-[
LATE- - - - 18c
98 lb. aack Fins-
bury's Wheat 
FLOUR $2.70 
49 lb. sack Pllls- 
bury's Wheat 
FLOUR ~ $1.30 
24H lb. sack 
Plllsburys Wheat 
FLOUR — 69c, 
1 pkg. Gold Mt‘d-1 
h1 CAKE FLOURI
for- - - - - - - 25c
and 1 Cake 

Cooler Free 
1 lb. N. B. C. 
Salted CHEESE 
WAFERS — 32c

I

Royal grocerY
1701 LUDFXGTOX r.TFEET PHONE 1/V0161

Retailers of HlK*b Qrallty IYkwI Since 1907

(ways Best in 
the Toast Test!

SmmiMIm It tMak, MfSaUlwU 
thin aDtl eriap aom* •»r*t I." • it kurnaS. Th.tr.m- you fane?, 
CrandaMthor'a hroaJ la your 
broad for tooatla«. Thera ara 
aittoeu kind a of ASP'r atm 
brooda. mada dally In onr Mod-
em bakarleo and ru.hed to one 
aloroa. Look among lit# loaret 
on onr brand eonntor—tboro'a 
•no that acnotly aulta your tnaatlng atooda.

Grandmother’s Breads
HOMX-MADB

FLAVORPOTATO BREAD 
PAN ROLLS and'plufft 

CARAWAY RYE . . . 
SWEDISH RYE . . V
WHEAT BREAD OR tmSLICKD

51% WHOLK WHBAT FLOUR 48% WHITE

j TWIN LOAF 1 ;
( GERMAN RYE..
—and these values

1SOZ.
LOAF 5c

16 OZ. 
LOAF

16 OZ. 
LOAF

16 OZ. 
LOAF 
FLOUR 
14 OZ. 
LOAF
14 OZ. 
LOAF

4 TINS nn 
OF 50 8 Jl.08LUCKY STRIKE CIGARETTES 

GOLD MEDAL BISQUICK wo. 32c
ANN PAGE PRESERVES i™* fruit »5J> 33e 

MELLO WHEAT . 2 pkob. 25c;
RAJAH PURE CIDER VINEGAR . 2if£ 17c 

CAMPFIRE MARSHMALLOWS . lb. 15c
(School Tablet FRKE with Every Fnrchaac of Manhmallowt)

IONA CORN . 3 NO. 3 
CANS 23 c

IONA PEAS rULotMLrr?A*D •• * NO. 2 
CANS 23c

Onions, 10 lbs. • . • • . • 21c
Onions, 50 lbs. . • • . • 99c^

Fresh Fruits and Vegetables
Bananas, 3 lbs. . ^ .. 14c

Grapes, Basket • • • • • A 18c
Bushel Peaches . , . . • 51.50

LIFEBOUY SOAP b J CAKES 17c 
LUX FLAKES 2^190 ^1: 24c 
LUX TOILET SOAP J CAKES 25c

m
sSfe?;

McMillan news

To Detlirate (liurrh 
.McMillan, Mich.—The $1,000 

Catholic church hulldlng'thHt has 
been under construction the past 
three months will be dedicated 
Sunday.-Sept, 18. Fr. fichlevera 
of Manlatlqiie will conduct high 
mass and hla choir will sing after 
which the dedication will take 
place. A chicken dinner will be 
held In the church basement '' nt 
noon, and the public Ik Invited.

■ Other Xws Xotewi '
Mra. Carl Wallsteadt atfd Mra, 

Jay Tanner entertained • a few 
friends at the Wallatendt home 
Baturday evening. The evening 
was spent by playing bridge. Mra. 
X. K. Zejgler won high honors 
and Mrs. Emerson Bnillh low. A 
luncheon was served at the clone 
of the evening.* .

Joan Mnlnvllle was boat to 
twelve friends on hie seventh 
birthday anniversary Saturday af-
ternoon. Those present were, Ne-
ville Anderaon, Jack Wallsteadt, 
Harvey and Dick Brown, Donald 
Mclnnls, Forest Hanes,. Wayne 
Rmathera, Charles and Leon Holg, 
William Malnvllle, Malcoln and 
Herbert Smith.- The afternoon 
waa spent In playing games, after 
which a birthday luncheon was 
served. ' Jean' received many gifts 
from hla friends.
Sunday evening, members of 

the senior and Junior Epwortli 
League met In the church par-
lors of the Methodist Episcopal 
church. Jack MaHar 'and State 
Trooper Rheenahan of Newberry 
spoke on traffic and the World 
war. Rev. Alvin Doten of Mar-
quette will hold divine services 
Sunday evening, Sept. ,11.

Mr. and Mrs. W. B. Harkness 
and sons, Wilmer and Wilfred

left Sunday for Mt.^Corey, Ohio 
iii'l othor Iowpi- Michigan cities. 
. Frank Reese returned home 
Saturday after spending the past 
week at the home of Dr. and Mrs. 
Paul Wlllltts and family In Grand 
Rapids.

Dr. and Mrs. Z. W. Seibert left 
for their home In Crestline, Ohio, 
Thursday,.after spending the past 
ten weeks at the Jeaft Hanger 
Camp on the Tahquamenon river.

Willard Harkness of Lakefleld 
Is engaged In carrying the rural 
mall In the absence of his father, 
W. ii Harkness.

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Hanger and 
their guests, Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Wright of Milford, Mich., spent 
Friday at the Kltch-ltl-klppl (Big 
Springs) near Manlstlque.

Miss Mamie Taylor arrived 
home Saturday from Birmingham, 
where she has spent the summer 
with friends. She will he engag-
ed as teacher In the Seney

Middla Western
»n ,

Butter Bread
Finds Instant Favor With All Ages

Order Today From Your Food Dealer

schools.
Newberry callers at the Mana- 

klklk Lodge last week were, Dr. 
and Mrs. R. E. Spinks, Mr. and 
Mrs. Rhen, George Mackt, Miss 
Jennie Pohja. Mrs. R, K. DePot- 
tey, Misses Elma Carmen and 
Martha Molsla.

- Mr. and Mrs. Harold Buhl and 
son, Mrs. Mary ditcher and son. 
Glenn of Detroit, and Mrs. Winnie 
Scott of Saginaw arrived by mo-
tor Saturday and will be the 
guesta of Mr. and Mrs, Robert 
Bryers, 8r. and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Wright 
who have been the guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jess Hanger left Satur* 
day for their homo in Milford, 
Mich.

Mr. and Mra. Htrbert Bryers 
and son Herbert Jr., and daughter 
Harriet inn, who have been the 
gueata of Mr. and Mrs. . Robert 
Bryers, Sr., the past two weeks, 
have left for their home In Colo-
rado Springs. w

Miss Mary Pelletier of Newber-
ry Is the guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Francis Pelletier and family.

Mra. Blanch Lyons of Detroit 
and Mrs. Lillian Brownlee of the 
Soo are visiting their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Evan, north of Mc-
Millan.

Joe Schultz and W. A. Casey of 
Detroit and Saginaw left, Sunday 
for their homes after spending 
several days at the John Hanger 
camp.

Mrs. James Collins and chil-
dren have returned to their home 
In fhe Soo, after spending the 
past week at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Kalnbach In Lake-
fleld.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Bryers and 
children spent Tuesday at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Mc- 
Innta In Newberry.

C. E. Wyse of Detroit Is vaca-
tioning at Mannkikik'

ENSIGN NEWS

Special Fall FLOUR Sale
SEPTEMBER 7th - 10th

* *

Secure Your Winter’s Flour At These Low Prices

PIItLSBURY’S BEST
Biiy this Quality Flour 
Now at These Low PricesFloui

24% Pound Sack 
Pillsbury’s Best

FL O U R

49 Pound Sack 
Pillsbury’d.Best

FLcilK

98 Pound Sack 
Pillsbury’s Best

FLOUR

3 REASONS WHY YOU SHOULD 
BUY PILLSBURY’S BEST

Plllabnry'a Beet will never enuse

a baking fallnre—and even one
- ' *n ■*'.* ftei- ^v
failnre la to!i>, wponalve.

Plllobury'a In an unusually
rich flour—It yields more foods 
per bag, and gives a better flavor 
to everything you bake.

Pillsbury'a Beot Is a true all- 
pnrpose floor. Ton can use It sue- 
oOMfnlly for all your baking 
—bread, hiwmtts, cakes and pas-
try.

' - Secure This Flour Through the Following Local Dealers

Escanaba Dealers
ROYAL GROCERY 

UNDBERG’S CASH STORE 
SCANDIA CO-OP STORES 

• Main and Branch 
CENTRAL CASH MARKET 

PALACE MARKET 
N. T. STEPHENSON 

CARLSON’S GROCERY 
ROY NERBONNE 

ANDERSON'S CASH MARKET 
HANRAHAN STORES. BRANCH 

W. F. BREITENBACH 
WALTER JEPSON

AUGUST OLINGER & SONS 
F. X. FONTAINE 

M DELTA STORES 

EMIL VIAU 
PETE KOSTER 
A. D. RICHER 

CLIFFS CASH MARKET 
CHARLES GAFNER 
EHNERD’S MARKET 
LARSON & FARLEY 

FAIR STORE 
FRANK McGOVERN 

JOHNSON’S GROCERY, GROOS 
I. STEPHENSON CO., WELLS

Gladstone Dealers
* ELOF flANSON 

WHEATON’S GROCERY 
STAR GROCERY 

GUNTER’S MARKET 
G. G. ERICKSON 
P. J. UNDBLAD 
BESTWAY STORE 
BUCKEYE STORE 

QUI8TORF & HANSON

Rapid River Dealers
PETERSON l BERGMAN

MARKET
FALL HAT MODELS

STONINGTON NEWS

Enalgn, Mich.—County* Clerk. 
R. H. Labre, delivered primary 
election supplies In Ensign on 
Thursday.
The schools of Ensign Town-

ship opened Tuesday with the fol-
lowing teachers In charge. Hazel 
Froberg at Alton. Marian Shane 
at Silverdale, Evoglna Holm and 
Helen Ackley at Andersonvllle. 
The bus drivers are Ferdinand 
Sundberg. Chas. Porsman and] 
Hllmer Rudenberg.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Johnson 
have announced the marriage of 
their son Oscar, to Miss Martha 
Wright of Sault Ste. Marie.
Our local threshing machine 

owners, Stromqulst Bros, and 
Harry Olson are buty among tbe 
farmer/.

Xovr read the Classified page.

Here are two smart fall hats. 
Above Is a boat-shape turtle back 
of black velvet with veil. Below Is 
a moussellne de sole and sollle 
combination with rhinestone orna-
ment. (Associated Press Photo)

Bark River News

Bark River, Mich.—Mr. and 
Mrs. William DuRqrd and family 
of Niagara, Wls., spent Sunday at 
the A. DuBord Home.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Ray-
mond and daughter, have return-
ed from .Negaunee where they 
spent their vacation. Mr. Ray-
mond has resumed his duties as 
principal of the Sunnyslde school.

Ole Harstad of Kau Claire. 
Wls., spent last week at his home 
here. The HarsUfl residence is 
being enlarged and remodeled 
and when completed will be. a 
modern and attractive/home.
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph LaVigne 

’•eturned Monday from Milwau-
kee where they were called on 
account of the crltlcil Illness of 
Mrs. LaVIgne’s mother, Mrs. Dea- 
con.. j

Mrs. Michael Mallojr of Green 
Bay Is a guest at the home of her 
brother E. J. Bergman.

Mrs. Sarah McDdnald, Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Barry and children 
visited at the Michael Flynn hortie 
Labor Day enroutd ,to Niagara, 
Wls., where they visited Mr. Bar-
ry's relatives.

Miss Laura Shadahan is visit-
ing friends at Milwaukee and 
Waukegan, Ill.

Miss Viola Krutoh has resumed 
her work with the .Industrial Fi-
nance Co; at Escan»ba after a two 
weeks' vacation spfent at Spread 
Eagle and at her hbme here.
Miss Bernadette Boyle has re-
sumed her work as InstructOl&MI 
the Webster school, Escanaba.

Peter Blake left Tuesday for 
Ann Arbor In company with Mr.

Stonlngton, Mich. - — MrsTT. 
Krlrksen of Escanaba Is visiting 
with friends and relatives here, 
this week.

Mr. and Mrs. K. Vlau and fam-
ily and Mr. and Mrs. P. Robar and 
daughter Blanche were Sunday 
vlsltora At W. Anderaon'a.

Student* who have left for high 
school are, Ivor and Oliver Gran- 
skog, Ingolf Haugen, Eacanaba, 
and Roger Slmehaen. Gladatone.

Chaa; Williams ot Chicago la 
spending a few days at the WIN. 
Hams f»rm*Y»,;

Mrs, A. preone and children 
are visiting with Jos. Petersen ov-
er Labor Day.

N. Vlau baa returned from a 
trip from Chicago.

Mrs. Lucille Pierce arrived Fri-
day from Green Bay to visit .frith* 
her parents, her daughter Gloria 
who has been vacationing' here 
will return with her.

Mr. and Mrs.’, Herman Jacobsen 
and Mr.>nd Mrs. Harry Christen- 
sen are returning to Chicago 
this imrning, having spent Labor 
Day drcthelr. cottage. • ■

Mr.yand Mrs. P. Pedersen and 
famliy/ispent v Labor Day with 
friends In Marinette. >

Miss Pearl Lorenson l4ft Friday 
evening for Chicago U> spend her 
>acatlon.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Iversen 
and daughters of Newhall and 
Mrs. Aftld Johnson and Bobby 
Ranguette of' Escanaba were Sun*^ 
day .Ylallori 'at Capt. H. Slmen-I

Geo. Hbnherg has left for Cor-
nell whfre he will teach this year.

Schools Open
Stonlngton school opened on 

Tuesday morning. The teachera 
for the schools are as follows: 
John Towers, Rapid City, Mich.,. 
Central school; • Miss Helen 
Proehl, Rapid River, Bungalow 
school; Miss Selma Strom, Esca-
naba, Martin Bay school and K. 
Walfred Grnnskog, Stonlngton, 
South school.

Church Notices 
■ - '\r "Bethel Lutheran *
Luther League, Sept. 16 at 8 

p. m.
Trinity Lutheran 

Sept. 11 *
; Sunday school, 10:30 a. m.

Services and .Ladles* Aid at 
Pedersen Bros., at 2:30 p. in.

Practice meeting and teachers 
meeting Wednesday, Sept. 14 at 
8 p. m.

Star of Hope meeta, Sept.'18 at 
8 p. m.

A fcbok JACKET t;VBLE

If you want n decorative cart 
table save the gayest Jackets or 
your new books, and paste them 
perfectly flat, over the aurface o 
the table. Somttlmep it is wlai 
to use a heavy paper aa a basis foi 
them. The effect Isn't too blzarr< 
to be inteersting. The black an< 
white surfaces of the cards wil 
■how up quite as well against th( 
colorfulness as against the usua 
background.

and Mrs. Barney McGovern’. Mrs. 
McGovern will receive ’ medical 
treatment at the University hos-
pital.
The annual Guhbfest of the 

Swedish Mission church will be 
held at the church parlors Satur-
day evening. Sept. 17. beginning 
at 8 o’clock1,fl. S. T. The men of 
the congregation wlir present ^ 
program and are In charge of the 
arrangements. A very fine lunch 
will be served. No admission will 
he charged hut a free will offer-
ing will be taken up. The public 
is cordially invited to attend.

CARPENTER COOK COMPANY
.Wholesale Distributors

Treat Yourself To A 
New Taste Thrill

Order Today This Delicious New Pea

y OU coaid teste t thousand 

different brands of peas 

and find not one like Wig-

wam Green Giants. For Wig-

wam Green Giants are a sen-

sational new variety—a supe-
rior and exatted race. Try 

them ... you’ll pause, aston-

ished . . . such .peas never 

came from a can . . . there 

must be some mistake! How 

gardeny fresh, they are, how 

delicately tender, how lus-

ciously large! .Try them now 

—they’re at your grocer’s.

NO ONE ELSE 
CAN GROW 
THEM'

Nine years it has ti 
ken us to develc 
these remarkable ne 
peaa. Hundreds < 
scientific experimen1 
with every known vi 
rletr of garden pe; 
And finally—> ne 
pet, with qualitti 
never matched in Ni 
tore before! , . . w 
harvest these peas i 
the precise Instant < 
tender, fresh perfe 
tlou. Ne one else cs 
gifow or pack them.

mmmm
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BASKET
FEEL LOW? GO UP AND JUMP!

r<swrv^

V'<

.Serve Tomatoes
In Varied Ways

Tomatoes In soma form arc avail-
able throughout the year at prices 
within the reach of all of us. Every 
nomo-niaker should make the most 
of her good fortune, for wlu tii. r 
canned or fresh, tomatoes are good 
sources of all the vitamins.

Scalloped Tomatoes and Peppers
Knur rtpe tomatoes. 4 green 

peppers, 1 package Philadelphia 
rream cheese, 1 cup cracker 
■rumba. % teaspoon Salt,1 2 > ‘tea-
spoons sugar. 1-S teaspoon white 
pepper, 1 tablespoon butter,’ Mi cup 
milk. *?\ *

Scald and peal tomatoes and cut 
iu slices about one-fourth Inch 
thick. Wash peppers, remove stems 
and seeds and cut in crosswise 
slices about 1-8 inch thick. Put lay-
er of tomatoes In a buttered bak-
ing dish and cover with a layer of 
pepper slices. Sprinkle with salt, 
vigar and pepper and crumbled 
cheese. Cover with cracker crumbs. 
Repeat, layer for layer, until all Is 
used, making the top layer of 
cracker crumbs. Dot with bits of 
butter nhd pour milk over the 
whole. Hake thirty-five minutes In 
a moderate oven. Serve from bak-
ing dish. i.

• » •
Tomatoes and Mushrooms on Toast
Four large tomates, 2 sweet 

Trcen peppers, •; small onions. '4 
pound mushrooms, 2 tablgspoone 
butter, 1 teaspoon salt, 1 teaspoon 
sugar, 1-8 teaspoon pepper,' 1 
squares hot buttered toast.

Scald peel and chop tomatoes. 
Wash peppers and remove seeds 
and whltn pith. Cut flesh In thin 
strips. Peel and slice onions. 
Combine peppers and onions and

Feel low? Then fly high .and Jump. That's the. blues-shaking 
.formula of Mtp. Marte McMillan of Cleveland. Ohio. Mother of a 
.four-year-old daughter, Geraldine, who also likes to fly; Mxu. Mc- 
Millin made her first parachute Jump two years ago, "Just for the 
fun Qf It.’* She'a been, parachuting "whenever I feel I need it" 
ever since and recently tried for a new women's record by stepping 
out of a plane, at'26,000 feet, nearly five miles.

COLOR THE MENU

If your family Isn’t fond of veg-
etables. watefi .the color scheme 
when you servo them. Choose din- 
nor plates which are divided into 
sections and prepare each vegetable 
ns carefully.-and os colorfully as 
thought It IsYthel only one you arc 
lerjjnr. Rav^ crlspjoajt for the 
i sparagus, make sure the beets are 
as red as .heeu can be, rice the 
potatoes, or whip them into some- 
thing'huffy.

•,t. Canned Grapefruit 
Canned grapefruit Is just as 

appetizing as pineapple when 
served with meats.
Itf/fr HooklcM;Fasteners 
yjgtok now catf buy' hookless fas-
teners in different lengths and 
Colors. Next time you are making 
a dr^rw^de/jln ^e length of 
placquet and.Jmy your faatenef 
before you finish the seams to 
make sure it is just tbs' right 
ienftfi. ;

Mich. Canning. 
Fruit

At the Lowest Prices 
of All Times

MICH. PLUMS: Fancy large 
blue and red.
16 full quart crate —t/OC

BARTLETT PEARS (T»-S «Yr 
large size, bushel

RIPE TOMATOES: Fancy 
home grown? large QKik 
basket, 18 lbs._ _ _ _ Ot)C

DAMSON PLUMS: ^; J k
' 10' lbs._______ __-4DC
3 quart boxes__ ____   23c

WITH A COMPLETE LINE 
OK FANCY MICH. ELBERTA 
P E A C H E S AND OTHER 
FRUIT AT LOWER PRICKfl.

Madalia & Co.
719 Lodlngtoii St, Phone 309

m

.

'OU/L

*

order this natural energy

- . • • ^ ‘V' \1

1ITOB folks are mighty big reasons for serv- 
^ ing Shredded wheat. On the go every 
minute they need plenty of natural energy 

elements.. .exactly what Shredded Wheat gives 
th^m in full measure.
For Shredded Wheat is all the wheat. All its 

nourishing goodness. All the bran that Nature 
provide*. And in a most delightful form ... 
aolden brown biscuits with a teasing nut-like 
flavor that children love. Grown-ups, too. Try 
some, with fresh fruit and milk or cream.Twelve 
full-size biscuits in each package. The cost is 
juit ia few pennies!:\

NATIONAL &J5CUIT COMPANY
Uneeda Bakers '

cook lil butler over a low fire for 
ten minutes. Add mushroomi 
which have been peeled ami sliced 
quite thin. Cook five minutes 
onger and add tomatoes. Cook 
about fifteen minutes, until nil are 
tender. Serve on hot buttered 
tosat ’

• • •
Stuffed Tomatoes 

Four largo smooth tomatoes, 2 
cups coarse stale- bread crumbs, 1 
cup chopped cold meat. H 
spoon salt, >4 teaspoon pepper. 1 
teaspoon minced onion, 2' table- 
spoons melted butter, sugar, pars-
ley.
Cut a piece from the stem end 

of tomatoes and scoop out pulp 
with a spoon. Take care not to In- 
Juno the shape of the tomatoes. 
Sprinkle Inside with salt and In-
vert to drain. Mix bread crumbs

and meat. Add onion, salt, ptfppsf 
and enough tomato pulp to make 
moist with sugar and melted but-
ter. Fill each tomato with stuffing 
and arrange In a shallow baking 
pan. Cover tops with fine bread 
crumbs and put a dot of butter In 
center of each. Bako about twenty 
minutes In a moderate oven. When 
done slide n spatula or broad cake 
turner under tomato and lift care-
fully to hot platter. Garnish with 
parsley and serve.

Fruit Luncheon*— -
Fruit plates are ipuch more 

appetizing than vegetable plates 
us the Itasls of n luncheon on a 
warm day. An all-frull meal, once 
a week, Is approved by many peo-
ple as a health promotion meas-
ure.

Wherever you go, you 
find this mall that 

oifcells.aH others

DISTRIBUTED BY CARPENTER COOK CO.

Lindberg’s Cash Store
1309 Ludington Opposite New Junior High School

■ Specials for Friday and Saturday

Tl.. . 21c
White Birch Milk, 

tall cans_ _ _ _ _

Van Camp’s Pork 
and Beans____ OC

Van Camp’s Toma- 
to Soup __ _ _ _ _ _ DC

Pure Apple Cider Vinegar, 
Pure White Grain OQ/* 
Vinegar, gallon_ J uVL
- - - - - - - - - - - - t----
Gold Medal Softasllk Cakq

Flour, pkg.- - - - .Ca. 22c
1 metal cake cooler ''free

SPECIAL 
Kraft’s U lb. Vcl 
veeto, 2 for 27c
Dutchess Apples, bushel 30c

Bananas, 3 lbs. __ _ _ _ _ _ _ 18c
New Potatoes, pk.__ _ _ 10c

Dried Onitms, 4 lbs. 10c

Beef Pot Roast, lb.- - - - 9c
Round Steak, lb.------ 13c
•Hamburger, lb.- - - - - 10c
Pork Shanks, lb. ___ fle
Pork Shoulder, lb._ _ _ _ 8c
Pork Loins, lb. —--4— Hr 
Spare Ribs, lb. __LJ*— 3c

Lamb Stew, lb.------ 10c
Lamb Shoulder, lb. X 124c
Lamb Log, lb._______ 13c
Veal Stew, lb._ _ _ _ _ _ _ 8c*

Veal Shoulder, lb._ 4— 10c
Veal Leg, ,1b.___ r-e.— ,fic
Swift’s Hockless Picnics,

6 to 7 lb. avg., lb. 124c
Thuringer Sausage^ lb. _ 18c
Ring Bologna and Franks, 

lb. — - - - - - - - -—— 0c
Lard, 2 lbs.____ L__ 17c
Longhorn or Wisconsin

Brick Cheese, lb. ___ 18c
Fresh Fish, White or 

Trout, lb._ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ 18c

C&H Brown Sugar, 4 lbs. 23c 
C&H Powdered Sugar,

2 lbs.. . . . . . . . . . . . 13c
No. 2 cans Tomatoes,

3 for-- - . . . . . . . . . 23c
Nollngberg’s Toast,

2 lb. pkg. -- - - - - - - - 23c
Swift’s H.oz. Pickled Pig’s < 
Feet- - - - j._______ 10c

fVWWWW-WYW VVWWWWWWWWWS^

Main Store Phones
148 and 149

Branch Store Phone* 
; V 606 and 607

FRIDAY & SATURDAY SPECIALS
•V • •

* Vv'':

POTATOES: Fancy Home Grown, peck 10c; QQ/* 
bushel  - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - Qt/L

TOMATOES: Selected, Fancy Red, Ripe,

ORANGES: Very fine for juice, , 1 fip
dozen_ _ _ _ _ _ ___ _r_ _ _—__ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ AOU

CORN: New crop sweet tender Golden TAya
Bantam, dozen--- --- —--- ----- ll/C

■
COFFEE: We want you to try Our Baby Stewart fljl 

Coffee, lb. 35c; 3 lbs. .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ^A
.yd ■ Vy;':.• -7' <*,. ■ —
BUTTER: Every Friday and Saturday is Ol 
Bargain Day for Butter, lb. .... A 2 U

EGGS; Guaranteed Strictly Fresh, OO/»
dozen YL-,___ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

’.R* . . •

CHICKENS: Fresh killed, dressed ready for the pan, 
selected stock, weighed after they are An 
dressed, lb. :X--______ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ C

•We want your grocery orders, you will find at. o«r stores 
everything in Luncheon Meats, Fancy Package, Imported and

....

Super Suds
PACKAGE 9c

»»■'

Vinegar
- CIDER, QT. 15c

Escanaba IGA 
Stores Only

W.F.BREITENBACH 
DELTA STORES 
CHAS. GAFNEK 

PALACE MARKET l 
N. T. STEPHENSON 
CENTRAL MARKET

Rolled Oats ":A
.

A LARGE 9*7fl
M$ PACKAGES § V

Peaches 7^ T»s.^ 2i/, LB. 

M$ CANS 33c

Prunes 5 lb. S 25c

Apricots SrT 2 lbs- 22c
Sardines SSn 3tins 25c
Hominy

w

CAN 19c
Cocoa HERSHEY’S ^NLB-

i L -- ~ » X' > -

23C.|i

T.NS

U

’Mj? |h #

Kidney Beans IGA 2

Macaroni iga Spaghett
5 p*“aok 23cf 1 A*2

Soap
■**:

FRONTENAC
TRICOLOR

BARS 19c-

Catsup
IGA

14 OZ. 
BOTTLES

Vt LB. 
PKG.

Toilet Paper iga 9 rol^

FRESH FRUITS AND VEGETABLES

These Cash Specials Are For Friday and Saturday Only

CHICKENS 
Springers or Hens

16c lb-
RING BOLOGNA

9c lb.
FRANKFURTERS

.•v-'i .10c lb.
ONIONS
10 lbs. 19c

CABBAGE 
lie lb-

BLUE GRAPES 
Bskt. 16c

NEIGHBOR FLOUR

; 241/0 lbs; 49c ;
' JAR RUBBEI$ymm 

3 pkgs. 10c

Y PINJEL

. , ; 2 pkgs. 25c
BUTTER

lb. 21k

BUTTER KIST BREAD 

2 for 12c 

BACON, Sliced
lb- 15c ^
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PERSONALS
CLUB-

FEATURES- WOMAN’S PAGE •FASHIONS-
ACTIVITIES-

SOCIETY
-AMY BOLGER, Editor, Phono 692-

Gym Classes for 
Escanaba Women 
Open Next Week

Th* EBcanaba women’s gym 
cltBiea, organluitlon of which Iihb 
been planned under the direction 
of Mr*. Ben Undberg. will open 
this coming week, with clasBes 
Monday evening at 7:16 o'clock at 
the Escanaba Junior high school. 
Wednesday evening at the Eacana- 
ba Senior high school and Friday 
evening at the Webster school.
Women and girls of all ages are 

Invited to enter the claase§ with 
the exception of; 
school, who have their gym work 
as part of their regular classes, 
and will not be permitted at the 
evening school. Men will not bo ad-
mitted to the gymnasiums, and 
children will not be admitted un-
less accompanied by (heir mothers.
An offering to help defray ex-

penses will be taken each evening. 
Thia Is not compulsory and any-
one not able to pay 1* urged to lit 
tend regardless. Housewives and 
■working girls working throughout 
the day are especially Invited.
A regular program will bo follow-

ed during the season and all who 
register will be expected to follow 
thla as It is Impossible to tave dif-
ferent activities for different 
groups. Gym costumes may be se-
lected to suit the taste of the wear: 
er. but the wearing of tennis shoes 
on the gym floor will be compul-
sory. Women may attend the en-
tire series or a group of clauses 
as they wish.

Zanla Rivers will be gym teacher 
and Betty Pelletier will be pianist.

This Is the first general organi-
sation of women’s gym classes In 
Escanaba. also men's volley ball 
and kitten ball (earns have been 
active for same lime.

Sea'a/ - Club

Miss French Will 
Study At Sorbonne

Miss Florence French, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. E. J. French, 602 
Lake Shore Drive. Is leaving this 
morning for Milwaukee where she 
■will visit a few days before going 
to New York to sail for Paris 
■where she will enfer the Sorbonne 
for a year's study. Miss French will 
sail aboard the He de France which 
leaves Now York on Wednesday, 
September 14.

Linoleum does not have to be 
scrubbed so often If varnished or 
shellacked, then waxed.

Auxiliary Meeting 
The Ladles' Auxiliary to the An-

cient Order of Hibernians will hold 
a regular meeting this evening at 8 
o'clock at St. Patrick's hall. At-
tendance of all members Is request-
ed.

Social Meeting
The young people's society of the 

Calvary Baptist church will hold Its 
September social this evening at 
Ten-o-nlne cottage. Ford River 
Road, The meeting begins at 7:46 
o'clock. Refreshments will be serv-
ed after the program. The public Is 
cordially Invited to attend.

• a •
Guest* at Cottage *

Members of the Woman's Guild 
of St. Stephen's Episcopal Qhurch 
were guests of Mrs. W. J. Knorr 
at the Knorr cottage at Powell 
Lake near Munlslng oh Tuesday. 
Twenty members attended, mo-
toring to the lake for dinner and 
the enjoyable afternoon follow-
ing.

* • •
For Guest

Mr*. Gordon J. Glelch waa hop- 
less to a small group at an ova* 
ulna bridge Wednesday arranged 
for Mrs. C. H. Long of Chicago, 
who is the guest here of her 
mother, Mrs. Peter Him. Two 
tables were In play. . Mn. 0. C. 
Bartley had high score of the ave- 
ning, Mrs. Harold Grooi, second 
high, and Mrs. Lonf, third high. 
Mrs. Long was presented with a 
lovely guest prise.

• • •
Evening Bridge

A group of Escanaba girls en-
joyed a pot luck supper and eve-
ning bridge party Wednesday eve-
ning at the Compher cottage. Bay 
Shore Road. High score of the 
evening In bridge which follow-
ed the supper was held by MIhh 
Gertrude Moersch; Mrs. Ernest 
Black of Hammond, Ind., had sec-
ond high, and Miss Cafnerine 
Manley received the consolation 
award. »

, • •
St. Patrick's Guild

Fifty members of Bt. Patrick’s 
Guild enjoyed the regular meet-
ing held Wednesday evening be-
ginning at 8 o'clock In St. Pat-
rick's hall.
The business session waa fol-

lowed by a pleasant social time 
with Mrs. John Manning’s Circle 
In charge. Both bridge and five 
hundred were played and a tasty 
lunch served after the games.

In bridge Mrs. Charles Girard

Off ,HrV'0Hr "•'CK
/

It builds 
healthy bodies
Mother's Spaghetti 
ia easily digested. 
Stipplys strengtht 
Builds muac!r‘»! 
Children always 

like itl

MOTH E R S
S PAGHETTI

Tap, Aesthetic, Acrobatic, Ballroom 
Dancing

Advanced and Beginners Classes

Start September 12th
ENROLL NOW

Phone 501 or call at 705 Lodington Ht,, (second floor), be- 
, tween 8:30 and 5 p. m. Friday

i^P^'MABY B. CUTHBERT

Dresses
New shipments bring tp the 
leader Store new styles, new ma- 
terlala in fall dresses. Dresses for 
sport, street and, for evening 
wear. Correct In every detail. 
You’ll marvel at their fit, quality 
and the price. Sixes 14 to 48.

$3.95
New hats, hand blocked felts 
in the newer QQ
shades

Have you see the new suede
sport oxfords $1.98

The Leader Store
m*.'

WHERE jjpUB MONEY DOES MORE 

M43thSt.

had high score ami Miss Margarsi 
O'Connell, second high. Mrs. 
Henry Cloutier hud high score in 
five hundred and Mrs. Fred De- 
rocher received second prise. The 
guest prise wn* awarded Mrs, 
Mary Kelly.

• • * , ■). f '
HiiaIiich* Women** Club

A good attendance marked the 
regular meeting of the Rscanaba 
Business and Professional Wom-
en’s club held Wednesday evening 
at the Hotel Ludlngton. Miss 
Alice Kvam. president, was In 
charge of the meeting. Plans 
were made for study classes on 
art, music, and othur aubjects, 
during the winter months. A so-
cial hour followed the business 
meeting.

• • e's*
Birthday Annlvartary

Mrs. Carl Blomberg waa the 
guest of honor at a birthday anni-
versary party given )Vednesday 
evening at the home of her mother. 
Mrs, Davis. 600 North Nineteenth 
street.
Three tables of five hundred and 

two of bunco were In play, in five 
hundred Miss Dolly Cormier had 
high score: Miss Edna Mattson 
second high: afld Miss Helen Mur 
ray. low. Bunco awards went t» 
Mrs. Amanda Blomberg, flrat;*Mlt 
Bernadette Delorler, second am. 
Mlai Eather Foote, consolation, a 
delicious lunch was-served later In 
the evening.

Mrs. Blomberg received a num-
ber of lovely gifts.,

a > • • .
Paddy's Birthday

Paddy Carr, son of Attorney and 
Mrs. George W. Carr, 328 South 
Thirteenth street waa host to 
several of his little friends Sunday 
afternoon at a party arranged In 
observance of his fifth birthday 
anniversary.
The' little gnests played many 

games throughout the afternoon, 
enjoying, as one of the main fea 
lures of the party, a flab pond.
At the cloae of the afternoon a 

birthday lunch waa served. Table 
appointments were attractive in 
a color acheme of pink, pale green 
and white. A large pink and white 
birthday cake with lighted candles 
of green and pink formed the cen-
terpiece.
Paddy received a number of 

pretty glft«.
Hla guests were Raymond Mor-

in, Renelie Trottter. Gall and Glenn 
Lachspelle and Francis and Jackie 
Flan. ,

’ • • ’• iptf-r,
Coplan-Lewis

Mlaa Evelyn Coplau.^of Chicago, 
daughter of Mrs. Bessie Copaln of 
this city, 414 South Ninth Street, 
became the bride of Everett Lewis 
of Chicago at a beautiful ceremony 
perfonned Sunday afternoon. Sep-
tember 4, at 4:80 o’clock.
Following the ceremony a recep-

tion at which fifty guests were pre-
sent, waa held at the home of the 
bride’s brother and sliter-In-law, 
Mr. and Mn. Ben Coplan.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis left later on 
a honeymoon trip to French Lick. 
Ind., and Louisville. Ky. They will 
reside In Chicago upon their re-
turn.
The bride la a graduate of Esca-

naba high school and of the Clov- 
erl&nd Commercial college of this 
city, and has been engaged in sten-
ographic work in Chicago for the 
past six years. Mr. Lewis is a grad-
uate of the University of Chlckgo 
and is engaged in the advertising 
buslnees In Chicago.
Attending the wedding from this 

city were Mrs. Beasle Coplan, mo-
ther of the bride, Edward Coplan, 
Miss Zelda Coplan and Mrs. Sam 
Coplan.

DRESS OF DAHLIAS

Monica Bannister, 19-year-old 
Hollywood girl, was "dressed for 
the occasion" when named queen 
of the 13th annual dahlia ahow 
at Los Angeles. Her costume la 
100 per cent dahlia. (Associated 
Press Photo)

Church Events

s Full Qoapel Mission
Services will be held at the full 

Gospel Miaiion tonight at 8 o’clock. 
Sunday afternoon at 2; 80 o’clock 
there will be a meeting at the Pe-
terson home, 8oo Hill, Everyone is 
cordially invited to attend,

* e e
Stonington Oinrch Services
The Ladles’ Aid Society will 

hold Its next meeting on the Ped-
ersen Bros’, farm Sunday after-
noon at two-o’clock. The meet-
ing will be opened with a short 
sermon by the pastor. The pub-
lic Is cordially invited..

K. Knutsen, Pastor.
• • •

Christian Hdonee Churches'' .
"Bubatance’’ will be the subject 

of the Leeson-Sermon in all Chris-
tian Science churches throughout 
(he world.'on Sunday, September
fL
Among the Bible citations la 

this passage (Matt. 9:86)-: "And 
Jesus went about all the cities 
and villages, teaching In their 
synagogues, and preaching the 
gospel of the kingdom, and heal-
ing every sickness and every dis-
ease among the people.”

Correlative passages to be read 
from the Christian Science text-
book, "Science and Health with 
Key to the Scriptures,” by Mary 
Baker Eddy, Include the following 
(p. 136): "The miracle Intro-
duces no disorder, but unfolds the 
primal order, establishing the 
Science of God’s unchangeable 
law."

St. Petersburg 
Preparing for 

Busy Season
By JOHN LOOWICK 

St. Petersburg, Fla.«(Special)--' 
Nineteen thlrjy-three Spring 
styles to be worn by the fklrer 
sex. beginning with Easter, will, be 
shown In advance here this fpll and 
Winter as the annual Southland 
trek Into sunny St. Petersburg geta 
under way. following Labor Day 
marking the end of the summer 
season. ‘ v-

Style shows featuring the new-
est fashions In Spring wear will he 
displayed by living models In a 
terles of exhibits to be held in the 
inamoth Casino located at the end 

jof Recreation Pier. The^ modes are 
always worn In St. Petersburg 
jprlor to their appearance in the 
{North at the.close of the winter 
season.

All open air private and free pub 
lie schools from the Kindergarten 
to Junior College are now open and 
sunlight classes In which .both 
(etchers and pupils repair to the 
teachers and pupils repair to the 
bathing costumes are In-effect for 
two hours each day. In addition to 
the usual teaching routine, pupils 
are taught swimming and boating 
by trained educators. St. Peters-
burg’s calendar of smart social and 
•porting events for the coming 
season Is more extensive and ela-
borate than ever before. Charity 
Balls and daullng dinner dances 
will be held through the season at 
the' smarter • institutions, while 
tournaments for every known tour-
ist sport will be held through the 
long winter months.
The annual International 8t. 

Petersburg to Havanah Sailing 
race, the blue ribbon yachting 
classic of the Gulf Coast section, 
will be held April 14, 1933. Pro-
fessional golfers from every sec-
tion of the country will gather here 
for the 8t. Petersburg Open and its 
rich prizes In March.
Both the New York Yankee and 

Boston Brave baseball teams will 
return here in February for train-
ing prior to the opening of the 
1983 baseball season.
Deluxe hotels will open *in a 

brilliant blaze of colorful dinner 
dances l&te in December for the 
Christmas holiday season. Most of 
the 160 hotels* located here are now 
open, while hundreds of apart-
ments have been ready for weeks 
tor the initial rush from the north.

Michigan Tourists 
Michigan will again be represent-

ed by many tourists, who will be 
hero through the winter months, 
while reservations have already 
been received at the City Informa-
tion Bureau for others, who will en-
joy their first sojourn.
Most of the Wolverine residents 

who visited St. Petersburg last sea- 
ion will return this fall or In the 
Jarly winter. Those who were here 
from Escanaba and vicinity last 
season included Mr. and Mrs. A. P. 
Helntz and R. Stanley Jamieson of 
Escanaba; Mr. and Mn. A. C. Me- 
Carn of Cadillac; Mrs. Charles H. 
Watson of Cryatal Falls; Miss Lil-
lian FUege of Calumet; Mr. and 
Mrs. George A. Dunham of Manls 
tee; Mrs. Anna Goetchlun and Mrs. 
James M. Wilcox of Ontonagon 
and Mr. and Mn. Roy C. Hill of 
Grand Marais.

Personal News
TO BECOME BRIDE OF 

JOHN D. 3d

Births

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Bar of Bark 
River are the parents of a daugh-
ter, born Wednesday at 8t. Fran-
cis hospital.

BRING YOUR

FOOT ACHES 
AND PAINS

To a Licensed

Chiropodist and 
Foot Specialist

R. E. Scofield
Phone 447 for appointment or 
coll at Manning and Sullivan 
Shoe Store today or any 

Friday

Attractive Girls 
Models At Style 

Show Tonight
A group of attractive Escanaba 

and Gladstone girls will model 
fashion# of the fall season at the 
Autumn Style show which will fea-
ture the grand ball this evening at 
the Coliseum.
The models Include Misses Mar 

cella McGinn. Ethel Mary Murphy. 
Genevieve Louis, Marie Welch, Ur-
sula Johnson and Alice McGovern.
The ahow, which will be present-

ed in units, showing sports wear, 
street clothes, evening gowns aflcl 
furs, will begin at 9 o’clock and thi 
units, seven in all, will be present 
ed at intervals during the evening <. 
dance program. The models will n; 
pear’on a special runway constru ' 
ed for the show.
The dance program which w- 

begin at 8:30 o'clock will be pb i 
ed by Tomaesonl and his orihc 
tra. ,'A

GIRLS’ CHANCES BETTER

Girls have a better chance of 
J>eing married In Lexington. Mo. 
From now on, marriage licenses 
can be had on credltl

Evelyn Kapln, who has been 
employed in Minneapolis during 
the summer, has returned to her 
home here.

Miss Margaret Stack Is leaving 
tonight for River Forest, 111., where 
she will attend Rosary college dur-
ing the coming year.

Miss Orllla Perow has left on a 
vacation moior trip through the 
Copper Country during which she 
will visit with relatives and friends.
Jack I/oeffler, who Is a patient at 

Plnecrest Sanatorium. Powers. Is 
spending the week here visiting at 
the Otto H. Lbeffler home, 1406 
Second Avenqe South. - 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Brian have 
returned from a honeymoon trip W 
Mackinac Island and have taken up 
their residence at 318(4 Lake 
Shore Drive.

Louis Trotter has returned to 
his home in Whiting. Ind.. follow-
ing n few days’ visit here with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Trot- 
tler.

Mrs* J. J. Dwyer has returned 
from Calumet City. Ill., where she 
and Mr. Dwyer vlalted with her 
mother, who is 111 following an 
operation.

Misses Marjorie Nee and Jane 
Olavln will leave Sunday evening 
for New York to sail on Wednesday 
aboard the lie de France for Paris 
where they will study at the Sor-
bonne during the coming year;

Miss LaVeme Newman has re-
turned to Detroit where she Is 
teaching in the public schools fol-
lowing a vacation visit at the home 
of her parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. M. 
Newman, 323 Ogden avenue.

I. W. Smith and Thaxter Shaw 
are In Chicago on a business trip.

Miss Genevieve Manley has ar-
rived from Chicago for a vacation 
visit at the home of her parenls, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Manley, 1801 
Ludlngton street.-

Frank Pelland and daughters. 
Ermina and Alice of International 
Falla, Mian., are visiting St the 
home of Mrs. Ell Cllsh, 311 South 
Tenth street. The visit is the 
first In forty years for Mr. Pel- 
land and Mrs. Cllsh who are bro-
ther. and sister.

Miss Grace Bennett, daughter 
of Mrs. John Ward, left Thursday 
morning for Milwaukee enroute 
to River Forest, III., where she 
will attend Rosary college during 
the coming year. Miss Bennett 
is a graduate of Joseph’s high 
school, class of lv32.

Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred Ranger of 
Little Lake, who have been visiting 
at the homes of their daughters, 
Mrs. M. E. Powers. South Fifteenth 
street, and Mrs. A. J. Powers. 
South Thirteenth street, for several 
days, returned to their home Wed-
nesday. They are accompanied by 
Alice Flavin and Mr. and Mrs. A. 
J. Powers, who will visit In Little 
Lake for a few days.

Guests at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. A. L. Gabourle, 304 South 
Thirteenth street, who have left 
for their homes Include Miss Isa-
bel Gabourle and Ralph Gabourle 
of Milwaukee who weni here for 
a two weeks' vacation visit; Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Freeze and 
daughters, Mary Isabel and Stella 
Marie, of Chicago, who spent the 
Labor Day holidays here; Mr. and 
Mrs. A1 Yunk, Miss Anna Weber 
and Vern Voss, of Milwaukee, al-
so guests during the holidays; 
and Stafford Gabourle, jr.t. of 
Gary, Ind., who spent the summer 
here.

Favorite Recipe
Betty Ann

A recipe for canned tomato soup 
which will he a special treat for 
pry member of the tamlly oq cold 
winter days appears in this morn-
ing's department through the cour- . 
tesy of Mrs. W. P. Belanger. Mrs. 
Belanger, who rttjeivsd the recipe 
from her mother who useii It for 
many years is forwarding It to the ^ 
Betty Ann column following re- 
peated requests for It.

Canned Tomato Soup i 
Boll until thoroughly cooked one- 

half bushel ripe tomatoes which 
have been sliced but not peeled.
Chop fine fourteen stalks celery, 

seven medium onions and boll with 
fourteen sprays parsley.
Add thl« to tomatoes and cook 

jjlilUlYyou can put all through a 
sieve. ’ *V..
To thicken use:
Fourteen tablespoons sugar. 
Fpurteen tablespoons flour. 
Fourteen tablespoons butter.
Bight teaspoons salt,
Two red pepper*.
Two green peppers.
One-half teaspoon red pepper. 
Paprika.
Work flour, sugar, salt and but-, 

ter together. Can while hot and 
seal. ,
When serving add one-half cup 

milk or cream to each pint of soup.
Mrs. W. P. Belanger, *

• 606 South Tenth Street.

■ A green tomato catsup that will 
add to the enjoyment of your 
meats Is mode from the following 
recipe given the Belly Ann Depart-
ment by Mrs. Leo Griffith In an-
swer to Thursday morning's re-
quest. •

Green Tomato Catsup 
Slice one peck of green tomatoes 

and eight large onions. Put toma-
toes and onions with salt between 
layers and let stand for two hours. 
Drain and put In kettle with one- 
fourth pound brown sugar, one 
ounce each of allspice, cloves, 
ground mustard, two tablespoons 
mustard seed and two tablespoons 
black pepper.

Boll for two hours. Put through 
sieve and bottle.

Mrs. Leo Griffith.
311 North Twelfth street.

The wedding of Miss Blan-
chette Hooker .above), daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Elon H. Hooker 
of Greenwich, Conn., and John, 
D. Rockefeller 3d., (below), son 
of Mr.vand Mrs. John D. Rocke-
feller, Jr., Is to take place In the 
fall. Their engagement has Just 
been announced. Young Rockefel-
ler, bearer of a name famed In 
American finance, is associated 
with/ his father In business and 
philanthropic organizations. '

Black Outfit Worn 
By Mrs. Barkley

Washington, <#>)—Mt»: Alben 
W. Barkley has a dre^s of black 
chiffon faced In white with a 
short post to match. With this 
she wears a black silk coat with 
a gray fur collar. Her hat is of 
black straw with a narrow brim 
aud a shallow crown.

Diluting With loe 
Orange Juice is better for 4he 

system if it is diluted with water 
instead of being taken alone. The 
addition of a cube or two of lee 
helps the diluting process.

The very small prunes give just 
ns much food value when used for 
cream whip and are much cheaper 
than the large ones.

PLATINUM ROBINS?
.Not to be outdlne by Hollyvmod’s 

platinum blond stars, three rebins 
recently seen near Goderich, On-
tario, seemed to have gone plati-
num blonde. Their heads and 
breasts were' vivid as any robin’s, 
but their backs, wings and tails 
were platinum hued. They were 
found to be an unique type of al-
bino birds.
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Flowers for the Tabic 
Low bowls of flowers i))-^ 

much more suitable for dlnin); 
tables than tall flowers. They no( 
only permit the diners to talk di-
rectly to each other, Instead of 
nroivnd the roses or whatever Is 
being used, but they lend an inti-* 
mate note that Is more comfort-
able when ii few people are din-
ing together than a formal tone.

GRAND BALL 

STYLE SHOW
Tonight

Coliseum
1 O Beautiful Mn«Ws 
Ltd Gorucouri GlrL' 
Doors Open at 7:80 
Dancing at 8:80 

MUSIC BY

Tomassoni .
Style Show at 9 Hharp 

Ask for (<>un«*y Ticket at

Ffath’s Karmel Korn 
Shop

“It surely pays to use good soap”
“ffoto beautifully you've laundered the 

blankets, Dinah. They feel soft as dou>n.,f
“You sho said it, Missy. Dent blankets 

come out fluffy as a baby lamb tchen / 
washes ’em in American Fam'ly. Dot soap 
suttinly has a mos* mollifyin* influence on 
tooolens. And dere ain't a shrink ia itl"

Try American Family when woolens need 
Laundering. Use it once and you’ll use no 

blither soap. In hardest water it produces 
rich, creamy auds.. double the suds.» and 
it’s the doublesuds that makes the differ-
ence! Created especially for the hard water 
of this Great Lakes region, Kirk’s American 
Family is pure soap. ItconUins no free lye 
.. no destructive acids. . no harsh abrasives.

texture of fine woolens and actually floats 
out the dirt. You avoid all hard, harmful 
rubbing which invariably causes the fabric 
to mat and shrink and lose shape.
All woolens .. from the thickest blanket 
to the daintiest infants’ wear.. come from 
the washing soft, fresh and spotless when 
laundered in American Family’s pure, mild 
doublesuds. More than that, it’s the ideal 
all-purpose household soap .. for all laun-
dering and cleaning •. for woodwork, tile 
and linoleum .. the exclusive choice in 4 
out of 5 Gold Coast homes.
And it’s doubly economical.. particularly 
now that tha cake is so much larger, with 
quality and price the same as Wore. t

Cheap soaps are locking in 
real soap value. They often 
contain free lye that eafs and 
weakens fabrics .. roughens 
delicate hands. A big cheap 
cake may/boA like a bargain 
but the few-cents difference 
In price can’t begin to pay 

>rthe clothes it ruins.
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or whatever he wanted It to go 
Ja^to and marry mo!"
■ Thsre was a ruatle In the 
> shrubbery cloae by. Then a sha-
dow (lung Itself aeroaa the sand 
at their feet and separated from 
the clump of treen na If torn away 

•i i'.v KPiijeono’a hands.
' So this la where you are, Mo-

na! Why didn’t you tall me?. I 
went into your room for Home wn- 

', fen—ray thermos was empty^-and 
couldn't find you. I was worried 
stiff! You know those Hnnkes— 
oh, Barry! Wo’l, (hank good-
ness. I didn’t have the flro de-
partment out!"
"Walt Lottie. I'm coming." 

Mona rose from the sand ami 
walked slowly toward the girl in 
the pathway.
' "Bay, 1 don't want to Interrupt 
anything—" Lottie began uncer-
tainly.

"We've finished talking." Mona 
assured her.

' "Are you sure there Isn't any- 
y thing more to say?" asked Barry. 

"We'll talk it over In the morn-
ing, Barry.

"There's nothing to talk over. 
You can simply say ‘yes' or 'no.'"

Lottie interposed cheerfully. 
"Don't mind me. I'll run ahead." 
» ’"Let's wait until tomorrow, 
Barry. Please!"
"Say yes or no, Mona, tonight!" 
"Do you mean that?"

V* Ha nodded seriously, "I do."
' Then it will have to he 'no,'" 

the girl said slowly. "I'm sorry, 
Barry."

(To Be Continued)

Now read the nassirieO page.
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The Swallows Homeward Fly!

SWENSON BROS. 
STORE ROBBED

Burglars Get $20.00 in 
, Change from Cash 

.^Register
Swenson pros, furniture store, 

915 Delta, tfqs entered by burg-
lars and the dash registered rifled 
of 520.00 In change somo tfmo 
Wednesday night. Entrance was 
gained by Jimmying a back win-
dow. Thft burglars scorned 23 
pennies in the register and appar-
ently overlooked a dollar bill 
which was tucked in one corner of 
the drawer,
Thg burglars had a great deni 

of difficulty in prying open tl|e 
window. Marks of the bar cover-
ed the window ledge, the frame 
of the window was sprung and the 
glass was broken. The pieces of 
glass bad been carefully removed 
rad laid on an empty crate that 
<tood near the window. These 
pieces were liberally sprinkled 
with finger prints, through which 
officers hope to trace the burg-
lars.

After gaining entrance to the 
building the burglar bad evident-
ly gone directly to the register, 
taken Its contents and then left 
the building through the back 
door. That ho was unhurried and 
not greatly In fear of detection 
was Indicated by the fact that he 
had lighted several matches while 
removing the change. These 
burnt matches were found near 
the register.

Nothing In the store, other than 
the cash register, was disturbed 
and no effort had been made to 
open the safe which was near the 
register, a-

Police ond officers of the sher-

ffr. department arc of the belief 
’•I'ftt the crime was committed by 
.oeal persons. It Is apparent, they 
Mate, that the burglars were well 
acquainted with the layout of the 
store, ami also knew the move-
ments of the night patrolman. It 
Ik believed that a lookout was 
posted-.

Fingerprints taken are to be 
sent to Washington, where files 
are kept of all prints of criminals. 
If the crime <vns committed by a 
person prwviously ■ arrested bis 
identity will be known by the po-
lice within a short time.

BRIEFLY TOLD

Missionary Sorlrly«-A business 
meeting of the Young Women’s 
Foreign Missionary society of the 
Methodist Episcopal church will 
he held this evening at the home 
of Mrs. Nye Qulstorf. Ills Win* 
cousin Avenue. All members are 
urged to attend.

• • •
Beg Pardon—In the Plena 

yesterday an error occurred in the 
article telling of the sealing cap-
acity of Strom headquarters. The 
article read that there were ac-
comodations for 30. This should 
have been 300.

(Julies' Aid—A meeting of the 
Ladles' Aid society will |)P held 
this afternoon at the (’has. (Jus- 
tafson home, Perkins, beginning 
at 3 o’clock.

CITY BRIEFS

Mr. and Mrs. (ten. K .Johnson 
and daughters. Ruth. Dorothy. 
Joan and Pauline, spent Sunday 
and Labor Bay In Calumet at the 
homo of Mrs. Johnson's mother. 
Mrs. Teresa (Iherna. Miss Lee 
Oventil, of Chicago, who was ul* 
so vlsltlb’g there, accompanied the 
Johnson’s to their home here (or 
u brief visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bose had 
as their guests over Sunday and 
Labor Day. Mr. and Mrs. (’has. 
Engel, of Chicago.

Marlin O’Connell Is spending 
the week with relatives In Chi-
cago. He is expected to return 
Sunday. .

Dr. and Mrs. A. H. Klnmorid 
and daughter. Margaret, spent 
Labor Day at Marquette. •“

Mr. and Mrs. John Peters. Chi-
cago, have arrived to spend sev-
eral weeks at the home of Mr. 
ami Mrs. Walter Hansen.

Mr. and Mrs. Phil Hufford vis-
ited over the week-end with rela-
tives'In Munlslng.

Mr. and Mr*. Ollie Nelson were 
zuests of relatives In Bark River 
Wednesday evening.

Mrs. Victor Carlson and •laugh-
er, Mrs* John Bishop, returned 
Tuesday morning from a few 
days' visit at the Fred Sorenson 
home. Racine, Wls. Mr. Bishop, 
who is employed at Fond du Lac. 
Joined them In their visit at Ra-
cine.

Clarence McKinnon returned
Hcrvlee at Perkins—Rav. <\ K.; |ast night to Oshkosh. Wls..' fol- 

Olsson will conduct a service this | lowing a few days' visit at the
evening at the Bethany Lutheran 
church, Pei kins. The meeting will 
begin at 8 o'clock.

Vina and Raymond Wahowlak 
are leaving today for Kiln* where 
they will attend school after 
spending the summer months 
with their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Wahowlak.

homo of his sister, Mrs. Frank 
Nelson.

Mrs. Walter Hansen, wbfl sub-
mitted to an operation several 
weeks ago at the St. Francis hos-
pital.* Is getting along nicely.

Miss Viola Faster is returning 
this morning from a week’s visit 
wlth-w'lallves In Chicago.

Mrs. Lydia Swanson, son Irving

and daughter. Bernice, and Ed-
ward Jemjen of Washington Is- 
land, motored to Sturgeon Bay 
and (Jills Rook. Wls., to meet 
Chester Swanson, who has been 
visiting at Washington Inland for 
the past week. Wallace Jensen. 
Washington Island, returned with 
them for,a few days’ visit at the 
Swanson home.
• Mrs. ^ Samuel (ioldstclu and 
daughtera, Harriet and Vettn, are 
leaving today for S(. Paul after a 
few wpeks visit with Mrs. Gold- 
Stein’s son. Sid Gordon.

Boh Haberroon has arrived 
from East Lansing where ho has 
been attending school daring the 
summer term, for a few weeks 
vacation visit at his homo here.
- Miss Dorothea Johnson M leav-
ing today* to resume her duties ns 
teacher.In physical training . at 
Petosjiey. after spending the sum-
mer at the homo of her parents. 
Mr. and. Mrs. Soren Johnson/

Mr,, and Mrs.-John Wahowlak 
and children. Vina and Raymond, 
visited In Crystal'Falls Labor Day 
and were guests at the home of 
Mrs. (Wmiowink's sister. Mrs 
John La Plant. 1

Russell Skellhlger loft Mondn\ 
for Falrport where he will teach 
this year. •.
Walter Olson Is confined to his 

'tome. 909 Dakota avenue, for a 
few days with an Infected foot.

Miss Francis Gregory and Don 
Davis left Tuesday for their 
homes i» BgtlJe Creek, Mich., aft- 
?r vlsltfug-for « few days at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. W. S. 
Skellenger. The former Ik n niece 
of Mrs. Skellenger.

Mr. and Mrs, Wm. Crain and, 
daughter. Elaine, returned Wed-
nesday from a three weeks’ motor 
trip through 'Wisconsin. Minne-
sota, Colorado, and other states.

Demo Candidate 
Outlines Platform

COBBLER KNIGHTED

Clifton D. Hill, Alpena, candi-
date for the nomination to con-
gress on the democratic ticket 
spoke, to a capacity audience at 
the Torval Strom headquarters 
last night. His talk dealt entire-
ly with national issues, except for 
an endorsement of an old age 
pension.

Mr. Hill stated that the strict 
curtailment of federal expendi-
tures was one of the major planks 
In his platform and cited govern-
mental publications 0n various 
subjects ns waste of public money*1' 
He expressed himself as opposed 
tq centralization of too great pow-
er In the federal government.
He declared himself In favoi 

of repeal of the Eighteenth 
ntnendrtte'nfrTo be brought glfou* 
through the medium of a consti-
tutional convention, with Hie dis-
tinct understanding that Repeal 
would ho the only questlon^sub- 
mitted. The delegates to sorve at 
this convention would he fleeted 
by a direct vote of the people.

Candidate Hill stated that he 
favored Immediate cash payment 
of the soldier bonus, tarlffMjead- 
Juetment through an internation-
al trade conference, less property- 
taxes and higher inheritance. In-
come and excess profits taxes, and 
the establishment of a shorter 
week. He opposed cancellation of 
the European debt.

Tonight Mr. HIR will wind up 
his campaign in Delta county 
with an address at Escanaba.

SOCIAL

Rolf • Rasmuesen, 62-year-old 
cobbler of Kenosha. Wls., is Sir 
Rolf now. He was knighted by 
King Christian of Denmark In 
the order of Danebrog as a re-
ward for 25 years' -service as 
treasurer of the National Danish 
Brotherhood of America. (Assoc-
iated Press Phpto)

Drunken Driver 
From Ohio Goes 

To County Jail

Prospects for 
Alley Opening 

/ Are Not Bright

1 " . .

- •
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John Whitmore, Portsmouth. 
Ohio, was sentenced to 20 days 
In the county jail, upon his plea 
of guilty to a charge of drunken 
driving yesterday. Whitmore was 
arraigned before Justice A. T. 
Sohlberg.
Whitmore, who has been living 

at Kipling for several weeks was 
arrested late Wednesday night 
when he was found operating a 
car while under the Influence of 
Bquor. Whitmore had no driver’ 
license, but he maintained .this 
was not necessary since he was 
operating a car licensed In Ohio.
, The Jail sentence was handed 
out'WJieu Whitmore said he could 
not pay a fine of 550 and costs 

I !r>1 W^ftegged by the Justice.

That the Gladstone howling al-
leys will he open this winter op- 
nears unlikely, although some ef-
fort is being made to organize a 
bowling club to promote the . al-
leys. For the past several years 
the alleys have been operated at a 
loss, and S. W. Miller, owner of 
the Rialto building, states that 
unless he can make arrangements 
to lease the alleys on a basis 
where he will be repaid for the 
■•ost of pulling the room in shape, 
he prefers that the alleys lie idle.

Several bowlers have Indicated 
that they would be willing to 

s share In the cost of operating the 
aleys. hut the number In this 
group Is not sufficiently large at 
the present time to give any as-
surance that howling facilities 
will be available in Gladstone this 
winter.

To Open Library 
Hr On Two Evenings

Press Want Ads 
Accomplish Much.

Cost Little,

mmmm >wd

/The Gladstone 
will be open two nights each week 
for the accomodation of adult 
patrons, according to a schedule 
announced yesterday by Librarian 
"lornella Henderson. Each school 
ay of the week. Miss Henderson 

stateSr the library will be open

from 8:30 a. m. to 4:30 p. m. ahd 
public library on Monday and Wednesday eve-

nings from 7:0o to 9:uo o'clock. 
This schedule is the same as.last 
year. , ■»

Arrangements are being made 
so that adults coming to the li-
brary in the evenings will.not he 
d'sturhed by students.

THE big roan shot into the air. The girl used her spurs, clung 
fast. Dona Delo’s mastery of the spirited horse was but the 

first of a series of exciting adventures at her father’s timber 
camp. Kidnaped by a daring outlaw7, rescued, defying a group of 
angry men bent on a lynching, Dona is always in the forefront of 
action in the new serial, “Call of the West,” by R. G. Montgom-
ery. It is a story filled with thrills. Watch for it beginning Sept. 
15 in The Daily Press.

• .. ..y-- ./.,'\ • ■ ■
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HERE’S RELIEF FOR ■1^ 
STOMACH SUFFERERS

''■wa
m

Oi-Jo Sweetens Stomach,
.

Digests the Food, and
Stops Indigestion

FOR DELTA MEN
Rerouting of Highways 

-To Give Winter 
Employment

Employment for a cnnaiderable 
number of Delta county men is in 
prospect as a result of the deci-
sion of the State Highway Com-
mission to proceed with the re-
routing of FS-2 and 41 between 
Gladstone and Rapid River. The 
surveys of the new mute have 
been completed and it is expected 
that actual construction work 
will he under way within six 
weeks.
- According to the plans, (he 
highway la to he prepared for 
concrete from the city limits of 
Gladstone to the Rapid River 
bridge. Only the grading work Is 
to he done this winter, however, 
with the concrete work to he n 
part of the highway program for 
next year.
No change In the route Is an-

ticipated from Gladstone to the 
Days river. From the Days to the 
turn west of Rapid River, how-
ever. the route Is practically new. 
All of the sharp turns are to he 
•M'm I ns* ted and where the road is 
wlndii'c It is to he straightened. 
The roadway is also to ho widened, 
over Its entire route.
The new route will eliminlite 

two of the most dangerous turns 
on l'S-2 In Michigan. The road 
then will cut to the left of Mason- 
vMle, el'mtnatlng the sharp turn 
there; Both of these places have 
been the scene of many accidents.
The plan for ■‘construction are 

"ow being prepared and bids will 
he railed for within a short time.

Rev. Colenso Is 
Invited To Serve 
Here Eleventh Year
Rev, H. W. Colenso, for the 

past ten years pastor of the Mem-
orial Methodist church oK,Glad-
stone. was given the unanimous 
invitation of the church member-
ship to servo the parish for anoth-
er year, at the quarterly confer-
ence on Wednesday evening. Rev. 
Colenso has accepted the invita-
tion and,will remain here.

Rev. Colenso came to Gladstone 
In 1922 from Newberry, where he 
had been pastor of the Methodist 
church for six years. During h's 
oaatorate here he has been an ac- 
Mve worker in community affairs 
'u addition to his church work. 
He has had charge of a Boy ficout, 
troop and has interested hlmpelf 
In other hoys work activities.

Rev. Colenso has served as 
Dean of the M'.chlgamme Institute 
of the Epworth League for a num-
ber of years. ;
The conference on Wednesday 

was under the direction of Rev. 
Joseph, Dutton. Marquette, dis-
trict superintendent. Reports of 
the various church departments 
were made and committees were 
selected for the coming year.
Announcement of the commit-

tee appointments will he made 
within a few. days.

A sloth cannot supports its own 
weight on the ground. Ib spends 
Us life hanging downward from 
tree branches.

Farewell I’nrlj^.
Mrs. Ed Dtuhnnie entertained 

at a farewell party Wednesday 
evening at her home in Escanaba 
for Vina and Raymond Wahowlak 
of this city, chlldrcft of Air. and 
Mrs. John Wahowlak. Thirteen ; 
guests \\ere present. Contests 
were hold during the evening 
with prizes awarded to Tom Du- 
chunie. first, YJua Wahowlak, 
second, and Pearl Durban le, : 
third.

Vina and Raymond are leaving 
'oday for Flint where they' will 
it tend school.

9 9 P
Mnnn-Hc.ss

Announcements have been re- ! 
reived here of the marr’ago of 
Miss Marie Mann, of Milwaukee, . 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. A. H. 
Mann, former residents this • 
city, to Harold Hess, of Chicago.
The marriage took place In Mil-' 
wuukee September 3.

Miss Mann has been employed 
as stenographer in Milwaukee, 
md Mri* Hess Is teacher in - the’ A 
Walton School of Accounting. 
Chicago.

• • * •
Sullivnn-Lnuihrrt

Miss Ann Sullivan, (laughter bf 
Daniel Sullivan, became the bride/, 
of Ed Lambert, of Whltefish. at a 
•-aremonv performed bv Rev.. Sf/ ’ 
Maler Wednesday cv«*nln;
All Saints church.
The bride wove a pretty chif-

fon suit of navy blue with hat of 
navy blue and slippers of blonde 
kid. Her arm bouquet was of 
roses and hahy breath. Her // 
bridesmaid, Mrs. Henry Sullivan, 
wore an ensemble of brown figur-
ed crepe, with hat and slippers to 
match.

Twenty-five guests wer^ 
ehl at the‘dinner which followed 
at the Sullivan honip, 5«2 Michi-
gan avenue.
They will make (heir home In 

Whitefish following a shoif wed- ' 
ding trip to Newberry. Mr. Lam-; 
bort Is engaged In fanning.

Out-of-town giiests were: ,Mlsv ’/ 
Mary McGee, of Detroit. Mrs., 
Mary McCarthy. Mis. Herbert Me-, 
Carthy, and Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
McCarthy, of Escanaba.

I thank God that I shall he 
spared from seeing the consum-
mation of ruin that'is gathering 
around us. ,
The Duke of Wellington, in 
1851, during a depression.

mg,

Many a person is today Buffering 
Tom stomach ailments anneces- 
-arily. It your stomach U giving, 
cou trouble it’s because It can’t 
ligest fool. Go to your druggist 
tt once and get a bottle of Di-Jo.
It will furnish Ihe stomach with regular, take Di-Vac. It. was made 
the strengthening Juices It needs espec'ally to go with Di-Jo. If 
o stop sour stomach, heart- your druggist hasn't these rente- 
•urn. belching, ami all tlje kindred dies, write Drug' Products. Mar- 
roubles. If ^the bowel* are not shall. Mich.-r-Adv.

’ "£V.

Dance at Alton 

Sat., Sept. 10th
Music By

Phil Rohde
Adm. Men 25c I Julios Free 

Old Time and .Modern Dancing

GIARAXTEKD

Upholstering:, Repair-
ing:, Finishing:

Wt* Call for «uiil Uelirer tree. 

No charge for estimate 

CALL

Gladstone Furniture 
Shop

CO.VN MURRAY

RIALTO lInst l 
Times 
Tonight

DON’T
MISS
it:

BUT 
THtFlBH 
IS WEAK

m:

RIX TIN TIN’S Now Serial— 
i Chap, t, "Lightning Wawlor.*
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your
easy chair

|ELAX for a moment and turn the pages of 
your newspaper. Let the advertisements 
help you to make your shopping plans. Do 
you need a suit, or a coat, or a hat? Perhaps 

a new pair of gloves, some shirts, ties or other acces-* 
sories are in order. It may be that some new shoes 
are just what you require. Of course, there are 
many .things you want and need. . . but you may 
be letting many of them wait until you see in a 
store or a window exactly what you have in mind, at an 
especially alluring price.

x Those are the very things you will find in advertise-
ments. Attractive articles, new and improved ones, pric-
es that make quick action an economy. Think how many 
steps it can save you to hunt out these things, and find 
them, in comfort at home! If a special opportunity is 
offered, you’ll know about it in time. When new arti-
cles are announced, you can have them before they are 
the least bit out of date. And you can save hours of 
waiting and asking, railesc of steps-^-and money too!

m

SUNDAY, FEB. 14,1932.
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These are but a few of the ways the advertisements 
in your newspapers can serve you. If you read them 
every day, you are sure to grow wise in the ways of 
purchasing .. ♦ and saving.
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Munising News
More Students In 
Munising Schools 

Than Previously
There are more students in the 

Munlulnn ^jwnBhli) public schools 
than In either of the preceding 
years, according to the enroll-
ment record book. A total of 1130 
students are enrolled this year 
compared with 1077 in In 1931 
and 1073 In 1930.
■ The figures are:

1031 1032
Senior High School 286 32/
Junior High School — 138 143
Mather Grades . 217 209

216 231
Washington ........ 71 76
Shtngleton •; 4« 43
Melstrand ___ _ _ _ _ 38 40
Van Moor - - - - - - - 35 4(1
Wetmore -- - - - - - - - 27 21

Total . . . . . . . . . 1077 1130

Voters In Primary 
Can Vote for Only 

A Party Candidates
y Despite the wide publicity giv-

en to the form of the primary bal- 
lots there are still many voters 

T who seem to bo Ignorant of the 
fact that they must vote their 
own party ballot, that the names 

.:=i are not all on one brtllot as they 
■appear at tho general election. 

• This year tho primary ballots 
havo been shortened and tho 

|V«** T squares aro larger, so that there 
can be no excuse for marking a 

^ . cross outside the square. Tho 
lift? shortening of the ballots Is oc- 
A casloned by tho new law which 

provides that no names of candi- 
dates, who have no opposition, 
shodl appear on the ballot; nelth- 

-< er shall tho name of the office for 
which a candidate Is running, ap-
pear on the ballot; thus it will be 

• y seen that It Is not poslblo to place 
v a sticker or write in a name for 

.V no such space Is provided. Tho 
mere filing of a petition Is cqutv-

• ' nlent to a nomination when but 
v one candidate has filed.

In Alger county the Democratic 
- primary ballot contains the names 

; of but eight candidates, two for 
congress, throe for governor and 

. two for sheriff.
• The Republican ballot contains 
,\*V. the names of twenty-uvo candl-

I'i dates, three for congress, flvo for 
governor, three for lieutenant 

‘V governor, two for senator, three 
’ ; for representative, nine for of- 

flees on the county ticket. The

Evanston, HI., visited here Wed-
nesday.
The P. T. A. council will meet 

at four o'clock this afternoon at 
tho Mather school library room.

Mrs. Charles Kuula is visiting 
friends at Ishpemlng. 1

Miss Porthy Raider of Calumot 
Is hero on a visit to her brother, 
Frank Raider and family.
The Presbyterian Ladles’ Aid 

will meet Wednesday. September 
Hth at 2; 30 at the home of Mrs. 
Charles A. Everett, West Munls- 
Ing avenue. Mrs. diaries Brandt 
amjjyirs.’ Everett will bo hostesa- 
eB-
Harold and Ruth Bjornstad will 

be back tomorrow from Detroit 
where they have visited relatives 
for the past week. They will be 
accompanied back by Miss Ann 
McDermott, who will visit here 
for ten days at tho DJornstad 
homo. •

y THK CHl’RCHEM
• St, John’s Episcopal
Rev. H. G. Klrkbride. Rector. 

Isabel Ormorod, Church Worker 
16th Sunday after Trinity.

8:00 o'clock—Holy Commun-
ion. ,

9:30 o'clock—Church school.
ll:00Holy Communion and 

Sermon.
% m %

Methodist Episcopal
Sunday school will convene at 

ID o’clock. Our motto: ’’Forward 
for Christ.”

Morning worship at 11 o’clock. 
Thome: “What Shall the Harvest 
Re?”
Epworth League «t 6:30. Miss 

Evelyn Ebbcsen, lender.
Evening service at 7:30.
Sunday will bo observed ns 

harvest festival day. The church 
will be decorated With beautiful 
flowers, vegetables and fruits. A 
harvest home supper will ho serv-
ed on Thursday evening.

“Welcome". Is our watchword.

STAKLBY CLAUBKN 

KAXAfifCR MANISTIQUE PHONE 155 

TE1CPIJ0 ni.DO.

City briefs

Record Number Of 
Post Grads Attend 
M. H. S. This Year

This year Is an banner year for 
post-graduates who are returning 
to thotr alma mater for further 
Instruction. Twelve of these stu-
dents have already enrolled for 
another semester or year course 
and prospects arc that several 
more will have started their stu-
dies by the e^id of next week. In 
previous years post-graduates rc-

, „ timing to school seldom numher-
Republlpatts have three candl- C(j ni, as n j,a|f doxen. Em-
dates for drain commission, an of 
flee thai pays next to noth ng. 

rfj There ore two Republican candi-
dates for prosecuting attorney, 
two for Judge of probate, two for 
eherlir.

There can be no “splitting” at 
'■t, the primary election. Voters must 

cast either a Democratic or Re- 
^ publican ballot, or any other bal- 

* A lot they call for. However, voters 
, may call for any party ballot they 

desire -to vote. Democrats'l'aro not 
confined to casting their party 

: ballots, nor are Republicans eon- 
;i '. f ried to their party ballots, but 
j A the- ballot Is not arranged to per- 
i •*' mil of splitting.

mSTOl'NTiXCi MONEY 
r--; Canadian tourists have been 

very, numerous this summer and 
garsgo men and filling station 
operators report they aro among 

. - tho most courteous and prosper- 
°us of our summer visitors. The 

■■]i{ only, thing that nggtavatos them 
'>’■ is the discount of 20 per cent on 

‘ Canadian money.. Some pass it off 
v s with a Joke; others flare up at 

.< once. ...

MI NTHING BRIEFS 
‘ A Mr.%and Mrs. J, N. Korpela and 
;’I family will visit friends at Powers 

over tho weew-end. . ,
Stephen Rab deau and Leslie 

Larson of Rock visited hero this 
week with the Misses Esther
Ames and Ellon Carlson.

T. A. and Robert Coon of Han-
cock were visitors hero this week 

Dr. and Mrs. L. 9. Leath o.

ployment being scarce and lack-
ing funds for continuing their ed-
ucation in a higher institution of 
learning, many have decided to 
continue their careers at the lo-
cal high school, at least for tho 
time being.
• Total high school enrollment 
row numbers 434 students with 
422 undergraduates In' attend-
ance. i ■ ' -' if 1 •

AMERICAN COLLEGE GIRL REPORTED 
SLAIN IN ALPS

Mrs. Leo Schwarts, of Detroit, 
Is vliltlng with her mother, Mrs. 
Judson Hollenbeck, this week.

Fred Hicks, lay reader of -St, 
Alban’s Episcopal Mission, loft 
Tuesday for Newberry1"where he 
visited with friends eoroute to 
Witch lake where ho Is attend- 
tn ga conference.

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Schnurer 
and baby, of Iron Mountain, are 
spending several days this''week 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. Se-
bastian Weber, Sr., Lakeside 
Road.

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Dumond 
returned Tuesday evening from a 
two day visit with Mr. and Mrs. 
Leo Wlntell In Gladstone. 
v Thomas Grlmsley submitted to 
a major operation In the St. Fran 
els hospital at Escanaba yesterday 
morning.

Miss Grace Weber visited at the 
home of her parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Sebastian Weber, Si\, over the 
week-end and lias returned to her 
training at Manitowoc.

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Strnsler 
returned to Flint Mils week after 
spending several days here with 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Casemorc 
left Tuesday morning for their 
homo In Detiolt after a long visit 
In the city with relatives and. 
friends.
' Rev. and Mrs. F. Elmgren and 
Henry Drolln left yesterday after-
noon for Chicago where they will 
remain for several days. ,

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Hruska and 
family, of Calumet, visited In the 
city with relatives and friends.

Rev. and Mrs. F. Elmgren and 
Henry Rrolln left yesterday after-
noon for Chicago where they will 
remain for several days.

Mr. and Mrs. Peter Dausey, of 
Detroit, are guests at the home of 
Mrs. Margaret Redmond, Arbutus 
avenue, this week.

Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Goodwin 
left Wednesday morning for their 
home In Detroit after visiting for 
a few days with the former’s fath- 
yer and mother. Mr. and Mrs. H. 
R Goodwin, and with Mr. and 
Mrs. Edwin Ekdahl.

Mr. and Mrs. Ixiuls Farley, of 
Garden, visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
William Krummey, Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Chandan-. 
als, and family, of Pontiac, are 
now living on' Garden avenue. 
They plan to remain here Indefin-
itely.

Mrs. V. J. Marin and sons. Wil-

New Diamond Ball 
Field To Be Made 

* If Players Work
Local diamond ball players win 

have at least one new field to play 
on next year If a sufficient nunw 
her of ambitious players can he 
corailed to pick up stones on the 
lot on Maple avenue opposite the 
Legion Memorial cottage, accord-
ing to a statement made yester-
day morning by J. W. Gllllgan, 
local councilman, who is certain 
that the city council will grant 
permission .for Its use. The lot is 
owned by tho city.

John E. McCarthy, county en-
gineer. has consented to use a 
drag and heavy roller In getting 
the grounds Into condition. After 
dragging the plot, the players will 
be asked to remove and pile up 
»ome of the atones, but will not 
have to haul them away. The 
‘rad was leveled by the unem- 
doyed in the city this spring and 
srge boulders were also removed

from a short visit with HerfVy 
Marin at Menominee. . *

Misses Wanda and Betty Matt-! 
son havo returned to Flint after 
spending the summer here with 
their grandmother, Mrs. Judson 
Hollenbeck. ,

Mr. and Mrs. Oxem Oulllette, 
Mr. and Mrs. Emil Oulllette ami 
family. Mr. and Mrs. James Onil- 
lette and family, and Mr. and Mrs! 
Pejer Fortier have returned to 
their homes In Pinconning. Mich., 
after spending the Labor Day 
week-end here With Mr. and Mrs. 
Ell Volsine.

SOCIAL

W, Ik A. Mertlng 
Ten members of the local Wo-

man's Reheftr Association were 
guests nt the home of Mrs. Wil-
liam Krummey Wednesday eve-
ning. After the business session 
bridge an<| five hundred were 
played, the Indies forming a table 
of each game. A tasty luncheon 
was served ut the close of the 
evening by the hostess.

Mr. and Mrs. Peter Dausey. of 
Detroit, were out of town guests 
at the meeting. Mrs. Dausey Is a 
member of the local order.
The next meeting of the asso-

ciation will be held at the home 
of Mrs. John Hagghlom.TArbutus 
avenue. Wednesday eveuUig, Oc-
tober 8.

• • • ‘

Directions Given For 
Storage of Vegetables

The body of Jcrane Iberschoff, above. 21-year-old Smith College 
student, of Cleveland. CT.,-ls reported to have been found near a road 
In the Swiss Alps. Police said she had been attacked and murdered. 
Miss Iberschoff was on a student tour of Europe, and was making 
a bicycle trip‘through the mountains. * *

Entertain* Team 
Alex Creighton was host to the 

members of the Ford dlamondball 
team at Arrowhead Inn Tuesday 
evening. Dinner was served at 
6:30 o'clock with covers laid for 
all the players. A social evening 
followed the dinner.

• » •
Surprised by F» lends 

Mrs. Kenneth YnnKyek wa- 
pleasantly surprised ut her home 
120 Lake street. Tuesday eve 
sing. The party was in the fnrn 
of u shower and given by twelve 
of her friends.

Bridge was the diversion of tin- 
evening with prV.es being won In 
Miss Monica McConnell for hold-
ing high score in the games and 
Mrs. William '■ Sheahan, second 
high. Delicious refreshments fol-
lowed the cards.

Mrs. VanKyck was the recipient 
of many pretty gifts from . her 
friends.

Mrs. Mutart Observes 
62nd Anniversary Of 
Advent to Manistique

An elderly but vivacious little 
white-haired woman was busily 
occupied In the kitchen of her

Ham and George, have returned, at 716 Manistique-nvauu* JD«vkod-..trlumphantly.

seed the ground this fall In order 
that the diamond m^y bfe In con-
dition next spring for the dia-
mond ball season.
The location of the Held is Ideal 

and provides ample room for the 
playing of the game! It Is felt that 
If necessary an adjacent lot north 
of tho road leading Into the fair-
grounds can also be used for this 
purpose.

Diamond hall Is gaining in pop-
ularity hero each year and hun-
dreds of fans have attended 
league games regularly during tbw 
past summer. The council is cog- 
nlianj of the fine recreational 
possibilities of the game, both 
from the viewpoint of the players 
and spectators, and are willing to 
do their part In providing ample 
facilities. It is earnestly desired 
that the players will donate their

U the same time. It Is planned to services In tho near future.

OUT OUR WAY By Williams
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_ '_  Ms.us.Mr.orr.

yesterday morning walking about 
With the alacrity of a woman of 
thirty. Although she was very 
much absorbed In her menial 
tusks, she had not forgotten that 
the day was the sixty-second an-
niversary of her coming to Mants- 
tlquo.

At ll:Oo a. m., September S, 
1870. Just as tho clock In the old 
boarding bouse chimed for thd 
men to go In to dinner. Mrs. Jen-
nie Mutart, then a young girl of 
14. stepped off a little sailing ves-
sel which had come alopg the 
shores of Lake Michigan' from

few more years I hope to'havo'the 
pleasure of seeing my great-great-
grandchildren,” Mrs. Mutart re-

Durlng the past two winters 
Mrs. Mutart has lived with her 
daughter, Mrs. T. W. Pawley of 
Auburn, Mich., returning to her 
home in the late summer.
And so this active yet gentle 

white-haired lady who has seen 
Manistique grow from Its early 
childhood to the robust adult It 
has become, still lljfes with us, 
not only watching Ita activities, 
but taking an nctlvoiWt in its 
life. We wish, with the sincerity 
that her hundreds of friends also 
desire, that this venerable and 
kindly woman will enjoy many

Famous Choir To Be 
Heard Here Sept. 18
The Messiah Lutheran choir of 

Marquette. Mich., will render a 
sacred concert at the Zion Luth-
eran church on Sept. 18. This is 
an unusual opportunity for Man-
istique to hear the highest and 
finest music possible. Dr. O. H. 
Rostrom, who Is one of the most 
able directors In sacred music, is 
directing this chorus.

Dr. Rostrom directed the male 
chorus nt Augustann College, 
Rock Island. Ill., for several years 
and also the Trl-Clty, a Capelin 
choir of Davenport, Iowa, Moline 
and Rock Island, III. A sincere 
welcome Is extended to all.

Storing In the best way of pre-
serving vegetables for winter Qift 
In many instances. Storing Ik 
cheaper, requires leas work, and 
with many crops preserves more 
of tho characteristic flavor than 
when tho vegetables aro canned 
or dried.
The house-cellar Is by far the 

most frequently used storage 
place of vegetables grown In 
gardens. If It does not contain a 
furnace and the temperature does 
not fall behny, _ (reeling point, 
there will be little difficulty in 
keeping the vegetables well Into 
the following spring. If, however, 
there Is u furnace In the cellar, 
then the dlffb-tiltles of successful 
storage nro greatly increased. In 
such cellars n small portion, pre- 
feinhly well removed from the 
furnace, should be partitioned 
off. Tho storage room should pos-
sess at least one window which 
will make temperature control 
easier. The tighter the partition 
fits, the better. As the storage 
loom probably will be quite per 
mnnent, It Is advisable to exercise 
considerable care In constructing 
I he partition. An Insulated wall 
or a double wall with a dead ulr 
pace between Is to In* preferred. 
\ heavy cement wall is satlsfac- 
ory. A single hoard wall Is not to 
»e recommended, but a st( 
room with such a wall gives bet-
tor results than storing in 
-ante room with the furnace, 
storage room should preferubh 
have a dirt floor.

Outside tvilars or Caves

vent freezing of the vegetables 
and are so located and built as to 
be of east access during Jhe win-
ter. Some gardeners have an en-
trance to their ontsltk* cellar 
through the house cellur!*Thls ov-
ercomes the greatest objection of 
the outside cellar—gaining access 
to It (luring bad weather. The 
outalde cellar eliminates any urn 
pleasant odors Indoors due to de-
caying vegetables.
Hucceesfnl Storage Requirement* 
The three chief essentials of 

storage are: sound vegetables, 
proper temperatute, proper mois-
ture. With certain vegetables ma-
turity and ventilation are also ot 
prime Importance. Many peoplt 
overlook the first of these storag« 
requirements. Careful sclectlor

elude freedom from disease ctibt 
'lillons likely to cans,, rot. an-t
from mechanical or insect injury 
which provides an entrance fo< 
rot organisms or favorable condii 
(ions for their development. It nf 
not the loia of the affected 
table which la so Important, but 
that decay once started non 
troy a considerable portion of tho 
stored crop. The Importance of 
soundness does not atop with the 
selection of sound specimens. It 
Includes careful handling during 
the storing process.. Everyone 
handles fruits which are to he 
stored with the utmost rare, but 
practically disregards the bruis-
ing of vegetables. .While the 
suits are not so marked . IIHIf 
vegetables, often much of the loss 
In storage may be traced directly 
m rough handling.

Additional Information can be 
secured from the county agent.

There are 650 firms In Lon-
don that aro more than 100 years 
old.

Citrus specialists have succeed-
ed in crossing the Mexican Hme. 
with the lemon. The new fruity 
said to resist citrus disease, -'■p

BRIEFLY TOLD

Seul Choix. Little did she realize anniversaries of her coming
at that time that the little settle- t0 Manistique. 
moot In the wilderness, consisting 
of but eight dwellings, would 
some day become a thriving lum-
ber town of over 6,000„ ihhabl* 
tants and that -she would estab-
lish her home here for the re-
mainder of her life. . ' •

Mrs. Mutart has tho distinction 
of being Manlstlque’s oldest re-
sident. Still In good health at the 
age of 76, Mrs. Mutart possesses 
a keen mind and still can recall 
tho names of the six families who 
lived here when she came. Hot 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Angus M<

Pantry Sale—The Ladles' Aid 
society of the Zion Lutheran 
church announces a pantry sale to 
he held In the Gunnaraon and Ke- 
fauver store on Saturday, October 
1, the sale starting at 10 o’clock 
In the morning.

Aid Dinners—This year the 
Methodist Ladies' Aid society will 
have charge of the dinners and

Afee, passed away years ago, and B!ipp®r8 1,1 t^®.dlnlng hnl1 dur,nR
..... . P/mi ntv Pnlr

Mrs. Mutart is the only person 
who can delve into Manistique 
history as far back as the fall of 
1870, relating from experience.
“I wouldn’t mind living until 

I'm a hundred.” declared Mrs. 
Mutart. "that Is providing I can 
keep all of my faculties.” Four 
years ago Mrs.’Mutart slipped and 
fell on the front steps of her home 
breaking her shoulder. On ao- 
ount of her advanced age her 
phystclan told her that she might 
•lever regain tho use of her arm. 
•She displayed remarkable recu-
perative powers, however, and a 
month later her shoulder .had 
healed completely. • ;; v
■For several years Manlstlque’s 
pioneer resident had been ‘ com-
pletely deaf, but upon recovering 
from her Illness she partially re-
gained her hearing. “I wept for 
Joy when I again heard the birds 
sing," Mrs. Mutart declared with 
great emotion.
■Longevity j.- common among 
her ancestors, especially on her 
mother’s side, her mother 1'vlpg 
to the ripe old age of S.r» and her 
grandmother to 84. Her father 
had been In tho seventies when he 
passed away.
Asked as to her nationality, 

Mrs. Mutart stated that she was 
part Dutch. English, and Scotch. 
"A friend told me that my endur-
ance was a Dutch trait, my perse-
verance was Inherited from the 
Scotch, and to pay compliment to 
tho English stated Hint my dainti-
ness was from that branch of my 
origin.''

Mra. Mutart Is her earlier days 
was noted for her work ns a senm- 
atreas and caterer for parties, 
sometimes furnishing foot! for as 
many ns three large social occa-
sions in n week. She can also lay 
claim to having made breeches 
for several of thla city's leading 
business men when they were 
mere youngsters!

Only last week Mrs. Mutart was 
boppred by.g visit D'orn her great- 
ijMNnepw; a.von of Willful 
wx. who made a special tVtp herf 
from MunUioi to see her. “In a

the County Fair.

Brotherhood 1‘lcnlc—The Luth-
eran Brotherhood society will 
hold their annual outing Sunday 
at the farm home of Miss Huldn 
Nelson at Gulliver. The program 
will begin nt 2 o’clock and all 
members of the society and their 
friends are cordially Invited to 
attend the picnic.

A son. Richard Earl, weighing 
eight pounds, was horn to Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Htder. , Manistique 
•Heights, Tuesday., September 6. 
Mrs. Hider was formerly Esthet 
Peterson of this city. *

City Hall Will Be ■ 
Open Saturday Nite 
For Tax Payments

The office of the city treasurer 
will be open all day Saturday and 
up until eight o'clock Saturday 
evening to accomodate those who 
desire to pay city taxes. The final 
date for payment without being 
subjected to the* four per cent 
penalty Is next Thursday, Septem-
ber 15.

City tax collections have stood 
up surprisingly well this year 
considering conditions and are 
well ahead of 1931 collection^for 
tho corresponding period.

1‘rcss Want Ads 
Accomplish Much.

Cost Little,

Archie Murphy Is 
Victim Of Unusual 
Accident Yesterday
Archie Murphy, an employe ot, 

the Brown Dimension company, 
was the victim of an unusual ^ac-
cident while at work yesterday 
morning when a hard sliver of 
wood flew back from the saw 
which he was operating. Inflicting 
two cuts In the abdominal wall 
and also piercing his side.

Examination at the Shaw hospi-
tal disclosed that the wounds 
were not of a serious nature and 
It .is expected that he will be dis-
charged from the hospital today.

Nelson Cleaning 
Shop Periled By 

Flames Thursday
What may have been a serious 

conflagration was averted yester- 
day morning by prompt action on 
the part of Jack Nelson and the 
local fire department when sparks 
caused a small roof fire at tho 
Nelson Cleaning shop. Mr. Nelson 
used a small fire extinguisher in 
putting out part <if thp blaze and 
ijhAn notified the fire department 
‘Damage To the building was negll-

Central Market
WE SERVE YOU BETTER

Phone 40 Phone 41

Friday and Saturday

SPECIALS
Wigwam Coffee, “a bet-

ter flavor,” Q7c 
pound... Q.f

Onions, for your pick-
ling & cook- 
ing, 10 lbs. ..£dO

Cabbage, large hard 
heads, 1 
pound...  O

Squash, large 
Hubbards, ea.

Take Advantage Of Our

REDUCED PRICES
Men’s Suits cleaned and

pressed .. TBc, 2 for gl.00

Isuites' Plain Dresses, $1.00,
2 for............ $1.50

I indies’ Ensembles, each $1.00

1 Man’s Suit and 1 lady's 
Dress. . . . . . . . . a_ $1.50

YOU’LL LIKE OUR WORK

Manistique 
Cleaners & Dyers

211 Oak Street Phone 101

HEINZ CASH 
STORE

220 Cedar St. Phone 22$

HEINZ SELLS REST FOR 
LESS ALWAYS

24\i lbs. Flour ... 47c
10 lb. sack Granulated 
Sugar .. . . . . - 47c

Strictly Fresh Eggs, 
dozen

Fresh Creamery
Butter, lb... . 21c

10 bars P. and G.
Soap. . . . . . . 28c

New Crop Prunes,
5 pounds 24c

Rinso, large Size, 
box....... 21c

Pegnut Butter, 2 lb. 
glass jar.... 23c

Armour’s Smoked
Ham, half or whole, 
pound .....  12c

Corn Fed Beef Stew, 
pound . . . . . .  8c

Corn Fed Beef Roasts, 
pound .... 10c, 12c

Pork Shoulder Roast, 
pound.....  lOc

Fresh Cut Beef Ham-
burger, 3 lbs. for 25c

Uotne and look over our bar-
gains which arc too numerous 

to pHnt

Corn, tender 
Banlam, 
dozen. . . .

golden

10'
Green Com Season Is at a 

close:—Your Last Chance

Ripe Tomaloes $J35
bO lb. bushel

Peaches, Washington 
Rlberta’s, at their

. . nir>
Hams, skinned 

grade, half or 
whole, lb.

firsl

16c
Pork Roasl, lb. .. 15c

Beef Stew, lb... 10c

Beef Boast, lb. 16c

Chickens, fresh dressed 
lb. 22c

Schuster’s Food Market
FRIDAY & SATURDAY SPECIALS

PURE LARD, 4 lbs. for

BUTTER, Fresh churned, 
Lied’s or Clover- AOs* 
bloom, 2 lbs

0LE0 (Samoa 
Niit), 2 lbs. — 21c

Jell-0
3 '0,19c

This Airship FREE with each 
R packages

Swans

Down
CAKE “I' 

FLOUR

23c
Breakfast COFFEE, Mild, Sweet Drinking;. 
llb.pkg--------- -- - - - - - ------ --  23c

WIGWAM COFFEE, Finest quality, 1 lb. can _ 37c j

PRUNES, 60-70 O IT „ • Bulk VINEGAR, O 9 M 
Size, 5 lbs, for - 40C gallon_______ ZOC

GOLD MEDAL FLOUR, 24'/2 lbs. 69c; 49 lbs. $1.39 \
FEEDS jg

Flour Middlings, 100 lb. Itag_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ fjoc .
Fine Ground Feed, 100 lb. bag'____ _______ _ $t.*»!)
Oyster Shells, 100 lb.'bag- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 08c .

Fruits and Vegetables :
Onious, Fancy Yellow,

It) lbs, for ........ 2T»-
Head Lettuce, Firm Crisp
Heads- - - - ------  10c

Pears, Calif. Bartlett*.
dozen_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ 27e

Bananas, Ripe Golden Fruit, * 
1 lbs, for_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ 2:h

CANDY
Marshmallows, lb. - - - -  17c
(Roasting Fork', Free with 

each lb.)_ _ _ _ _ _ _
----10cJelly Beans, lb.

All 5c Candy Bars, 3 for 10c
Spare Bibs, 2 lbs.. . . . 15c
Brisket (’ornod Beef,

1 lbs.. . . . . . . . . .   25c
Bologna and Liver Sausage, 

(Fresh Home Made), 
lb. J,. . . . . . .. U2c

I lm

MEATS
Frankfurters, 2.lbs._ _ 21c

CORN-FED BEEF
Round Steak, lb._ _ _ _ _ _ 10c :
Sirloin Steak, lb..... 22c
Rib Konst, rolled, boneless, ;
' lb.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 23c -

MILK-FED VEAL 4
Chops, lb. .. . . . . l.V •
Steak, lb..... ______ 10c '3
Rtl) Stow, 1 lbs._ _ _ _ - gfle *
Pork lioin Roast, Rib End. ; 
lb.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . I3o -
Loin End, lb.------ lAe ‘

Jack Sprat Sliced Bacon, /
R>. cello, pkg. Or

'fig'
Summer Sausage, Beat; 

Quality Thurlnger. lb. m
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(l.«M Salrn) 
—

AMffw r a r- - - - -
AH»»nr» RumUy  —™.
Air R^lof . . . . . . . . .
Airway* El Appllanra 
Alaaka Junrau 
Allied Cham A flyt 
A!!!. Ch Vfc 
Amerada 'ijti 'rfiri
Am A« Cham n|
Am Praha 8ho#
Am Can 
Am Car A EHr 
Am A For Pow 
Am Internal 
Am
Am MaUl

Am Rad 8t Ran 
Am Rnllinc Mill
Am Ranting . . . ...
Am Smalt A Raf
Am Rtaal Fiira. .
Am Tel A Tal..
Am T«h . . . .........
Am Wat Wit*
Am Wnolrn ....

*•••**••<*•!*••••••*

Am F.lna L A R .... 
Anaimnda 
Anaconda W A C..
Andra Cop .. —
Armour Dal Pfd - 
Armour III “A" — 
Armour Dl "B" —
Armnir HI PM
Ateh T A fl F--
Atlantic Ref 
Auburn Aut 
Aitnaale*
Balt A Ohio-- -
Rarnadall A 
Pathlaham Steal
Rohn Alum . ...
porda n 
Prlgga Mfg

-■ 1.1%
4.16

60.76

10 61
14.60

<II.T»
^ 0.60

17.00
00.67
14.0<»
11.so
10.70
if. to

. ».1S

10,07 
io.«: 
115 
10 12 
1107 

110.12 
00.12 
01.02 
0.11 
• 07 

17.07 
14.N
m
1.07
l.tl

11.60 
60.10
S0.M
60 00

10.60
0.70
I4.M
1707
11.70 
B47

Shall Union 
Slmmana 
Sinclair Cana
Shelly Oil aoa • a * aa «a *« aaoa a • • • • • • M** a h * • aaaoot ̂  • a a aa a •

fiipr'ror1 e.t.M>*a*>aaf*aoaaaHH»oON0*M—aaa.t

Socony Vacuum . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
South Cal M —
SHitharn F*«
Roothorn Roll 
Rparha With 0 ..-at••a.t.rnaeaaaaaa*<***•#«••*#•••••••

Stand Brand* .. -. . ... .
Pt. Com. Tobh . . .. . . . . . . . ..
St. O. A El

ProcV Motor* Pfd £ 
Brooklyn A Q Tran* 
Bruna Balk*
Bruna T A By. ■ 
Budd Whaal . . .
Burr Add Mach . . .
Bran Co 
Callahan E A L 
Cal A Hacla h-- 
Carapball Wyant —... 
Canada Dry Q. A. m. 
Can Faalflc
Cairo Da Paaao
Cartaln-Taad .. . . . . . . ...
Chaekar Cab  -- —- - - - - - -
Chaa A Ohio - - - - - - - --
Chle OL Wait . .... . . . .
Chi. M. St F A P Pfd»..M. . .
Chle A N W-- ——---
Chle Pnau T . . . . . . . . . . .
Chi Rk la A P
ChryaWr .. —-..
Coll A Alkman ..
Col Fuel A Iron .—
Oolutnb CAE 
Columb Carh 
Com Inveat TV 
Comm Solv .—
Com wealth Sou 
Congo) Nairn ...
Congreaa Cigar
Conaol Caw --
Container A 
Coot Can
Cnnt Mot . .
Cont Sharea 
Corn Prod 
Crucible St 
Cudahy Paek 
Curtlaa Wright 
Daviaon Cham ....
Det Ediaon ...
Dome Mlnra 
Drug Inc
Dupont Da Nam .•••a* .... .
I .a* t man Kodak . ••••—.
Eaton Ai A 8 
E’ar Auto 1.
Elec Boat 
El Pow A I.gt
El Stor B . .
uBee A Muale
Kndlfott Johnton . . . . . . •••aaaaaa*».J
Erie R R 
Fairhanka Morta
Fadar Mot -. . .
Frd Sc raw . . . .
Firaatona TAR 
FUk Ruhbar 
Fnllanabaa 
Fourth Natl Int 
Fox Film “A"
Fraaport Tax .
Oahrlel A 
Cen A»phalt 
C»naral Cabla A
C.jn Elae ..
Ren Food* .
Ren Motor*
Can Outdoor Adv 
Ren Outdoor Adv "A".. 
i>»n Rail Signal ..
Gllletta Safety R 
(Hidden Co.
Hold Duit .
Goodrich 
Ganlyear T 
Graham Paige ....
Gramby Con* M
Great N Ry. Pfd . . .
Great N. Iron Ore Ctf 
Rrlgaby Grun 
Hahn Dept St 
Houd-Her B ..
Houaton Oil ..
HutUon Mot 
Hupp Motor*
III* Cent 
Indian Ref 
Inland Steel
Inap Copper . . . . .... .
Inter Bua blaeh . . . . . . . .
Int Comb E . . . . . . . . . .
Int Harv .. . . . . . .. . . . .
Int Match Pte Pfd .. . . .
Inter Mer M Clfd . . . . . . .
Int Nick Can . . . . . . . . .
International Shoe .....
Int Tel A Tel . . . . .....
Intereat Dept St... . . . .
Taland Crk . . . |
Jewell Tea . . . . . . . . . .
John* Manv . . . . . . . . .
Kana C Sou .. . . . . . ..
Kelly Spring . . . . . . . . .
Keliey-Hayea Wheel ....
Kelvlnatir . . . . . . . . . . .
Kimberly Clark . . . . . ...
Kreage iRSi .. . . . . . . . .
Kroger Groe. . . . . . . . . . .
I.lrr A My •‘B” . 1
l.lquid Carh

l••«••aa*aa•aaa«l<

aaaataaiaM*aaa<aa»MM*aa **»««»—a i

I.ooae Wll Bla . . . .
I-oul* GAEA ..
Loulavilla A Naah ....
I-udlum Steel . . . .
Mack Truck* . . . .
Magma Copper ..
Marmon Mot
Mara hall Ffald .. . .
May Dept Store ....
Mangel . . .
Miami Cop
Mld-Cont Pat ....
Midland 8t ...S-J
Minn A St L .. . . .
Mo Kon T
Mo Pac -- -- - - - -
Monlgom Ward ..
Mothar Lode 
Moto Met Guaj^J
Motor Prod . . . . .
Motor Wheel ........i.
MulU#6M|fg
Murray Corp . . . .
Naah Motor*
Natl Bella* Hea*
Nat BiMuit .. . . . .
Nat Caah R A 
Nat Dairy Pr
Nat Pow A Lgt ..
National Steel . . .
Nev Cona Cop . . .
N. Y. Airbrake ......
N. Y. Central ...
Noranda Mine* .....
North Amer .. . . .
North Pacific ....
Norwalk TAR..
Otia Elev .... .
Otii Steel

ei**ae*e*e*«tM«B***M

Pan-Am Pat B
Path* Exrh . .
Patha Exrh A
Patino Min..
Peerlaa* Motor . . . . .
Penney (JCi .. . . . .
Penn R R .. .....
Phelp* Dodga .....
Phila R C A I . ..
Phillip* P*t . .. ... . .
Pierce Pet .. . . . . . .
Pill*, flour .... ..
rub Bar N. J- -. . . ....
Pullman ....
Pur* Oil ••••a*•••*•*•»*•••*•**•*•****#••< 
Radio .. . .—..........
Rndlo-Kelth-0- - - - - _...
Kaadln* Co.- - - - - - - -
Remlng Band .—. . . .
lUo Motor- - - - - - - —
Rapatb Steel ....- - - - - - . ..

Metal* ... . . .
Spring.. .
Tob B--- —...

11.71 
22.67 
1.60 
7.16 
7.16 
it oo 
I‘.O'1
14.26
2.76

27.60 
27.28
8.on

,5*
6.26

11.17
16.17

pH
16.17 
17.12 
26.0
12.17
4.76

11.17 
ll.oo
61.60

55.17
1.71

49 26
20.00
62.60

tjiji
’ 66 J 2
11.27 

•,'46,00
46.26 
81.11

.■ »,o(|
24.76 
1.76

14.17
11.76

17.26
10.76

St. Oil Cal

St. Oil N. 4.
Stewart Worn 
Studehaktr 
Ttnn. Carp h.
Tex** Corp ... . ..
Ter.** G Sulph
Tex Par GAO - - -
T*x Pac L Tr -- - - - -
The Fair. . . . . . . .
Third Natl !nv . . .
Tide Wat A* ----
Tide Wat Oil .. . . .
Tlmk Del Atle...
Ttmk Roll R .. . . .
Tob Prod -- -
Tniaeon St •(•^aea **>*••••*

Underwood Ell . . . .
Union Carbide ... .
Union Pacific .........
Unit Aircraft .........
Unit Corp .. . . . . .
Unit (laa A Im ..
U. 8. Freight ....
U. R. Ind Ale .. . . .
U. 8. I.aather A ...
U. 8. Rubber - - - -
U. 8. Smelt A Ref.
U. S. Steel .. . . . .
U. 8. Steal Pfd .. . .
Unlv Pipe A R ..
Utllitlea PAL ••A” 
Vanadium ...............
Wabaih Ry . ....
Warner Piet ..........
Wealern Mary .........
Wetting Air .....
Weal El A Mfg ....
Whlta Motor ... .
Wlllra Over! 
Woolworth aaiaMeo>*e*oiea
Wright. Aero ..........
Yellow T. A C_ _ _ _
Young 8. A W. .... 
Young Rh A T.. .

itaeaeeaa.aM,

•aeaeaa eta *Mtaa eaaa* f • i

Grant (W. T.)
Ot No Ir Or* Ctf „.
fnt'l Hydro EIk. . .
Keiinrcntt .....
Kreuger A Toll 
Loul»v A Naah 
Bendls Aviation
J. I. Cue . . . . .
Con«oll(|»t»<| Oil
Newton Steal taaeoaoeeaeeeeaaoeel *0oe*#aao*6*aeeeaaae -AgA

Wootarn Union .. .. .... "U

aaeaaotaaoao •••••aaaaea***#* a*

oAaaooeaoeamaeataaeaaaaaeaaaaaaata 

aaaoeaaaaaaaaae aaaeoaeeeeooeaoaoooo

11.76 
20.6f 
16 0(. 
111?
4.60 

14.02
I 60 

20.12
60.17

10.00 
7.16 
12.00 
ill 

17 67
74.60 
Ilf
7.60 
6 0M
16.60
5 12

0.2A
20.60

7.00

1U 
26.16 
76.00 
60 00 
I6.tr.
20.76 
I6.T6 
.14.00 
14.7*. 
002 
IV p 
46 67 
16 00
I.H7
6 00 

21.60

1.76
6.76 
10.00 
17,00
40 11
10.17
1.76
40.17 
16.60
062
11.61
21.00

, 20.12
11.60
10.00

, 17.76 
.17

64.00 
16.00 
00.16 
6.16 
7.67

ar^..,u i i'.'„iTTe.-.'Jiu =

STOCK PRICES 
GET SETBACK

•TOOK MARKET AVKRAOM
(By Tha Aiwdatad Praeal

I Copyright. 1611 
Standar l Htatiatlea Co )

Id 20 1# SO
Ind'U Hr'* Ul's Totnl

Thursday . 69.5 87 7 107.4 70.2
Pr*. nay .... .11.4 IU.4 13.4
W*.k Ago r 06 1 18.8 102.4 67.8
Month 5g«' ''9.4 24.4 18.1 69.3
Year Ago 09,1 81.1 112.5 1022
9 Yrs Ago *62 M 141.4 138.2 •61.8
5 Yrsi. Ago :4M 111.6 128.4 ’.11.6
High 11'.111 H9!» 8M ULO. 72."
1-0 >7 119*2'. 15.1 11.2 SI.4 35.0
High .19411 140 2 106 2 291.1 i44 3
fo<Wi litfll. NO 0 10.4 92.9 M 3

Bonds Not Active, 
Close Little Higher

Worthington Pump ...................
Total Bale* • •••aa**a*aaaaa*a*a*aeee<e*a*taaae 

DA)F »***aaaa**aM*aai*  m eae* ••*•*• 
Jjitk AfO ••••«. •■itaaea** t**ea*Ma* •aaaaaeeae
Y“r Ago *aae«**a Heat • aaeoeea *****•••*< aeeeaa

Two Year* Agu agMeemAateea • 
Jan. 1 to Date ..
Year Ago •eaaa********••*•••**••***« **••*•*•*• 

Two Yean Ago ••••• i f***aa*aw •**••*•*• t

6.1*2.040 
4.14IJ02 
2,481,141 

y. l.M0,160 
1,710,640 

104.611. *00 
400,747,114 
601,174.101

flW YORK CURB 

^Cloiiiix QuofAtiona)

Am...
Ain*worth Mfg.
Aluminum Co. of 
Amtriean Auatin .»*•*•**•**• eiae»*m^o»»»eeeaeg 
Am. Com. Pow. A . . -.. .............
Am. Cyan B .. . . . . .
Am. A Fgn. Paw. War..._. .
Am. Oaa A El. ***•****••«• #•***•*•**•*****#*•*
Am. Light A True.
Am. Supar Power 
Am. Super Pow. lit pfd.,
Areturua Rad. Tub*
AritaM Nfit. Oaa A 
Aim. Gu A El. A ...
Bll.a t. W.

,******** at**#*#***#***#*.#..
.a *••****•*•*•*•*•*•••

4.60
77.16

.60

.11
0.76
mi

Sl.ll
2<00
7.17 

67.00
1.17 
1,00 
4.12

Buff Nlag. A E. Pow. pfd. . . . . M.64
Butlar Broa. 0aa*»...«a***«a*a*eaa* eeeeeaaaaea* ********
Can. Mare. Wlralea* .. . . . . . . . .
Carlb. Syn * ••#•••••*••#aaaaaaaaaaea iimo•>■**•••******
Central Pub. S. A., ,..m............
Cent. State* Klee. . . .. . . . . .
Chain Store* Stock . . . . . . . . . .
Citirn Service M*aaa»e*« »a(*a*a* ••****#**"' •*•« **••
Colon Oil _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _
Commonwealth Kd *•••**•« ••••e**a*aM **«•*••» 
Commonwaalth A 8. W. ******* **•*»*•♦*»« 4 
Comatork Tunnel •*• eMe*!**** ** •***••* »* e ••*•« e«
Con*. Cop. Min.
Cm*. Gm Util. A. . . .. .
Cord Corp. . . . . .
Davenport Hmlery .. Mae **a«**a*a**«6****aa*
Deforest Radio .. .
D at roll Aircraft . . . . . . . . . . . . .
tow Cham New . . . . .
Eaitarn G»* A Fuel . . . . . . . . . .
SI. Rond A Share .. . . . . . .
RL Bond A Bhar# pfd.. . . . . . .
Eire. Share ... . . . . . . .
Emp. Oat A F 8 Pet. pfd 0ea**e*e**d**a***M6 

r# Pe

2.25
.76
1.1!
6.00

6.10
111

19.00
.11

1.28

7.21

.71

.17

6.00
40.00
14.00
6.00

»**—*«**»**»»*»•»«»*

.. . . .

Empire Pow.
Fairchild Aviation A
Ford Motor Canada A.. .
Ford Motir Canada B.........

Motor Franc* . . . .
Ford Motor Ltd •,••**••**•••* ••••••*«
Gulf Oil Corp. Pa.
Hall Lamp ..
H*ela Min. . . . . . . . .
Hiram Walker G. A W.

•*•••**• *•**#«••••••*•••*•••

•. . . .
i** a******—**

1.26
>0.26

■4.12
11.67 
>0 00 
14.02
7.00 

19.50 
>2.62 
30.00 
14.12 
2.26 
6.00 
7.00 
16 00 
16.60
17.67 
66.60 
16.60 
>1.00 
21.76

Hudaon Bay M. A 8. - - - - - - - - -
Humbl* Oil A Ref. .. . . . . . . ..
Imp. Oil Can. New .. . .. .........
Internal. Pet. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Inter Supar Pow.. . . . . . . . . . . .
Inter Util U. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
lehlgh Coal A Nav a ****** *»*»***•*«*•**«*—*
Libby Men. A Libby . . . . . . . . . .
Mldweat Util. N. . . . . . . . . ....
Mo. Kama* Pipe Lin*. . . . ... .
National Aviation *»•»•*••*«.e..•**•••..#•••*#••

National Invaator* .. . . . . . . . . .
Nat. Pjw. A Light pfd.... . ....
National Tran*. . . . . . . -. . . . . .
Newmont Mining . .. . . . . . . .
Niagara Hud. Pow. . . .. . .. . . .
Nlag. Hud. Pow. A War.... .
Nile* Bement Pond . . . . . . . . . . .
Nlplailng Mine* .. . . . . .
North Am. Util Sac. .. . . . . . . .
Northern State* Pow. A..;.. .—
Outboard Motor A . . . . . . . . . .
Park* D*vU . . . . . . . . .—....
Pannroad Corp..... .. ... . . .
Pub. Util. Holding X. W... ....
ShtUuek Denn . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Standard Oil. Ind. .. . . . . . ...
Stand. Oil, Ky, .. . . . . . . . . . . .
Stand. Oil. Ohio .. . . . . . . . . . . .

2.06
11.60

4.75

4.01
62.00
10.60
12.00

74.00

4.00
1.26
2.87

24.60 
14.26
27.60

>.•**•***•*••«•••••*

zzz:::u;:z
#**•«••**••* i •*#**■•..«

45.60
17.26
28.60 
19.00 
80.00
9.60

14.00
10.00
10.62
40.60
28.00
2.12

19.tfl 
8.00 

.> 6.00 
12.00 
1.00 ,1.8 
8.62 
2.26

28.26
21.87
10.87 
0.27 
8.00

. 1.60 
17.76 

.61.00 
20.50 
0.26 

12.12 
7.00 

40.00 
7.00 
1.76 
12.26 
11.00 
12.26 
>0.62 
1.00 
>12 

11.62 
M? 
2.00 

*4.8(

Stand. Pow. A Light ..........
Strombrrg Carlson ....„. . . ... . . .
Sluts Motor Car Am. ........... . . . .  „
Swift A Co. New
Swift Int- . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 21.00
Texas Oil A Und . . . . . . .. . . .  10.00
Trsnscont. Air Trans. .. . . .. . . .  4.00
United Founders . . . . . . . ____  2.67
United Gas . . . . . . . . . . . ....  4.25
United Lt. A Pow. A .... _ _ _ _ _  8.87
United Verde Ext. . . . . . . .. .  4.09
Util. Pow. A Lt. B Ctf... ... .
"tility ,A Industries.. ...... .. . . .  2.76
Vick Flftanee . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4.62
Woodley Petrol . . . . . . . ...

Total atock sale* . . . . . . . .. 610.000
Total stick salts yr. ago. . 8ILS47
Total bond sale* . . . . . . — ... $5,000,000
Total bond sales yr. ago...... ... $1,904,000

liV John If. COOIeMY
(AMiKiatad Pr*»» Financial Writer I
New York, riant. * tflV A owlft 

ifpclloe lit- fotton fuiurtio n«pre- 

Siittlns iu*! oiHtM of about Jf. u 
half, brotisl:' hauvy Gfteri.<K« Into 
Hut aim k msrkM od»ty and uhart 
yaltuui w» rv pared dowi,, in 
iiihInni-wit rether gvnerouKly.

AlthntIKli yhlllllK Hftg Ml A brink 
puce »t UnifH dll ring the ufier- 
nonn, filing >.he tun.ovar to B,* 
392.040 ithnr“8. or the aatoud 
largest volume ihls year, declines 
were Insufficient to cinral ..ester- 
dsy’a Rvcrage gain. The net loss 
of 90 Issues was 2.7 against Wed-
nesday's rU» of 3.2.

Until the government'll crop re-
port, entimutlng a larger produc-
tion than had been expected on 
the basin At private forecasts, set 
cotton futures tumbling, stocks 
had been able to work Irregularly 
higher, thanks to bullish demon-
strations In rails,, foods and what-
ever Isaues proved responsive.
The close relationship between 

cotton and share prices, recently 
so much In \ey!dence, was clearly 
demonstrated when that staple be-
gan Its slide after publication of 
the crop figures. Although bulls 
were still Inclined to fight the dip 
whenever they* saw opportunity, 
their efforts were of little avail 
against the dominant downward 
trend. l>. H. (Heel lost more than 
3 points, Bethlehem more than l, 
Allied Chemlcgl, American Tele-
phone. Case. Bu PonVUnlon Car-
bide, Weotlnghouse, North Ameri-
can, Consolidated Qaa, Western 
Union and United Aircraft 2 to 3, 
and a large number at least a 
point..

Scattered figures on car load-
ings for last week, available for 
several large systems including 
New York Central and Pennsylva-
nia, showed moderate gains In 
freight movements, and appeared 
to have prompted the morning's 
spurt by carrier shares.

Trading Volume Is 
Heavier As Curb 

Shares Go Lower
New York, Sept 8 (/P)—With 

trading volume reaching 660,000 
shares, 10 percent higher than* 
yesterday, the curb market wav-
ered today under steady profit- 
taking which developed Into aome- 
thing of a rout for some of the 
more active Iibum as the aeeslon 
closed.

Aluminum Co. which recently 
touched a new 1932 high at 90 
gave way 7*i points to close at 
77)4. Electric Bond and Share 
which this week had made fairly 
ateady gains after Its setback of 
early last week, broke about 5 
polnU.
The utility-stocks as a rule, 

however, showed a firm under-
tone, Cities Service common gave 
up only a fraction and net gains 
were recorded by American Light 
t Traction and the United Light 
t Power Issues.
The Swift stocks were fraction-

ally lower. Parker Rustproof was 
an exception to the main trend, 
running up more than 6 points on 
relatively small turnover.

JUST GETTING STARTED

El Paso, Tex.—Mrs. H. Foster 
Ruins, 50, is just beginning to 
enjoy life. Recently this "flying 
grandmother of the east" took off 
from the municipal airport In her 
own open cockpit plane for Los 
Angeles. Long flights are noth-
ing to her. She holds a private 
pilot's license and has more than 
250 hours solo flying to her cred- 

•It.

CHICAGO LARD 
ChleasA, Sept. 8- Cub lard, 6.16.

CHICAGO EGGS
Chicago, Sepl. •- Kfjra 7,4761 firm ; ex-

tra Aral*, rarlou. IS'^: freah «r*d*<l Aral*, 
carhta, Ills; <urr*n* rreripta, 14 to 161-4.

CHICAGO BUTTER 
Cbieato, Sept. i-BoUer wa* »t**dy to-

Fmhi 98 .ii,ra, 21 to SIM; N. 10'4; 11. 
20: 90, IS; 60. 171,; 06. if; 67. 10.

C*nt*allu>l rarlois; P0 (core. 19',i,; 09, 
II; *0. IU*.

CHICAGO POTATOEK 
Chicago, Hail. S r-iiatoc* 6j, on track 

'.69.- tote I I'. & «htpmenu 640: weaker on 
wrtlero (lock. tOady to ttronser on north- 
arm trading fair; WUcontin cobbler*. .70 
to .76; MinnNoU early Ohio*. .16 to .76; 
Idaho ru*«ete, 1.20 to 1.26; hlla* triumph*.
1.60 to 1.10.

CHICAGO GRAIN
Chicago. Sept. 6—Jollad by cotton mar-

ket tumble* *nd by •normou* rural d*llv- 
•rU* of wh*at In Canada, grain value*
• offered material aetbaak* today.

Rallie* in wheat b«cau»e of evening up 
i>r the government grain crop report due 
tomorrow felled to hold. The downturn* 
carried wheat to 8Vi cent* a btiahal under 
Tuaaday'o hlah point.
Wheat cloeed nervou*. 1-4 pi 1 cent lie-, 

low yceterday'* AnUh. corn 6-8 to 8-4 
down, oat* V* to M 'olf, and provlelon* 
varying from 12 cent* decline to a ri»e of 
12 rent*.

Liberal tecelpla of corn had a bearleh 
rfleet on corn and oat*.

PrpvUlona averaged lowar with grain* 
and cotton.
Cloning Indcmnltlaa: Wheat—December. 

66 7-6 t> 64. 67 6-8 to 8-4; Mm. M to 
61 1-8. M 8-4. Corn - D*cemher. >2 8-8. 
18 1-1; May. 87 l-A, 88.

CHICAG4) LIVESTOCK ‘ 
Chicago. Sept. I—Hog» 18,000, Including 

8,000 dlraet; muetly 6 to 10 higher; 160 to 
220 lh« , 4.00 to 4.70; top 4.71; 110 to 260 
lb*.. 4.46 to 4 66; 270 to 116 lb*.. 4-19 to 
4.46; 140 to 170 lb*., 4.00 t> 4.60: pig*. 
8.26 to 8.76; packing /ma*. 8.86 to >.76; 
Smooth aort* to 4.00.

Cattle > .000, e»Iv«a 1.699: general un 
dertono »**k to lower; vary little Hone; 
largely *teer and yearling run with 
weighty bullock* acarce; ahlpptr lemand 
narrow early; beat 19,CO; talking general-
ly weak to 85 lower on rank and Ale light 
steer* and yearling*.
Sheep 15,049; moat rU**** fully ateady; 

range lamb* un*o!d; dtalrabl* native*, 
AJo to 6.31; aeveral l‘i*ib. 450: hlddln
6.60 to 8.75 on good watUrna; beat hel 
above I.OIt lamb*, 90 lh« down. guo«l and

^lee, 6,60 to 6.6U; tnedl itn, 4.76 to 6.60;
wright*. common. 8.60 to 4.76; _ _ _

09 to 160 Iba.. medium to rhnlce, 1.50 to 
2.60; all wriahta. cull ind common, 1.00 
to 2 90; feeding lamha, 85 to 75 lb*., good 
and choice. 4.7l to 5.26.

'MONEY RATKg
New York. Sept. I—Call money, ateady 

2 percent all day.
Tim* loam, iteady; 60 day*. 1 to l'H 

> to 0 month*, IV* to 14 percent. .
Prime commercial paper, 2.
Banker*’ acceptance*, unchanged.

BOND MARKET AVERAGES 
(By The Aaaeriaud Pr***) 

lOapyright. 1081 *•
Standard Statiatlea Co.)

Thurtday 
Pr*. Day 
Week Ago >.. 
Month Ago ..
Year Ago 
•2 Yra. Ago 
1 Yn. Ago ..
Hilh (10*81.
Low (1*18)^. 41.3 
Hiyh (19811„ 10.4 
l ow (10I1)..M 42.8

'HI
Ind'I* 
44.7

•.. 41.6
... 44.4
„ 82.1
... 44.4

Si

24
Sri*
11.4
.n3
itl
41.7
•24
199.4 
101.8 
78 9
47.4 
106.7
62.1

20
Ufa
16.1

K:5
MO#
•4.4
1N.I
40.7
16.7 
70.0
KM ' 
84.2

40
Total
70.1
7*0
76.1
60.1 
•1.0
101.1

w
57.5
01.7
61.6

eho
all

Gasoline Blending 
Checked By State

FOREIGN EXCHANGES 
New York. Sept. 8 Forrign '«l>«ng* 

eaay. Great BrlUln In dollar*, other* tn 
cente. Great Britain demand. I.« 
cable*. 8.48 8-4; «0^ay WIJ*.
Fran*, demand. 1.41 4-14: «•«>'•?; 6*8 ’
Italy demand. (iWi 
Demand*: Belgium. 18;»5;

26.77':; Holland. 40.11: Norway. 17. '7;

New York, Sept. 8 (/P)—The 
bund market was Inclined to mark 
lime today *> It observed the un 
certain movement of stocks and 
commodities.

Except In the foreign depart-
ment, the activity wan rather rs- 
Htrleted. Sales totaled UL380.- 
000, par value, and the average 
for 60 corporate Ioann advanced 
one-tenth of a point.

South American laHues were In 
demand. Australian bond8 re-
flected accumulation and those of 
France were up around a point. 
The Germans closed barely steady 
after an early advance.

Loans of the speculative rail 
category generally Indicated re-
sistance to "roflt taking. Gains 
and losses In this grotlp, however, 
were usually fractional.
, The utilities and Industrials. n« 
a whole, were unchanged.
. Some United Staten treasury 
bonds advanced moderately, but 
Interest in thlj section dwindled.

WHAT STOCK MARKET DID
(By Th* Aaaecialad Pr***)

‘Thurs. Wed. 
Number of advances — 288 495 
Number of declines —- 416 164 
Stocks unchanged   160 118

Total Issues traded- - -  843 767

govkrnmentIonda
New York Sept. »--cio#1ng price*;

. Liberty SVt*. 82-47. 100.80.
Liberty Ut 4W*. 31-47. 102.2.
Liberty 4th 4^#. II-IS. 101.4.
Treaaury 4V;*. 4742, 107.22.
Tre«*ury 4t. 44-64, 104.4.
Treaaury 3 >-4*. 4440, 102.4.
Tiea^ury > l-S*. 40-48. June. 100.22.
Treasury > MU. 41-47, 100.18.
iVeaaury 1 8-Si. l1-4>. March. 100.20.
Treaaurjr 3 MU. 46-49. 98.5.
Treasury >». 61-56. 06 24. f

Lansing—"Enclosed find our
check for $174.69 covering tax on . . . . . . . . . .
kerosene used In blending gaso- awedm.' 17.M: Denmark, ll.oo;
un*." i" i"« »!«'•'s’’-
celved from a conscience stricken 0r#*c,' ,x'
Michigan dealer In gaaollne py 
Frank D. FHtgerald, Secretary of 
State. The conscience money rep-
resents three cents per gallon on 
5,823 gallons of kerosene which 
the dealer admits was used by 
him In blending gasoline over a 
period "of approximately onn yenr.
The dealer further states that In 
order 10 produce a cheap grade of 
gasoline he mixed one gallon of 
kerosene to nine gallon* of gaso-
line. also giving the Information 
that the juactlce has been abaoji " ~
doned since the Federal law r« », September 4,1411 Stpumber 23.14>2. 
cently went Into effect, which latf p*tiIEc0/rtMffrH,th. c!ounty of

Ctechoelovakla, (si 2.46U: Jug«l»vla. JJ 
1.74; Auatrla, (a) 14.MJ iumama.
.60 >-4; Argentine, 25.74: Bratll. Is' 7-5J - 
Tokyo. 2>.44< Shanghai, »L>7H; H-ntr*al. 
•0.66 8-4; Mexico City <*llv*r pc«ol 30 90. 

(»|--Noo»lnal rat*.

MINNBAFOLIB. GRAIN [ 
Mlnncapolia, Sept. 4-Flour unchanged. 

ShlpmenU 21.70>.
Bran. 8.60 to 0.04. ...
Wheat. No. 1 northern. 65 7-8 to *4 7-8; 

Na U rad durum. 4> »-*; September. 
8> 7-41 December, I6M; May. 54. .
Com. No. > yellow, 29 to >0.
Gate. No, I• Orbit*. 17'4 to 17 8-4.
_ “l, LOU* to 1.Flax. No.
Yl -w

defines a blender as a producer 
and necesnltafen the reporting of 
motor fuels compounded or blend-
ed and the payment of tax of one 
cent per' gallon on the blended 
product.

The field service of the Gaso-
line Tax Division has. for the past 
several months, been extensively 
engaged In Investigating the final 
disposition of nil consignments of 
kerosene and distillate purchased 
by gasoline dealers from refiner-
ies. both within and without the 
state. Investigators have been 
stationed at aeveral refineries to 
check all sales of keroseno and 
distillate to dealers. Recently an 
audit was made of one gasoline 
dealer's records and the purchase 
of 7,000 gallons of distillate was 
found unaccounted for In the 
sales records. Unless this dealer 
can produce evidence of actual 
sales of this nontsxable product, 
ho will be assessed the stalk tax 
of three cents per gallon. The 
presumption., based on analysis of 
samples of gasoline taken from 
his station, is that the non-tax- 
nble product was blended to pro-
duce a motor fuel.

Illinois Wesleyan College has 
announced It wil accept farm pro-

duce In payment of fees. That 
may be all right to pay the facul-
ty members with, but we’ll bet the 
football team will demand cash.

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING RAIL 
Dally rate, conaecutlve iniertlon*

Rate per line Charge Caah
On* Tinte ••••(****e*e«>**e****(M*«**aMM**e • It It
Three Tlmei ......- - - - - - -   .14 .10
Six Time* . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11 .06

WHEN AND WHERE TO PLACE 
WANT ADS

The Clwined Advertialng . Department 
la altuatad at

tOO-102 LUDINGTON 8T.
Theee office# are open to receive •dv?r* 

tlaemant* from I a. m. to 4 p. m., dally. 
All ad* received up until 6 p. m. will ap-
pear In edition* the following day. 
PHONE YOUR CLASSIFIED AD to III 
Th* ad taker will gladly a»«l*t you. if 

dealrad. io that the eepy fer your *4 1* 
repared In 'gueh a mannar. aa to brim 

graalMt reaulta for you.Z'
CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING

INI(FORMATION

Error* in adrartiacmcnte ahould 
Diported immediately. Th* Dally 

not he r**pon»lb!o for more th

he re- 
Preei will 
an ena In-

correct In 
All ada

naertion. 
are rcotrict

The 
about
talkex will 
150 woms;A;i

average talker speaks at 
90 words a minute; a fast 

ill often hit a clip of 
minute.

DAY’S MARKETS 
IN BRIEF

New York, Sept. 8,(A1)—
Stocks: Weak; leaders react In 

active selling.
Bonds: Steady; foreign list ac-

tive.
Curb: Heavy; some leaders dip 

sharply.
Foreign Exchanges: Steady; 

sterling easy.
Cotton: Lower; bearish govern-

ment report; general selling.
Sugar: Quiet; poor spot de-

mand.
Coffee: Higher; European buy-

ing.
Chicago:
Wheat: Easy: sharp decline 

cotton; selling eastern houses.
Corn: Easy; bearish Iowa state 

reports: forecast larger Argentine 
exports .

Cattle: Weak to lower.
Hogs: Higher.

BOSTON COPPERS 

Bo*tun. Sepl. 8 Cloelng:
Anaconda ............................

Calumet A Heel* . . . . . . . . . .
Copper Range ... .. . . . . . . .
lal* Royle . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
North Butt* . . . . . . . . . . . . .

•#**«»«»»*•••♦••<

Ferry Schedule
Automobile Car Ferry Service 

Straits of Mackinac

Regular Scheduled Trips 
(Eastern Standard Time) 

I/eave St. Ignace—4:30 a m., and 
every hour thereafter up to 10:30 
p. m., Inclusive, with extra boat at 
1:30 a. m.

I^eave Mackinaw City- 6 a. m,. 
and every hour (hereafter up to 
10 p. in., Inclusive, also extra boats 
at 12 midnight and 3 a. m.

ted to their proper
_ _ _ _ _ . the regular Dally
Free* »tyle of type. Th# puhlUher* re- 
ierve the right to edit or reject any clanl- 
fled advertialng • copy.,
Advertbinu ordered for Irregular inacr- 

lion* take* tha one tlm* rate. No ad I* 
taken for lea* than a bail* of three line*. 
Count alx average word* to the line. An 
averagw word contain* ilx Utter*.
Account* unpaid after 20 day* will not 

be granted further credit.
Charged ada will be recrivad by tale- 

phon*. and If paid at tha pally Preai of-
fice within alx day* from Int flrat day of 
Inaertlon caih rate* will he allpwrd.
Ada entered for tl\re# or ilx time* and 

atopped before expiration will be charged 
for only the number of time* tha ad ap-
peared and adjuatment made at the rate 
earned.

Socletios and LodgM

Delta Lodge No. 195
Regular meeting 3rd Thurtday aach month

i-uR SALE- Coach body mouir and radiat-
or for 4 eyllnder Chevrolet. AI»o 4 *fhf«l 
trailer. 610 8. 17thJit. 7»l-263-2t

FOR SALK OR RENT-Ch##P, my eottagT- 
on North Tenth, garage and garden plot. 
B. It. Mioki, (lladatonv- G0206-262-8t 

HOME BAKING-Ordera taken'ln advance 
and dellveria*. W. J. Vorin. 012 R 10th
StL Phone 478-W._ _ _ _ _ _ 7»»f-14Mt

FOR SALE—4 truck lire eaalng*. to x 6*. 
In good condition. Call 408.

7411-261-81 _ _ _ _

FOR RENT
TOR RENT- 2 fiTmlthed room* for ill
housekeeping. Inquire at 210 N. 11thInquln 

7«14-26#-2t
FOR RENT--6 room upatalra. 1*16 Sec-
ond Av*. 8. 7926.26841

FOR RENT-1 or 8 large pleaiint fur-
niihcd room* for light housekeeping. 
Modern and centrally located. Ili 8. 
2nd Ave. 760l:25!-2t

FOR RENT S room modern cottage, beau-
tiful location, corner Lake Shore Drive 
and Bay Street. Will be vacant Sept 20.

* .252-11Call BOO, before 11 a. 7619.26
TOR RENT Modern 5 room cottag* with 
furnace. $20 a month. Call 414 between 
10 and 12 a. m. and 1:10 and I p. m.

7018462-11 •
FOR HENT—On* four rown and .on* alx

‘ N. 191k Si ,room hou»*. Inquire 328 
7118461-81

FOR RENT-0 room mxlern houie at 111
S. 14th 8t. Inquire upetelr* at aam* 
addraaa. 7028462.31

heatad
garage.

•arge, modern furoiihcd, 
downstair* apartment, with 
402 8. 18th St. 7*1746141

FOR RENT—Three furnlahed room* for 
light houiekeeplng in modern home. 1014 
Second Ave. south. Phone 2042. *

7607-24841
... wat
heated upper flat. Corner of lit Av 
and 201 8. 19th St. Phone 216.

_ _ _ _ _ 758244741
FOR RENT—I room* downstair* with 

bath, gaa and garage. Inquire 820 So. 
12th atreel 7400-22741

lluglneM and ProfeMlonal Servlc*

“SIGNS BY MEIERS”
Insure Beat Result*. 
Everything In Signs.

Phono 1488. 421 8. 13th.

V. R. Blometrom, Opt. D.
OPTOMETRIST 
GlaMK* Fitted 

Honrs 0 to 12—1:80 to 5 
Evenings by Appointment 
211 HUGHITT BUILDING 

1108 Lmllngton St.
Phona Dflfi

“denisIic'ginn
ATTORNEY AT LAW 

218 Hugtiitt Bulhling 

1103 Ludington Street 

T«lei»l»«ne 514

Cash For Late Model 
Used Cars

BADGER MOTOR CO.
1628 LUDINGTON, STREET

Electrical Repair Work
Overhauling washing machines, 

vacuum cleaners and all other 
electrical appliances.

All work ‘fully guaranteed — 
Rates reasonable.

Roy E. Swaby Phone 1490-W

’Ik* Probate Cjurt
DELTA. . . ■ .
At a aaailon of *ald Court, held at tha 

Probate Office tn the City of Kaeanabg, In 
■aid County, on the aecond day of Stptcrp- 
Ur. A. D. 1082.

Praaent: Hon. Judd Yelland. Judge of 
Prohate. . „ •

In the Matter of th* EateW of Henry 
Jahnke, Deceased.
Henry Jahnke, Jr., aon and executor 

named in th# iait will and tealament at 
•aid deceased, having filed hi* petition, 
praying that in Initrument flted in caid 
Court be admitted to Probate a* the la*t 
will and testament of said deceaird and 
that adrtlnUtratlon of said *«tate be grant- 
ed to Henry Jahnke, Jr., .or *ome othfr 
•ultahle peraoa. ...

It la Ordarad. That th* third day of Oc- 
tober. A. D. 1932. at ten A. M„ at said 
Probate Office I* hereby appointed In 
hearing aald petltten.

It I* Furthar Ordered. That Public mute 
thereof he given by publication of « eop> 
hereof, once each wrtk. for three »ucee». 
aive week# previoui to said day of hearing 
In the Kaeanaba Dally Pre**. a newipaper 
printed and circulated in said County.

• JUDD YELLAND.
Judge of Probate.

A true copy.
MARIK D. PETERS.

Register of Probate.

September 2. 1932 September 10. 1332 
STATS OF MICHIGAN.

The Probate Court for the County of 
Delta.
At a »e*ilon of said court, held at the 

probate office. In the city of Eicanab*. 
In aald county, on thl thirtieth day of 
Augurt A. D. 1982.

Praaent! Hon. Judd Yelland. Judge of 
Probate.
In the Matter of the Eatetc of Abbia 

A. Kalao. Deceased. •
C. E. Kelao having filed in said court 

hi* petition praying that Benjamin 1 
Bauch or aome aulUbte pereon be a1 
pointed trustee of laid truit rotate.

It D Ordered, that Monday the tw*r 
ty-aixth d4y of September A. D. IPi. 
at ten o’clock In the forpnoon. at *hI 
probate office, be and la hereby appoint 
ed for hearing *ald petition:

It is Furth*r Ordered. That public 
tlce thereof he given by publication of a 
cmy of thi* order, for three aueeeealve 
week* previous to said day of hearing, 
in the Eeeanaha Dally Pm*, a newer* 
per printed and circulated In laid county.

JUDD YELLAND.
Judge of Prohgte.

A true cdpy.
Mart* D. Peter*.

Register of Probate.

September 2. 1912 September 16. 1932 
STATE OP MICHIGAN.

The Probate Court for the County of 
Delta.
At a a union of said Court, held at the 

Probate Office In the City of Facanaha. 
in aald County, on the twenty-ninth day 
of Auguit A. D. 1911.

Present! Hon. Judd Yelland, Judge Of 
Probate.
In the Matter of the Estate of Adele 

Urns*. Deceased.
Frank Rome, executor of said estate, 

having filed In said court hi* final ad-
ministration account, and hli petition

Sraying for the alltwance thereof and for It aaaignment and distribution of the 
residue of aald estate.
It la Ordarad. That the twenty-sixth day 

of September A. D. 1982, at ten o’clock 
In the forenoon, at said probate offlee, be 
and is hereby appointed , for examining 
and allowing said account and hearing 
•aid petition;.,.

It la Further Ordered. That public no-
tice thereof ba'givon by publication of 
a copy of thia order, for three eucceaslve

Sick* previoui to laid day of hearing, in 
e Eeeanaha Daily Pr***. a newspaper 
printed .and circulated in iaid county.

JUDD YELLAND. 
Judge of Probate.

A true copy.
Marie D. Peter*. /

Register of Probate.

September 2. 1982 , September 16. 1932 
STATE OF MICHIGAN.

The Probate Co»(rt for th* County of

At • session of uld Cwrt, held »t the 
Probate Office In th* City of Eacanaba. 
In said County, on th* twenty-ninth day 
of August A. D. 1012. ...
Proent: Hon. Judd Yelland, Judy* of

Ip the Matter of th« Estate of Harold 
K. (Hal K.) Rammel. . Deceased.
Om* Rammel, admintetratri* of said #*• 

t»te. having filed in said court har P*' 
titlon, prayipg for lleens# tv sell th* in- 
terael of said ratat* In certain real aatat* 
therein described,

it la Ordered. Tkat tlm twenty-sixth 
day of September A. D. 1412. at ten 
o'clock In th# forenoon. «t **ld probate 
office, he and la hereby appointed for 
hearing aald petition.'and tnal all D«r- 
•on* Interested In said aatat* appear bo- 
fur* aald court, at aald time and p!sc«. ti 
show cauie why a license to icll the Id- 
teresl of said citato In aald real Mtate 
ahould not be granted;

It I* Further Ordered. That public no-
tice thereof be given by publication of a 
copy, of thla order, for three. iucc#*alve 
week* prevloti* to laid day of hairing. In 
the K.ieanaha Dally Free*, a newspaper 

.nd

Judge of Prob6t*.
A true copy.
Marl* D. Poter*,
Register of Probate.

of

Auguit 26. 1482. September 9. 1482 
STATE OF MICHIGAN.

Tha Probate Court for the County 
DELTA. « t
At a leasion of laid Court, held at th* 

Probate Office In th* City of Eicanaba. 
In said county, on the twenty-aecond day 
of Auguit. A. D. 1982.

Prcwent: Hon. Judd Yelland. Judge of 
Probate.

In ih# Matter of the Eatot# of Andrew 
G. England. Deceased.
Hannah England, widow and heir at 

law of said deceased, having filed in *ild 
;itirt her petition praying that th* ad- 
nlniitration of said estate he granted to
h» State Saving* Bank of F^canaba.
Ilchlgan. or to tome other suitable per- 

•on,
It la Ordered, That the nineteenth day 

of Steptrmber, A. D. 1482. at ten o'clock 
in the forenoon, at said probate office, b# 
and I* hereby appointed for hearing said 
petition:

it 1* Further Ordered. That public no-
tice thereof bo given by publication of a 
copy' of thla order, once each week for 
three successive week* previous to said 
day of hearing, In the Eeeanaha Daily 
Prei*. a newspaper printed and circulated 
in said county.

JUDD YELLAND.
Judge of Probate, i

A true copy.
MARIE D. PETERS.
Register of Probate.

FOR HAMS

WOOD-Drv 
’ll

Hardwood 86.50. Diamond
Pole A Piling Co. Phone 1060. C-lll 

FOR SALE Hardwood, three single cords. 
$6.00. Inquire A. Arbour, 321 Luding- 
ton St. Phone 956-J. 7684.247-41

DRY HARDWOOD
..Alio coal.

$6.60. dry softwood 
$4.60. Alio coal. Scalander Yard. Phone
1$0». _ _ _ _ _ __ C-262_

FOR BALE OR EXCHANGE-011 burner 
fir Heatrola. Inquire 150$ Minn.. Glad-
stone^ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ . 06206.261-31

FOR SALE - Second hand furniture, all 
reflnlshed, lojks like new. Dining room 
and bedroom set*. 426 S. 14th St.

7613-26141 \ •
FOR SALE - One good black team, weight 
thirty-two hundred. Will be aold cheap 
for cash. Delta Hardware Company.
Main Store._ _ _ _ _ _  7691-248-6!

FOR SALE--Good land.” partly improved. 
Very cheap, good terms, or will trade for 
what have you. E. T. King, Cooks.
_ _ _ £____ 99684524J_ _ _ _ ’ ; ^
FOB SALE--Household furniture including 
piano, Vlrtrola. radio. bcdrOom suites. 
dUhre. rug*, bnokoase, sewing machine. 
1706 Fifth Ave. S. 7627-28241

LOST AND FOUND
PARTY WHO PICKED up brown leather 
pune lj*t between Delta Co. Road com-
mission, Wells, going north to trunk line 
was seen. If not returned prosecution 
will follow. 7609-261-81

FIVE DOLLARS REWARD for return of 
girl*’ bicycle to 905 First Av*. S. No 
questions asked. 7810-26341'

Card of Thanks

We wish to express our sincere apprecia-
tion and thanks to all the kind relative*, 
neighbors and friends who assisted ut dur-
ing our recent bereavement, the death of 
our beloved daughter and granddaughter. 
We are very grateful to Rev. R. C. G. Wll- 
liama for hi* consoling words and other 
manifestations of sympathy. t > those who 
furnished their car*, sent floral offering* 
and all those who In any way helped ue to 
bear our sorrow. These act* of kindneoa 
can never be forgotten.

MR. AND MRS TOM MARTIN, 
MRS. E. J. KIRKPATRICK.

76S6.251.lt ,

Two former governors of 
North Carolina were born the 
same year In the same housed 
near Asheville. They were D. L. 
Swain and Joseph Lain.

Upholstering, Repairing, 
Refinishing , 

Custom Built Furniture 
Lowest Prices*

KHCANABA FURNITURE SH01» 
718 Ludington St.

Phone 2057

WANTED
WANTED—Salesladies for ladiee' shop, 
Apply 910 Ludingt.n St. _ 7681-258-11

WANTED—Can use a number of men and 
high school atudenta to sell $26.00 service 
books for $2.00. Call at Eacanaba Motor 
Co., between 12 and 1:00 p. m. any day 
this week and nk for Mr. Johnson,' 

76l8-26$-U
LEAVING FOR DETROIT Monday. Can 
accommodate three. Call 828-W. '

*. 7632-253-1t -V
WANTED—Two men with car*, lervlee 
. station and chain store experience. Im-
mediate and permanent employment. 
Give full particulars first letter. Box 
7621, care of Dally Press. 7621-25241 

CHIMNEYS AND FURNACES.cl*an*d for 
half price. Call Phone 702. 7500.240.12', 

WILL SERVE Six'OCI.OCK dinners to 
teacher* and office help. All hdme cook 
inn. 1318 First Ave. South. Telephnn1 
1482-J. ^ 7616-26141

Grant Britain Is about 
times the she of Ireland.

threr

Auguit 26. 1912. ■ Stepternber 9. 1932 
STATE OF MICHIGAN. .

The Prohgte Crnrt for the County ol 
DELTA . . ■
At a session of said Court, held at th-1 

Probate Office in the City of Escanaha, 
In said County, on the twentieth day of 
August. A. D. 1422.

Present. Hon. Judd Yelland. Judge of 
Probate.

In the Matter of the Estate of Wendla 
Holme*, Deceased.

S. Harry Holmes, administrator of said 
estate, having filed In aald court hi* final 
administration account, and his petition 
praying for the allowance thereof and for 
the assignment and distribution of the 
residue of aald eatatt.

It U Ordered. That the nineteenth day 
of September. A. D. 1982, at ten o'clock 
in the forenxm, at said probate offiefi 
be and ja hereby appointed for examining 
and allowing said account and hearing 
said petition;

It la Further1 Ordered. That public no- 
tlce thareof be given by publication of a 
copy of this order, for thrtc aucceasly* 
weeks previous to said day of hearing, in 
the Eacanaba Dally Preea. a newspaper 
printed and circulated in said cjunty.

JUDD YELLAND.
Judge of Probate. •

A true copy. . ‘
MARIE D. PETERS.

Register of Probate. . ' '

Auguit 26, 1982. September 9. 1952
STATE OF MICHIGAN..

The Probate Court for the County of 
DELTA. .••>>
In the Matter of tlic Eatate of Joseyh 

Dolor Cowette. Deceased.
Notice la hereby given that four months 

from the twanty-seeond day of August, 
A. D. 1912. have bee.*, allowed for credit-
or* to pr.aent their claims apainat said 
deceased to said court for examination and 
adjustment, and that all creditors of said 
deeatuted are required to present their 
claims to said court, at the probate office 
in the City of Eacanaba in said county, on 
or bcf.'re the thirtieth- day of Septem-
ber. A. D.. 1932. and that said claim* will 
he heard b'y said court, on Tutaday. the 
•.bird day of January, A. D. 1933, at ten 
.Vlnck in the forenoon.
Dated August 22. A. D. 1982.

JUDD YELLAND.
Judge of Probate.

SALESMAN SAM By Small

\ BoyisJ’ K&MfrAfcoos

BC€M SLAPPIM1 ^ AROUMO .
PueMTVjSANi'.T^ATs niUhW:

VCAH? VietL, He

CAM DO TH’ SAME, 
"uuuo ta Sou ,too, 

HOWiftl

UAnseRT"

The: Bo*ik1<S- 

he. DROPS
^admishum bits

<Oi

Mot tte, BRdTHeRl \ could lick a'
_ ooiem op 'eh vahTU okIe hamo!

z7-

h^\\\///.

ftPob

sfkS, chief, \'u. sv'/E ''/a Tew bucks if Soou 
BOflLROVJ WER KaMOAPOO FER A U'L WHILE — \ (SoTTA 
HUNCH I CAM MAKE <SOOD USE. OF HltV,

■Hills'

U •

Ik*' •.

\U\%

\jU< '•
4ft, » ism rr w* agwuiex. me. «■ •

September 2, 1982 September 16. 1982 
STATE OF MICHIGAN.

Th* Probate Court for the County of 
Delta.
At a session of said Court, held at the 

^robot* Office in the City of Kscanaba. 
i said County, on the thirty-first day of 
igust A. D. 1932.
Present! Hon. Judd Yelland. Judge of 
mbit*.
In the Matter of the Estate of Andrew 

oluninkl. Deceased.
H. J. Rushton, the Public Administra-

tor. administrator of said Mtate. having 
filed in said court hi* petition, praying for 
Mcenae to selFThe interest qf said eelalo 
In certain real rotate therein described,

It I* Ordered, Tkat the twenty-iixlh 
day of September A. D. 1482. at ten 
o’clock in the forenoon, at said prob*7 
office, bo and i* hereby appointed frr 
hearing said petition, and that at) per-
son* Interested in laid eatate appear be-
fore said court, at said time and plgcr, 
o ihow cauae why a liceme to sell the 
merest of aald rotate' in said real estate 
should not be granted:

It la Further Ordered. That public no-
tice thereof be given by publlcatbn of a 
copy of thi* order, for three succroslv* 

tk* previous to said day of hearing, in 
tho Eacanaba Dally Pres*, a newspaper 
printed and circulated In aald county.

JUDD YELLAND. 
Judge of Probate.

A true copy.
Marie D. Peters,

Register , of Probate.

STATE OF MICHIGAN 
In the Circuit Ceurt for th* County of 
y Deltat In Chancery.
At a special session of said court held at 

the City of Marquette, in said County of 
Marquette, on the- 22nd day of August. 
A. D. 1482. ■ t

Present: Honorable Frank A. Hell, Cir-
cuit Judge. . s

In the Matter of the Dissolution ) 
of the Eacanaba OIL Company. I 
upon Petition hy a majority of ) . ~
tha Board of-Directors thereof. J 

In this cause it appearing from the pe- 
tition on tile that the said Escanaha Oil 
Ctmpany is a corporation organised under 
the lawa of the State of Michigan: and 
that Henry M. Stack, GRald J. Cleary, 
John K. Stack, Jr., all of Escanaha. Mich-
igan, and Ruth Stack Carey, of Chicago. 
Ulinoli. are a majority of the directors 
and officer* thereof; and that' the said di- ' 

I rtetors and officers deem It beneficial to 
the crcditora, stockholders, and to the gen-
eral public, and all persons interrotad in 
this corporation that the aims be dissolved, 
that the present place of busineas of said 
corporation is in the City of Escanaha. 
County of Delta, State of Michigan; that 
the business la mainly carried on in said 
county; that Gerald J.' Cleary. Secretary 
of said company, ia the proper person to 
be temporary receiver;
THEREFORE, On Motion of Dcnia Me- 

Ginn. Attorney for said petitioner*. IT IS 
ORDERED that all ereditori and other 
persons interested In said corporation as 
stockholder*, or otherwise, shall ahow 
cause, If any they .have, why the said cor-
poration shall not be dissolved, before 
Honorable Frank A. Bell. Circuit Judge, 
on the 24th day of September, A. D. 1932. 
in the Court House in-the City of Eacana- 
ba. County of Delta, and State of Michi-
gan. at 9:00 o'clock* A. M.. E. 8. T.; and 
IT IS FURTHER ORDERED. That Ger-

ald J. Cleary of Eacanaba. County of Del- 
ta, and State of Michigan, he temporary 
receiver, with full power* to conserve the 
property, huslnro* and said affect* of said 
corporation, and collect the account* re-
ceivable until the appointment of a perms- 
nent receiver; said Gerald J. Cleary tu 
give bind is such temporary receiver in 
the amount.of $5,OOO.U<t; and f 
1T*JS FURTHER ORDERED, Tkat said 

petitioner* give notice of the making ot 
this Order and of the hearing tn be had on 
said petition on said last mentioned date 
to all persons interested in this proceeding 
by causing a cipy of this Order to be pub. 
lished in the Escsnaha Daily' Prroi, n 
newspaper published In the City of Esca- 
nalw. in said County of Delta, and State 
of Michigan, once in each week for three 
successive weeks previous to said last men- 
tioned date, and by registered letter ad-
dressed to each of such perions directed 
to their last known addresses or ta their 
addresses aa shown on th* hook* of said 
Company.

FRANK A. BELL.
Circuit Judge.

R. H. LABRE.
Clerk.

Denis McGinn.
Attorney for PstltionOn, - 
Business Address: . .iv
Hughitt Building,
Escanaha. Michigan.

' • 7877.246.3 Frl.

*
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Cubs Split Twin Bill to Increase League Lead
BRAVESTAKE 

NIGHTCAP, 3-2
Bruins Win First, 4-1, 

As Pirates Fall to 
Brooklyn, 12-2

Ho*ton. Sept. 8 (/P)—The pace- 
miking Chicago Cuba added n 
half game to their lead today by 
dividing u doubleheader with the 
nravea while Plttaburgh was los-
ing to Boston. Chicago won the 
first game 4 to 1 behind Charley 
Root and Boh Brown pitched the 
Brave* to a 3 to 2 victory in the 
second.
Ono big Inning decided the 

first gamp and one awat, Wally 
Berger’s 16th . homer of the sea-
son, was almost enough to give 
the Braves the second decision.
‘The Cubs collected only three 

hlta off Ed Brandt In the first 
seven Innings of the opener 'hut 
they broke loose in. the' eighth 
with five blow* and scored all 
their runs. The only Boston run 
came in the first inning on sin 
gles by Maranville. Jordan and 
Handy Moore. After that Root 
held the Braves to three safe-
ties.

Brown pitched another six hit 
game In the nightcap to get the 
better of a duel with Bud Tin-
ning. who granted eight. Ber 
ter’s homer followed Randy 
)orc’s single In the fourth and 
Ive Boston a lead that the Cubs 

never quite overcame. Doubles by 
Kpohror and Maranville In the

Babe Ruth Probably 
Won’t Undergo Knife 
Before World Series

BY EDWARD .1. VKII. 
(Aasociatcd Picas Sports Waiter) 
New, York* Sept. 8 (#)—Fright-

ened and In considerable pain. 
Babe Ruth ckme hurrying home 
from Detroit today to find that 
there Is something wrong with his 
appendix but probably nothing 
severe enough to require an im-
mediate operation.

Visions of another trip to the 
hospitals he has tenanted fre-
quently. through the past half doz-
en years, and the basting of the 
goal of his baseball .dreams, par-
ticipation In hia tenth world se-
ries, haunted baatbaU's greatest 
slugger as he groaned his way 
east on an express tram today. 

Rest Is Ordered 
His fears were allayed, but not 

entirely dissipated by Dr. Edward 
A. King, Ruth'a personal .physi-
cian, as soon aa the Yankee club 
doctor could make an examlna-

Toti'ls ..33 4 0 27 0 1
x—-ran for Hartnett in 8th.

Boston r AB
Maranville 2b 4 
Irrbtfhskl, ss. a 
Jordan. Hi 4 
It. Moore, rf - 4 
Merger! cJU* 
Holland. IT 
Walters. 3I> . 4 

^XtVhrer, c __ 3 
^■‘andt, p '..'2

Totals_

3 •). JL..5 ;<L*tL
PYOVPfc 2 1 0

YANKS AND CUBS 
ADVANCE LEADS
New York Needs Just 4 

More Victories to
seventh brought the other taUy, 
Box score:

(FIRST GAME)
Clinch Flag

Chicago AD It H 0 A E Both major league leaders ran
Herman, 2h > 4 1 l 2 2 ft into tough sledding yesterday in
English. 3b _ 4 1 2 0 1 ft their efforts to capture the pen-
Cuyler, rf -- 4 0 t 1 0 ft pant* In the shortest order.but both
Stephenson If 1 0 2 4 ft ft the New York Yankees and Chica-
Memaree, cf _ 3 ft I 2 ft 0 go Cubs registered gains.

Tho Yanks picked up it full gameGrimm, Ih 4 rt ft 1ft 1 ft
Koenig, ss . 2 0 0 2 2 1 m tho Phi adelphla Athletics when
J urges, s* __ 2 1 1 ft i- ft they won one game of a double-
Hartnett, c . 3 () 1 5 1 n header with Detroit ami tied the
Hack, x — 0 1 ft 0 0 ft second while the A’s lost to Clove-
Hemsley, c - 0s ft 0 1 0 0 lapd. They now need only (our
fttoot. p 2 0 ft •ft 1 0 more victories to clinch the (lag.

The Cubs improved their margin 
over Plttabuigh by a half gamer 
making It fita games, as they divld- 
d a twin bill with Boston while 

the Pirates lost a single game to 
Rfooklyn. Chicago, however; still 
needs to win 13 gomes to clinch, 
provided Pittsburgh takes all Its re-
maining 17 contests. ^
Hero is how ihc clubs.stand:

American League 
■, W. L.«Pet. Behind To Play 

New York-

31 *1 6 27 13 -1

Chicago. . . . . 000 0V0 040—4
Boston______  100 000 000—1
Runs batted' • in—R. Moore. 

Hartnett. Herman. Cuyler 2.
Two base hits—English, DeJ 

mnree, Stephenson.
Three base hits—Cuylerv Hart-

nettv ;
Sacrifices — Urlmnski. Brandt. 

Demarco. • ' . . 'A
Double play—Hartnett to Koc<

ilFv • »
Left on bases—Chicago ft; Bos- 

.on fi.
..Baso on halls-H>ff Root 1.
’ Struck out—by Root 6;
Brandt 2. •
Umpires—Reardon, Uipler and 

Harr. : . - ':v a,
Time—1:28.

j (SECOND (LYME)
Chicago — 000 001 010—2 6 1 
Boston 000 200 lOx—3 8 o 
Tinning and Hartnett; Brown 

and Spohrer. . • t«..v

Kiivanis and Rotary 
To Golf Saturday

iembers of the Ro'ary and Ki- 
clubs will participate in 

their annual inter-club golf tour-
nament at the Esranaha Country 
club's course Saturday afternoon. 
A buffet luncheon will be served 
at the clubhouse at 1:30 o’clock.
The service club golfera al-

ready entered are:
Rotary Cltih ^l'^jS 

M. N. Smith, Captain, T. W. 
Bander, W. R. Smith, Dr. A. 8^ 
Kitchen. H. P. Lindsay, A. H. 
flroesbtick, J. A. Lemmer, C. J. 
Burns, Charles Gunderson, E. C. 
Yoght, G. N. Harder. Dr. O, W. 
Moll. G. R. Stegath, G. C. Graver, 
W. J. Clark. H. D. Brackett. 

Kiwanls Club
H. H. Shepeck, Captain. Q. W. 

Stoll. J. E. Frost, Rev. Berger. A. 
H. Cyr, Dr. H. I. Miller, George 
Petersen. George Potry, Clarence 
Zerbel, Ernest Peterson. Sam 
WICkman.iDj. Rudolph Erickson, 
K. (!. Bennett, A. J. Perrin, W. H. 
Dickaon. Jos. Charlebols.

Pittsburgh Wilts 
Before Brooklyn 

i - By Score Of 12-2
Brooklyn, N. Y., Sept. 8 (>P)- 
ie Pittsburgh Pirates wilted be-

fore Brooklyn's furious attack to-
day and the Dodgers took the 
final game of their series, 12 to 
2.
The Dodgers won the series 2-1 

and the season’s games, 12-10.
Frank O'Doiil led Brooklyn's 

|attack with four hits, two of them 
homers, in four times up. His 
past blow was his 20th of the sea- 
Ison.

Score by innings:
I Pittsburgh 000 010 001-^2 8 3 
]tyooklyn - 102 052 llx—12 17 4 

Chagnou, Spcncre, Brame and 
Grace, Finney; Clark and Lopez.

96 40 .706 .... 18
’hilailelphia— •

81 55 .604 13# 15
Washington— » * .

80 55 .593 ‘15 >4 19
„ National League

Chicago— .v • vVTV.. *V,t *
...... 80 56 .688 . .... 18
Pittsburgh—,,

. .. 75 B*. .517 5\4 17
Brooklyn— •

73,W' .625 8% 15

BASEBALL
STANDINGS

tion of his famous patient at the 
Babe's home this afternoon.

Ruth has "slight symptom* of 
appendicitis," Dr. King said after 
a iwo-hour.,examination. Whit 
he, said that he did not think an 
operation would be n?cessary, he 
ordered’absolute rest,and quiet 
for the, ball player for 24 hours, 
after which a more conclusive ex-
amination can be made.

The Babe's temperature was 
only a shade ubove'normal at Ofl.5 
degrees. His pulse registered 80 
and respiration was normal.
, The entire question of Ruth’s 
participation In the coming world 
series waa studiously avoided by 
all concerned, but It , appeared 
•Ikely that unless the Babe’s con-
dition becomes suddenly worse, a 
few days' rest, careful'treatment, 
and possibly Ice-packs will restore 
the home', run king to beltlnjr 
liealth again In’tlme for the post-
season duels with the National 
League champions, p r o h a b l > 
starting about September 28.

Mrs.* Ruth, after the examina-
tion, appeared worried but not 
unduly alarmed.

"Dr. King told us." she said, 
"that there is something wrong 
with the Babe’s appendix, but Just 
how much isn’t certain. We’l 
know delluitely tomorrow. In the 
meantime we mustn’t let any one 
In to s?e him, not even members 
of the family if it can bo avoided.* 

Greeted by (Yowd
"Babe didn’t tell me a thing 

about it until Monday night, 
about 11 p., m.," she continued, 
^and-Ihen he didn't make much 
of It. You know how he Is. He 
w'oald play ball, so he played at 
Binghamptou Tuasday. If I'd ever 
known he was really fee liifi bad-
ly, I wouldn’t have let him do.it, 
but He wouldn't tell me."

Ruth, worried and nervous, but 
otherwise seemingly healthy, was 
able to leavs the train today un-
der his own power while an ex- 
icted crowd besieged the station, 
watching for the slugger whose 
famous ‘ tummy” ache In 1925 
\yas perhaps the greatest in sports 
history and Inva.lded him for six 
weeYt.

Fearing the Yankee mainstay 
was on the verge of Jnst such an-
other collapse so short a time be-
fore the first world series here in 
three years, the excited r fans 
pressed forward to see for them-

selves. Ruth was able to rally to 
the occasion suflicienHy to waw 
reassuringly to his admirers be-
fore ducking out a side entrance 
to his car. •‘yS >' 1

"1 felt the first pains In my side 
during the double header with the 
Athletics here Monday,-' but I 
didn't think it was- anything. 
Then it returned again at Hing- 
hnmpton and by the time we 
reached Detroit I was real sick.-'’*

"I had a fever and I was scared 
so I phoned Joe McCarthy in 
Buffalo and Ed Barrow in New 
York and hopped a train right for 
home to find otit what was the 
matter.

"I hope It’s nothing serious, 
but 1 cou’dn’t take any chances.
I never had pains like that be-
fore." ' '--.tr • :

TIGERS BEATEN 
BY YANKS, 6-4

Second Game Is Called 
At End of Seventh 
With Score 7-7

NEW OUTFIELDER 
FOR BROWNS

Sept. 8 (/p)—In the I 
raising pair of gamesj

. , ' American League* ••• •» t W. L. Pet.
fari Ydfir.,... . 96' 40 .706
Philadelphia f... . 84 55 .6ft 4
Washington .... . 80 55 .593
Cleveland ... . 78' 58 .573
Detroit . . . . . 6G 66 .500
St. Louis... . 67 78 \422
Chicago .... . 43 ' 90 .323
Boston . 37 99 .272

National League
W. L. Pet.

Chicago .... 811 56 .588
Pittsburgh .. . .76 62 .647
Brooklyn ... 73 66 .525
Philadelphia ... . 70 67 .511
Boston.. . . . . . ■-69 70 .497
St. Louis... . 64 72 .471
New York . 61 73 .455
Cincinnati .. . 56 82 .406

American Association
W. L. Pet.

Minneapolis .... . 90 60 .600
Columbus ... . 50 68 * .541
Indianapolis ... . 79 71 627
Kansas City ... 76 73 .501
Milwaukee ..... ; 75 71 .61!
Toledo ...;. . . . 75 76. ' .600
Louisville .. . *•.60 • 80 .429
St. Paul. . . . . . 61 88 .409

Grove Outpitched,
A's Lose By 2 to 1

Cleveland. Sept. 8 (/p)—Lefty 
Grove, seeking his 23rd victory 
of the season, was outpointed by 
Clint Brown today and Cleveland 
won the series opener from Phil-
adelphia. 2 to 1.

Grove scored the only run for 
the Athletics, who were held to 
four hits, in the sixth when hik 
single.got away from Averlll and 
he went to third. Bishop’s fly 
brought him home.

Score by Innings:
Philadelphia 0fi0 001 000—1 4 2 
Cleveland — 100 100 OOx—2 8 1

Grove and Cochrane; Brown 
and Sewell.

FIRST GAME 
Box scores:

NE WYORK AB R H
Byrd cf--- 7 2 5
Sowell 3b _r_ 2 0 2
Combs If — 7 ft 1 
Gehrig lb — f> 1 3
Lazzerl 2b _ 4 0 0
Dickey c —._ 7 .2 3
Ch0pnm» rf _ 7 0 2. 
Crosettl ss _ 5 1 2
Plpgras p — 5 0 0

Preag Waiit Ada 
I Accomplish Much.

Co* UMlc,

YESTERDAY'S SCORES 
American League ,

Cleveland 2; Philadelphia 1 
Chicago 4; Boston 3 (10 Innings) 
New York 6-T; Detroit 4-7 (Ist 

game 14 innings; 2nd called at end 
of 7th. darkness)
Washington 3; St. Louis 1

National League
Chicago 4-2: Boston 1-3 
Philadelphia 3: St. Louie 0 
Brooklyn 12; Pittsburgh 2 
Cincinnati-New York, cold

American Asaociation 
Minneapolis 9; Milwaukee 7 
St. Paul 5; Kansas City 3 
Louisville 4; Columbus 3 
Indianapolis 6; Toledo 4

International League 
Albany 2; Newark 1 
Baltimore 15; Jethey City 10 
Montreal 7; TorojUrf 6 
Rochester 8; Buffalo 2

GAMES TODAY 
American League

Washington at St. Louis 
Boston at Chicago 
New York at Detroit

National League
St. Loui* at Pheiadelphia 
Cincinnati at New York 
OUoua at Boston

Lyons Stars In.Win 
Over Boston, i to 3

Chicago, Sept. 7 8 (/p)—Teddy 
'vyons pitched and hatted the 
White Sox to n 4 to 3 victory over 
the Boston Red Sox in' n ten in- 
ilng bailie today. Lyons yielded 
nit six scattered hits over the 
long route, singled in the tenth, 
moved up on Funk’s sacrifice and 
scored on Hayes’ hot grounder 
past AlexunaejMm?wj^^p<'

'file White Sox collected 12 
hits.

Score by innlnga:
Boston _ 000 100 020 0—3 6 1 
Chicago. ooo oio ftoo i—4 12 ?

Rhodes, Kline and Tate; Lyons 
and Grube. ,

l

Phillies Defeat
St. Louis By 3-0

. Philadelphia, Sept. 8. (JF) -The 
Phillies defeated St. Louis 3 to 0 
today, the three runs being scored 
in the first inning when Hurst, 
with. two men on base, pounded 
out his 23rd home run of the sea-
son.

With one out In the opening In-
ning, Bnrtell doubled. Klein sin-
gled and Hurst lifted the hall out 
of tile field. Benge hold the Car-
dinals to three hits, fanned eight 
and issued only one. pass, while 
Carleton allowed the Phils six 
hits. • ,
The »''ore by innings:

St. Louis ooo non ooo—o 3 i 
Philadelphia 300 000 OOx—3 fi 0 

Carleton and J. Wilson; Benge 
and V, Davis.

y -.. ..—?

Ruffing x — 1 0 " ft ft ft
Moore p__  0 0 0 0 0 ft

Totals _ 56 6 18 42 16 1
x—Batted for Plpgras in 14th.

DETROIT AR R H O A E
Davis lb-- 7 Tl 2 16 0
Gehrlnger 2b 7 0 2 1 5 1
Stone cf__  5 0 1 4 0 0
Webb rf —— 5 13 2 1ft
Walker If —- 6 1 ft 5 2 ft
Rogell ss —:\6’ 1 2 1 4ft
Rhiel 3b--  7 1 2 3 5 0
DeSautels c_ 4 0 !• 8 0 0
Hayworth .c— 2,0 1 2 0 0
Hogsett p —a 2^1 0 1 2 0 0

bite z --u- .10 10 0 0
chuble zz — 0 0 0 0 0 0

Uhle p —a— 1 0 0 0 1 0
Ryel m — 1 0 0 0 0 0

Totals ~ 54 4 16 42 19 2
z--Batted for Hogsett in 6th. 
M—Ran for DeSautels In 10th. 
zzz—Ran for'Uhle In 14th. 
Score by innings:

New York 001 102 000 000 02—6
Detroit_ 1 030 000'001 000 00—4
Runs batted in: Rhiel. Davis 

2. Byrd 4, Webb, Dickey, Cros-
ettl.
Two base hit: Gehrlnger.- 
Three base.hit: Gehrig. . ij 
Home runs: Byrd 2, Webb. 
Stolen bases: Walker 2. 
Sacrifices: Plpgras, Uhle, Jau: 

zeri.
Double plays: Crosettl to Laz- 

zeri to Gehrig; Rogell to Geh- 
ringqr to Davis; Gehrlnger to 
Rogell to Davis.

Left on bases: Detroit 18; New 
York 15.

Bases on balls: off Hogsett 3, 
Uhle 1. Pipgras 8.

Struck out: by Hogsett 3, Uhle 
4, Pipgras 7.

Hits: off Hogsett. 10 In 6 in-
nings; Uhle, 8 in 8; Pipgras, 14 
in 13; Moore 2 In 1.

Hit by pitcher: by Plpgras 
(DeSautels); by Hogsett :(Geh- 
rlg L

Passed ball: Hayworth. 
Winning pitcher: Plpgras. 
-Losing pitcher:.(Ihle.
Umpires: Owens, Ormsby and 

McGowan.
Time: 3:27.

SECOND GAME
New York ___ 110 200 3—7 11 1
Detroit....  000 060 1—7 1 1 2

Pennock, Moore and Dickey, 
Jorgens; Wyatt, Marrow, Bridges 
and Hayworth.

A cocoanut.was broken on the 
prow of a ship to christen it in a
Scotch ^shipyard.

Notre Dame Expects 
Another Great Year

Detroit, 
most liair
aeon at Navln field this season 
the New York Yankees took a 
14-lnnlng curtain raiser from the 
Tigers, 6 to 4, today, then the 
teams battled to a 7 to 7 dead-
lock in a slum-bang nightcap 
that was called at tho end .of tho 
seventh because of darkness.
A home run by Earl Webb,

Tiger rlghtflelder. tied up the 
first game at 4 to 4 in the ninth 
inning. Then George Uhle. who 
hud relieved Lion Hogsett in the 
seventh, pitched four scorele**
Innings, while George Pipgras 
also was holding the Tigers with-
out a run..

In the fourteenth, Gehrig sin-
gled, Lazzerl sacrificed and Dick-
ey singled, scoring Gehrig. Dickey 
advanced on a passed ball and 
jeored on Crosetil's single. Wiley 
Moore pitched the fourteenth for 
the Yanks, but Pipgras got credit 
for his fifteenth victory of tho 
icason against eight defeats.
Babe Ruth's Illness brought 

Sam Byrd Into the game and he 
proved a worthy substitute in 
that first game, hitting two 
home runs and three singles to 
drive In, the first four Yankee 
runs.

Tigrr* Stage Itall)
, Except for duration, the sec-
ond game was just as much a 
thriller. The Yankees found 
Whitlow Wyatt no particular puz-
zle and scored one run in the 
first, another in the second two 
more in the fourth.
The Tigers put on a delirious 

rally In the sixth, batting around 
to KCore six runs and drive Herb 
Pennock from the mound. A tri-
ple by Webb accounted for two 
of the runs. Buck Marrow, who 
went in after Wyatt had given 
way to a pinch batter, retired tho
Yanks In order in the sixth, but fnr Wnrlfl
the Yanks went ahead In the LrUlLff I Ul rr (A/tcf
seventh, due to Lazzeri's homer 
with Gehrig on base, and Chap-
man’s triple, after Dickey had sin-
gled. (
The Tigers tied It up In their 

half. White, pinch butting for 
Bridges, who had replaced Mur- 
row, singling across the tying 
run.
Then the game was called, but 

the Yanks had run their string 
of consecutive games this season 
n which they have scored to 138. 
i now major league record.
Counting the lust 55 games of the 
1931 season, they have scored In 
192 consecutive games.

DY PUL MH KELSON 
(Asaoclntcil sports Writer)
South Bend. Ind., Sept. 8 (/TV - 

i Notre Dame lost "only" eight fot- 
jtermen, Including a pair of coie- 
: hrated all American* in the 1932 
graauatinp so all's bright In tho 

• hig football camp of the Kamh- 
I lers this full.
I They're going to be hard to 
j get along with in the football 
, wars again and they enthusias-
tically expect to cap another sea- 

| son's winning streak with two 
I \ictorlous marches to the sen— 
I one to the Atlantic for some re-
venge against the Army and the 
second to I lie Pacific to storm 
the stronghold of Southern Cali-
fornia's Trojans.

"Hunk" Is Dig Cheeee 
Coach Heart Ie> "Hunk" Ander-

son, who has 1!" strong candi-
dates to pick front to plug the 
big gap left in the back field by 
the loss of March Schwartz and 
several holes In the line, will 
have one distinct advantage this 
fall that he didn't possess lust 
year. He will be head coach in 

j every sense of the word. Last

His name is Dehs Ganns and 
he's playing regularly in the out-
field of the St. I.mils Browns. 
Ganna, shown above, is u 26-year- 
old Texan, a former football, 
baseball and track star at How- 
ard-Payne college. He Jumped 
from the college campus to minor 
league baseball In 1028 and has 
played for Abilene, Spartansburg. 
Topeka. Wichita Falls and Long-
view In the southwest. Ganns is 
a brother-in-law of Bryan (Slim) 
Harrlsa, the tall boy who used to 
pitch in the American league and 
is still going strong in the asso-
ciation.

Series Games To 
Be Named Today

'New York. Sept. K Represen-
tatives of the leading clubs in the 
National and American League 
pennant races, meeting with Base-
ball Commissioner Landis here to-
morrow to fix details for the 
world series, are expected t»* se-
lect Wednesday, Septemb«£;' 28, 
for the opening game,
They will not name the spot be-

yond identifying it ns "the Ameri-
can League pennant-winnln|PVlty" 
but the Yankee stadium mean-
while Is being groomed for the 
opening of the serlss.‘
Two games will bo played in 

New York, followed by three In 
Jhe National League’s territory, 
probably October 1-2-3, if Chicago 
comes through, to win, as now ap-
pears likely. Tin sixth nttd sev-
enth games, if necessary, will be 
scheduled in New York, likely on 
October 5-6.

Representatives of clubs still 
having 'mathematical' pennant- 
winning possiblltbs have been in-
vited to the conference but those 
acting for tho Yankees and Cubs 
will be most conspicuous in tak-
ing an Intere,st in the details.

Perkins Plays At 
Chatham On Sunday
Perkins will play at Chnlham 

on Sunday in u return baseball 
game that promises plenty of ex-
citement for the fans. Tho teams 
played on July 4 -with Perkins 
winning 2 to rt. There were only 
five hits In that game, Perkins 
getting three and Chatham two. 
Last week, however, Perkinn 
drilled out 30 lilts against the 
West End.

Rangers To Speed 
Up Grid Sessions 

Starting Tonight
After a week or more of light 

sessions. Coach Kiddy Christen-
sen of the Kscaiaibu Itangeis 
plans to speed up practice work 
stnrtlm: tonight and It is expected 
that the Tull squad will report. 
Many of the athlete* expected to 
perform with the Rangers have 
not yet made their appearance at 
the practice sessions and as a re-
sult the progress was hampend 
considerably, necessitating tho 
postponement of the opening 
game one week.

All members of the 1931 squad 
ate urged to report for the session 
tonight and also other players 
who des re to seek a berth on the 
aggtegation are invited. It is ex-
pected that several former high 
school athletes will li0 seen with 
the Rangers this season.
Among the hoys expected to lie 

on the squad this venr ate Tnrzoti 
Johnson, Warno Johnston. Wil-
son. George Snyder, Humelln, Gi>- 

‘bourle. Hrolherlon, Cull, finr* 
nelle. Peltin. Luchapelle, Gouhiis. 
Werley, Baillargcon and others 
from Esranaha. In addition manV 
Gladstone athletes are expected 
including BJork Sutter, Latimer, 
Murray, Welngaitner, Llndherg 
and Beach.

year. It was an established fact 
that "Hunk" and his first assist-
ant. Jack Chevluny. disagreed op- 
enly on policies. But Chevlfny 
and other field marshalls from 
the Knute Rorknc coaching re-
gime have left and in their places 
have stepped a trio of Coach An- 

iderson s own men from the 1931 
team- Schwartz. Captain Tommy 
Yarr and Nordy Hoffman. Thus, 
with his own men around him 
and one of the best looking fields 
of replacements in years, "Hunk " | 
has won perhaps Ills biggest fight: 
already.
Two lettermen. headed by the 

shifty Mike Hoken, and several 
promising sophomores, are out i 
for SeliWHitzs position at left) 
halfback. Koken is regarded ns | 
somewhat of a cinch for the reg-
ular berth because of his great 
record us a reserve and under-
study. Shorter than Schwartz, lie 
is n rrlcky field runner and a 
brilliant passer and punter.
The rest of the back field, ex-

cept for Carl Cronin and Bernaid 
Leahy, will he virtually the same 
as 1931. George Melinkovich, rc- 
jgntded as one of the best full- 
I backs to carry-on for Notre Dame 
and who broke his Iqg before the 
disastrous finish against the Tro-
jans an 
give
punch along with the hold overs. 
The Carldeos will be back in tho 
fight, too. Angelo Carldeo. a 
cousin of the noted all American 
quarterback, ts out after (lie same 
Job: n brother. Fred. Is gumming 
for the fullback post.

Replacement of Yarr at center 
promises to keep "Hunk" awake 
nights with his fretful study of 
the "dead hall" rule, one that lie 
thinks may cramp Notre Dame'.! 
hustle. So fnr. It looks like Toni 
"Kitty" German, a rangy fast re 
servlst from Chicago, will fit it.

Notre Dame's 19l>2 schedule:
Oct. 8--Haskell at Notre Dame.
Oct. 15—Drake at Notre Dame.
Oct. 22--Carnegie Tech at No-

tre Dame.
Oct. 29 -Notre Dame at Pitts-

burgh.
Nov. 5--Notre Dame at 

sns.
Nov. 12—Northwestern at 

Notre Dame.

VINES, COCHET 
IN SEMI-FINALS

Allison and Sutter Also 
Remain m Threats in 
National Net Meet

Chicago, Sept. 8 (/p)—Increases 
in freight loadings for the week 
ended Sept. 3 were reported by 
many railroads, including the II- 
'inoia Central. Pennsylvania, New 
York Central, Mlasotirl-Kansns- 
Texns, Wabash, and St.. Louls- 
Sau Francisco.

Weaver Marks Up 
His 20th Victory

St. Louis. Sept. 8 (/p)—Monte 
Weaver, pitching |ils flint year In 
the majors, recorded hia twenti-
eth victory of the season today In 
Washington's 3 to 1 triumph over 
the 8t. i^ouia Browns. Weaver 
allowed four safeties ami the 
Browns’ only run was unearned.

Carl Reynolds, 'Senator out-
fielder, had a perfect batting 
record, with a triple, a double 
and two singles.

Walter Stewart pitched eight 
innings for the Browns. Sam 
Gray relieving him.

Score by innings:
Washington . 000 102 l»00—3 8 1 
St. l^uis 010 000 000—1 4 1

Weaver and Spencer; Stewart, 
Gray and Ferrell.

i HOMti RUNS

Foxx. Athletics ..... . .  51
Ruth. Yankees . . . . . . . . . . .  it)
Klein, Phillies   35
Simmons. Athletics . . . . . . .  32
Ott. Giants /P.. .. . . . . . . . . .  32
Gehrig. Yankees [. . . . . . . . .  31
Averill, Indians .1. . . . . . . . .  31

Several recent surveys by city 
engineers show that in metropoli-
tan areas from 15 to 1800 tons 
of dust fall on each square mile 
of territory every year.

Now read the Clwwlfled page.

HARD TO CONVINCE
9 Be as skeptical as you like 
— but try the Gillette 

BLADE. Give yourself a chance 
to discover far greater shaving 

comfort. Do so on our guarantee 

of satisfaction. Buy a package 

of Gillette Blue Blades today.

BY GAYLE TALBOT
( \k*o< lated Pres* Spoil.* Writer)

Forest Hills, N. Y., Hept. 8 DT) 
- Ellsworth Vines, Jr.. Henri 
Cochet, Wiltner Allison and Clif-
ford Sutter—three of tho world's 
ranking players and a collegian— 
today battered thslr windy way 
Into the semi-linalsiof the nation- 
a! tenuis championship*.

Vines, twenty-ycnr-old defend-
ing champion from Pasadena, 
turned bark the challenge of Les-
ter Stiffen, towering Los Angeles 
siar. 6-3. 7-5. 6-4. in a match that 
saw the ihamplon play daring, al-
most reckless tennis, winning oi 
losing points on a stroke and re-
fusing to engage in tiring rallies.
Cochet. Frame's tennis muster,, 

rode out a wind that at times 
reached gal - proportions to whip 
big Frank Shield* of New York, 
1-6. 6-3, 6-4. 6-0.

Allison, of Austin. Texas, am! 
near hero of the recent Davis Cup 
festivities at Paris, came from be-
hind with a steady brand of ten-

uun iiiiipii tiKumni ■ i a/- '
nd the Army, is expected to! J"'0 ‘I sh1°l' ".e tomeback ot 
the back field an added, °f Nw York'

Sutter, national Intor-collegialr 
champion from Tnlatie university. 
New Orleans, crushed the veteran 
George Lott. Jr., of Fhlrago. 10-JL 
6 0. 6-0. in a dazzling exhibition.
The lineup for tomorrows 

round sends Vln-'s agiGnst RuMhr, 
while Allison will take another 
crack nl Hie elusive Cochet. who 
•irked him lit their Davis Cup en-
counter.

Leading Batmen 
In Big Leagues

| O'Doul. Dodgers 
Foix. Athletics..'. 

Kan- Alrx’der, Red Sox 
| Ruth. Yankee* .. 
V. Davis. Phillies 
Klelp. Phillies...

AD R H Pet. 
5in ii: 2« n .371* 
520 137 190 .365 
321 15115.358 
413 117 151 ,34ft 
353 41 12.3 .318 
563 112 202 .317

vs. Ar-

Nov. 19 —Noire Dame vs. Navy 
(at Cleveland).
^ Nov. 26 - Notre Dame 
my (at New York).

Dec. ID-Notre Dame at South 
ern California.

A special highway, exclusively 
for motor trucks, is planned In 
Italy to connect the great port 
of Genoa with the Inland cltliv, 
Milan and Turin.

UTTING beautiful Art 
linings in Gordon hats 
is like gilding the lily— 

but it is being done. It is 
the finishing-touch to a 
perfect product. ,

Style.. service.. a sane price

m ^crrdoTL-> *509
^HE i»»! SENSATION IN

HATS

THE FAIR STORE

My Family
has discovered 

•'that WORT is 
not only deli-
ciously refresh-
ing and exhilar-
ating but heal-
thy as well— 
D rin k W brt 
regularly and 
you'll feel like a 
new person.

6 Gal.
, Makes 8 to 10 gal. beverage

oOc Extra for container, refunded when returned 
New Tax Included.

WEBCO PRODUCTS
1605 LUDINGTON ST.
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OPEN BIDS FOR 
NEW HOSPITAL

H. G. Christman, Lansing 
Contractor, Lowest 
On General

Newberry, Sept. 8. (Special)— 
-H. G. Christman and Company of 
Lansing were low bidders for the 
general contract for construction 
of the new RecelTlng unit for the 
Newberry state hospital, It was 
revealed today when the sealed 
h'ds were opened here. The 
Christman estimate was $M8,* 
04 8. Spence Brothers of Saginaw 
had second lowest bid with $184,- 
670, and R. J. McLeod of Dul-
uth had third lowest with |168,- 
472. •
The bids were opened and read 

hy George R. Thompson, state 
budget director; Wm. J. Rutley, 
state superintendent of building 
construction; and D. 0. Mil- 
bourne. state efficiency engineers. 
Morp than 300 persona were pre-
sent when the bids were opened.;
The low two bidders for sewer 

and drainage were John R. Kdel- 
raan and Bloom and Son. Bidders 
on the electrical contract were 
Hayes Electric company of Lan-
sing, Paul Electric company. The 
bidders for the kitchen equip-
ment were Blickman of /. Detroit 
and Cleveland Range company. 
The Otis Elevator company of 
Houghton were low bidders on the 
elevator contract. Louis J. Bcherf 
of Detroit was low bidder on 
elevators, heating and ventilation 
and Edward Bcott of Saginaw 
was low bidder on plumbing.

Prisoner In County 
Jail Gets “Break’

Seattle, Sept. 8 </P)—On this of 
all mornings, when he was due to 
be discharged from the county 
jail, Bob Patterson overslept.

So he didn't hear when Jailer 
J. E. Solberg approached the tank 
door and shouted "Bob Patterson, 
going out" at 7:20 a. m.

However, Vernon Hemme, 22, 
a fellow prisoner with 2 weeks 
to serve, did hear, answered the 
call and walked out.

COL. R. ROBINS 
DID NOT KEEP 
HOOVER DATE

(Continued from Page One)

soclated Press In Washington late 
today from the home of her sis-
ter, Miss Mary Dreler, at South- 

, west Harbor, Maine.
JOD.— Expressing alarm and dlsclos- 
X ^tlhg that her husband had re-

ceived threatening telephone calls 
on August 6 and 7, Mrs. Robins 
said she had been unable to find 
any trace of him since he was 
last seen Saturday afternoon at 
the City Club In New York. ‘
The anonymous persons who 

threatened Colonel Robins, she 
said, predicted serious conse-
quences If he did not cease his 
prohibition efforts.

Mrs. Robins said she feared 
Florida bootleggers, working with 
bootleggers in New York, had 
done away with her husband.

Colonel Robins. although 
spending much of hla time In 
New York and Chicago and on 
lecture tours, had a residence 
near Brooksvllle, Florida.
He had been known widely as 

an advocate of world peace as 
well as prohibition and has made 
several world tours. Politically, 
he has been active In the old 
Bull Moose and Republican par-
ties. / »«■
' White House officials would 
not say whether the justice de-
partment had*b?en asked to In-
vestigate, but It was Indicated the 
department would act if it had 
not already done so.

Was In Gold Rash

Clues were few., Mrs. Robins 
said the last person known to 
have seen her husband was Alex 
Gumberg, a New York friend of 
his who was with him at the City 
Club Saturday afternoon.

Robins had been active against 
liquor violators In Orlando coun-
ty, Florida.

Colonel Robins was In the 
Klondyke gold rush in Alaska In 
1898 and acquired a modest for-
tune there which made it possible 
for him to devote himself to re-
ligious and social betterment 
work.

His wife, who was Miss Mar-
garet Dreler, Is also a social eco-
nomist who has devoted much of 
her life to the betterment of con-
ditions among 'working women

Save While 
You Can

m

—and you'll have when 

chance adversity puts a stop 

to earning—Save for a home 
—a vacation—a. car—chil-
dren’s education or for some 
other goal that will give you 
the greatest pleasure and 

^|l; satisfaction.

It’s easy once 
you’ve started

The Escanaba 
National Bank

•W'

BY saving while on the up- 
grade in your youth you may 
not be obliged to stint your-
self when on the downgrade 
in age.

First National Bank
Escanaba, Michigan

'OlduttLarimt and Btrani—t Bank in DtUa County

and children.
As head of the American Red 

Cross mission to Russia in 1917 
and'-lfilS, Robins became the 
friend of Lenin and Trotsky- and 
tried to coordinate the efforts of 
the bolshevlst government with 
those of the allied forces. Upon 
his return to the United States 
he became an advocate of tne 
recognition of bolshevlst Russia 
and later revisited Moscow to 
study conditions there.

Gumberg, a banker, Is an old 
friend of Colonel Roblnf. He was 
secretary to Robins In Russia 
and accompanied him back to this 
country.

Murphy Greeted By 
Crowd At Eagles 
Hall Last Evening

Joseph P. Murphy of Petoskey, 
candidate for congress, spoke last 
evening at the Eagles hall before 
a large crowd of people, discuss-
ing general problems and giving 
bis political views.
Murphy explained that he fa-

vors repeal of the eighteenth 
amendment and also favors Im-
mediate payment of the soldiers 
bonus. . ^

tyte FAIR STORE

FOOD VALUES
FOR FRIDAY AND SATURDAY

Phone Meat Department 26 
Phone Grocery Department, 27‘ and 28

10 lb. white cotton bag C & I'Qa 
'H Cane Fine Granulated ...TUUSUGAR

PEDTn Highly Concentrated Fruit AC a 
ULn I U"Pectin, per bottle. . . . . . . Z Ju

|||| U Pure Evaporated Milk, White Cp
1tI1LIV" Birch or Puritan, tall can.... Ju
DIITTCD Fresh Churned Delta 011/9p 
DUl lEn" Made Creamery, lb. L\ /^b

PASTRY SPECIAL
Apple ami Cherry Pileta, 6 for _—-—--—-——— 16c
Federal Twin Bread, 2 for- - - - - ------ - - - - - - - -— 8c
Butter Milk Bread, large loaf .—-- - - - - - - - - - - - -— 10c

SALE OF COOKIES

Short Bread Cookies, lb. 12c
Ginger Snaps, lb.- - - - 10c
Fig Bar Cookies, lb._ 10c
Cocoanut Chips, lb. ____ 12c
Nonpareil Cookies, lb. — 12c

FLOUR •
Golden Harvest Family Flour
24 H lb. bag____ _ _ _ _ Me
49 lb. bag_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ H.05
98 lb. bag —----- $2.03

PIT0IID Cloverland Pure Toma- i AIZa 
lift I OUr"to Catsup, Irg. 14 oz. btl,l L /Z\l

Fresh Fruits and Vegetables

PD A DC 0 Michigan Blue Grapes, han- 1 Pa 
unAlLu died basket for. . . . . . . I Du

BANANAS-?,
Iplean Dry Yellow Onions, 2'/*c

per
Iceberg Head Lettuce, solid
heads-- —-—- - - - - - - 9c

Crisp Michigan Celery,
per bunch-------   5c

Red Tokay Grapes, lb. _ 10c 
Fresh Home Grown Tomatoes
8 lbs. for- - - - - - - - - 10c

Fresh Home Grown Tomatoes 
18 lb. basket______ 89c

Large Honey Dew Melons,
each-- -—-- - - - - - - 10c

Sunk 1st Navel Oranges,
288 size, dosen —— 25c 

Italian Blue Plums,
18 lb. box________ 98c

PEACHES—Michigan Fancy 
Larae Elberta, £Q
Peaches, bus. bskt «pX»Ut/

MACARONI—2 lb. box Elbo 
Macaroni or Spa- I
ghettl for------ XOC

PINEAPPLE—'Premier Brand 
Hawaiian Dole 811c- 1 
ed, No. 2% can Xt/C 

GRAPE FRUIT — Premier 
Brand Tree Ripen- -J £* 
ed, No. 2 can- - - - XOL

PEACffES — Bremiqr Brand 
Fancy Table Peaches, No.
2* IQp
sliced or halves ___ ■•.UX/

MARGARINE — Gem N u t 
Fresh Churned Mar-
garine, lb.- - - lie

MEAT DEPARTMENT 1
MJinVCMO Wiltsie’s Fresh Killed i 7a 
UllluftUlUHens or Broilers, lb. ... 11 u

m
 Fresh Picnic Hams, lb. . . . . j...
" Shoulder Roast, lb. . . . . . . . . . 8c

Boston Pork Butts, lb. .. . . . . . . . . . . . 10c
Fresh Meaty Spare Ribs, lb. . . . . . . . . . 6c
Fresh Meaty Pork Hocks, lb. . . . . . . . .     6c

OUftlOC DCCC Beef Rib Stew, lb. .... 7c 
lltlUIOt DlLI Pot Roast of Beef, lb.. 9c
Beef Chuck Roast, lb.. . . . . . . . . . . — 11c
Rolled Roast of Beef, lb. . . . . . . . . . . . 23c

MILK lir 11 Shoulder Roast, lb. ... ^. 9c
FED vLAl/'Pocket Roast, lb. .......7c
Veal Rib Chops, lb. .. . . . . . . . . . .   12!/2c

111110 No. 1 Lean Sugar Cured Hams 1 Q a 
llftmu whole or half, lb.---- --- I Oil

| ^Special Sliced Bacon, 0 a
m.y2 lb. cello wrapped ........ Oil

SwifPs Picnic Hams, 11a
"shankless, lb. . . . . . . . . . . ITU

tlAIIQ Lean Sugar Cured Picnic 11a 
nHIvIv Hams, 4 to 8 lb. avr., lb. .... I I u

I No. 1 Sugar Cured Bacon, 11a 
" whole or half slab, lb.... ITU

FRANIFURTERS-aSi,. 9c 
BOLDGNA-Sgr"”1"1.. 9c

SLICED LUNCH MEATS
Jellied Chicken Loaf, nice served with salad, lb.- - - - - 29c
Pressed Ham, very taaty, lb.- - - - - - - - - - - 25c
Premium Minced Ham, lb.---------- 28c
Goose Liver Sausage, lb.- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 85c
Ihuringer Sausage, lb.- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - — 19c
Smoked Liver Sausage, lb.- - - - - - - - - - - - - - -   19c
Large Bologna, ih._ _ _ _ _ _ _ :- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -  15c
Baked Idcnic Hams, with brown sugar and cloves, lb. - 19c
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Distinguished Names
Appear upon the labels of the coats In The Fair 
Store. Names that you recognize as representing 
pillars of quality ... names that you can 'trust. 
Rothmoor . . Printzess . . Sterling . . for years and 
years you've seen them and respected them as the 

• leaders In their fields . . In style, materials, and

Guaranteed Furs
Furs make the coat ... In more ways than 
one. The unique collar and cuff treatment on 
coats for this season require beauUful large, 
fluffy furs. That means that \ to be truly 
beautiful they must be of superior selected quality. 
Every fur set in The Fair Store is guaranteed for 
honest representation and for satisfactory wear. Fox 
Is the big fur of the* season . . In silver (where the 
price permits) and Cross, Blue, Red, and SiUca. 
Other furs are Lnyx, Badger, Raccoon, Skunk, and 
Wplf .. In the fluffy class.. Of course the short 
haired furs are still ahd always will be good. Among 
them are Beaver, Sable, Mink, Kolinsky, Squirrel, 
and Fitch.

eres tweir story—
SVew Style '

(^pats are decidedly different this season. They ex*
• pel a new note of luxnriousness .. higher waistlines, 

long sweeping lines, new neck lines, new fur ties . . 
all lend a gradousness that will add to any woman's 
charm. . , /

The New Silhouette
The high placing of large, luxurious fur collars la 
the most striking note for Fall 1982. These roll 
away from the face and frame the shoulder* in 
softly rounded outline, ending well abovq the 
waist.

Simplicity In Line Am

Priced for 1932
V i'- V.
'That means simply this . that not within the 
memory of our organization (43 years) have prices 
ever been so low for coats of the quality and extra-
ordinary beauty that we are offering today at

.50 to

Shoulders are broad but not bulky. The bodice Is 
closely moulded. Hips are narrow. Skirts assume a 
straight tubular silhouette, straight from hip to 
hem. Yoke treatments, drop shoulders, and some 
seaming constitute most of the detail. The unbelted 
lino is the smartest but the Mainbocher belt, 
crossed at the back is the exception. Sport coats 
have novelty belts sometimes.

Collars And &:■
The high closed Lyolene neckline Is the favorite 
because of Its adjustable features. It can be worn 
as a three way shawl convertible Into a Lei , . • 
crossed at the front . . or dropped to fora a cape. 
Capes both attached and detachable (shown above) 
are in high favor. Small flat fur collars which grow 
Into yokes, plastoons, or bibs are used on drees 
and sport coats, Adjustable scarf effects are used 

. on sport coats alone.

Sleeves are distinquished by the depths of the arm-
hole, tightness of the wrist, and the fullness of the 
elbow. We get this effect from Klmona cutting, 
seams, tucks, pleats, and over sleeves. Fur cuffs are 
less important than formerly but when used are 
widened at the

.W ■

POPULAR!!
Amazingly So . . . 
i; Are these 3 pitee.'||p

ItlillBII
ef

For Street, Campus,

and Travel Wear
' Av, ^ - 'gjimjUMjM

We’ve been kept on the 
jump reordering them bp- 
cause everybody that 
sees them wants one.' 
They’re made of tweed In 
new patterns and colors 
in coat, skirt, and hat to 
match with a sweater . . 
Just as is shown here. 
And they are inex-
pensive.

With others at $18.50

JUST IN!! ^W*
d DozensDozens and Dozens

of New

Fall Silk 
Frocks

At A Price Destined 

For Popularity
; ..You’re going to be sur-

prised when you see the 
smart flttle dresses we’ve 
secured to sell at this 
modest little price. The 
deep wine tones, navies, 
blues, browns, and Mack 
are represented in some 
simply stunning new 
Ideas. Sizes from 12 up.

u •.
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